
































APPENDIX ‘A’ 



District of Ontario
Division No. 07 - Hamilton
Court No. 32-2211776
Estate No. 32-2211776

In the Matter of the Notice of Intention to make a
proposal of:

PV Labs Inc.
Insolvent Person

BDO CANADA LIMITED / BDO CANADA LIMITÉE
Licensed Insolvency Trustee

Date of the Notice of Intention: January 27, 2017

CERTIFICATE OF FILING OF A NOTICE OF INTENTION TO MAKE A PROPOSAL
Subsection 50.4 (1)

I, the undersigned, Official Receiver in and for this bankruptcy district, do hereby certify that the aforenamed
insolvent person filed a Notice of Intention to Make a Proposal under subsection 50.4 (1) of the Bankruptcy and
Insolvency Act.

Pursuant to subsection 69(1) of the Act, all proceedings against the aforenamed insolvent person are stayed as of
the date of filing of the Notice of Intention.

Date: January 27, 2017, 15:23
E-File/Dépôt Electronique Official Receiver

Federal Building - Hamilton, 55 Bay Street N, 9th Floor, Hamilton, Ontario, Canada, L8R3P7, (877)376-9902
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Exhibit 'A'

Date Professional Hours Comments 

6-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.00      Various communications Benchetrit, Sachdeva re conflict check etc.; 

engagement letter;

6-Jan-17 Iannilli, Franca 1.50      Draft  Letter for Vince-Review-update changes-Scan-

9-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 0.25      With Vince and Eugene, new engagement.

9-Jan-17 Iannilli, Franca 1.00      Respond to Vince's emails-update changes and prepare (3) Cover 

letters- 

PPSA Search-corporation/other 

Print and scan to the directory

9-Jan-17 Migus, Eugene 0.85      Conference call with management, Chaitons LLP, Pallett Valo LLP; 

email to company regarding engagement letter, list of requested 

documents and information.

9-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 0.50      conference call with Benchetrit; Sachdeva

10-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 0.50      update call to discuss cash flows and planning filing

10-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter -        Travel to and from PV Labs.

10-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 4.50      Review initial information received from Company, forecast, 

supporting docs, etc.  Travel to PV Labs, meet with Ted U., Mark C. 

and Nancy K.  Review initial draft forecasts and support.  Discuss 

process and operating as going concern.  Discuss estimated capital 

injection needed during proposal proceeding.  Discuss open and 

projected contracts.  Provide list of required information.      

11-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 2.00      Continued work on draft projections, vetting forecasts, etc.  Update 

and additional information from PV Labs.

12-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter -        Travel to and from PV Labs.

12-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 3.50      Travel to PV Labs, meet with Mark, Ted and Nancy.  go through 

draft forecasts, seek additional information on anticipated contracts 

and negotiations with Fibertek and John Hopkins University.  Vetting 

of projected receipts and disbursements.    Conference call with 

BDO, PV Labs, Chaitons and Pallett Valo, status update and moving 

forward.  Receipt and vetting of additional information.

12-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 0.50      update call with management and professional re cash flow etc.

13-Jan-17 Dula, Lourdes 0.60      opened new bank acct, processed dep

13-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.00      various communication re cash flow, operations etc.; conference 

call to discuss cash flow and timing for filing NOI.

13-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 2.00      Continued cash flow work.  Receive and review updated information 

from management.  Ongoing discussions with management.  

Financial statements, contracts, etc.

15-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter -        Travel to and from PV Labs.

15-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 3.50      Attend PV Labs, meet with Mark, Ted, Nancy, Devlan and John.  

Review, analyze and go through open contracts, potential contracts 

and marketing.  Obtain supporting documentation re: cash flow 

receipts and disbursements (i.e. material costs).  Answer queries.  

16-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 2.50      Ongoing communication and work with management re: cash flows, 

estimating necessary interim financing, open contracts and 

proposed contracts.  Continue draft cash flows, assumptions and 

reports.  

16-Jan-17 Migus, Eugene 0.50      Discussion and update from Peter Naumis; review updated cash flow 

projection with Peter Naumis and discuss DIP loan financing, 

repayment of SRED loan, inquiries on further reducing payroll costs.

16-Jan-17 Leung, Kevin 3.20      Set up NOI/Proposal estate in Ascend; input creditor details; review 

PPSA and update additional secured creditors; input Director 

information.



17-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 2.00      Participate on conference call, status update, dealing with secured 

creditors, timing of filing, etc.  Discussions with Nancy re: bank 

statements, RBC line, etc.  Request copies for review and 

reconciliation with draft cash flows.  Receive and review security 

documents for SRED lender.  Circulate draft cash flows for 

discussion.

17-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.60      update cash - cash flow, dealing with RBC and other matters, review 

of PPSA's and security doc's' directors charge admin charge

17-Jan-17 Migus, Eugene 0.15      Follow-up discussion.

18-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 1.75      Review draft affidavit of Mark Chamberlain.  Review DIP Term 

Sheet.  Ongoing communications with management.

18-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 0.50      review updated cash flow.

19-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 4.50      Receive and review forecasted bank margins for period covering stay 

of proceedings.  Continue working on draft First Report of Proposal 

Trustee.  Review necessary D&O Charge and quantum.  Receive and 

review draft Order for Company's applications (re: sale process, 

Admin Charge, DIP Charge and D&O Charge).  Review anticipated 

cash flow of post filing contracts.  Ongoing discussions with 

management.  Update cash flows.

19-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince -        review draft court order; update cash flows; discussion re RBC

20-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 4.00      Receipt and review of updated forecasts.  Receipt and review of 

updated customer deposit summary.  Update on receipt of Fibertek 

contract for post filing work.  Updated Aged A/R listing and review.  

Receipt and review of inventory report.  Continued work on draft 

First Report.

20-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.25      review update cash flow; update conference call to discuss various 

matters - sales, cash flows, RBC; DIP loans terms

20-Jan-17 Iannilli, Franca 0.60      Prepare New File Folders 

23-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 3.00      Revisions and update to draft report. Continued discussions with 

management re: forecasts, secured creditors, DIP, etc.  Receive and 

review DIP Term Sheet.  Discussions with counsel.

23-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 0.75      Final Term Sheet - cash flow.

24-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 1.50      Continued updates and discussions with management.  Receipt and 

review of daily cash updates.  Finalize draft form of report and 

circulate for review and comments.  Review draft cash flows with 

daily cash receipt reconciliations.

24-Jan-17 Migus, Eugene 0.50      Review and edit draft report to court.

24-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.50      conference call to discuss various matter re filing NOI, review draft 

report.

25-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 2.50      Correspondence with Debtor's counsel re: draft Trustee's report, 

comments, etc.  Discussions with management re: draft cash flows, 

assumptions, etc.  Reconcile opening bank line with position 

reported by company and daily updates provided.  Further tailoring 

and amendments to Trustee's first report.

25-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 2.25      dealing with taking out the RBC; board resolution to file NOI; review 

draft report to court; conference call to discuss these matters.

26-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 2.20      conference call with professional team and management. Various 

communication re court application, court order , dealing with RBC, 

DIP loan and term sheet, BDC, cash requirements. Review changes 

to trustees report to court tcw Royal Bank of Canada; conference 

call with Leanne Williams DIP Lenders lawyer. Further 

communication re RBC change in position.



26-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 3.00      Final draft cash flows to debtor for review and comment.  Work with 

management to draft assumptions to cash flows.  Amend/update 

draft NOI documents for anticipated sign up.  Review creditor listing 

with management.  Answer queries.  Receive and review daily cash 

update.  Review updated customer deposit list.  Review amended 

affidavit of Mark Chamberlain.

26-Jan-17 Leung, Kevin 1.50      Forward creditor list to P. Naumis for review; discussion with P. 

Naumis re PPSA registrants; update creditor listing and amounts; 

review updated A/P listing from company; vet against creditor 

listing for material changes; revisions and inclusions to creditor 

listing, including updated amounts.

27-Jan-17 Leung, Kevin 0.70      Update creditors registry per updated A/P listing; update NOI sign 

up documents; update cash flow information in Ascend to verify 

contents for e-filing.

27-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.50      conference call with professional team and management. Various 

communication re court application, court order , dealing with RBC 

payout , DIP loan and term sheet & cash requirements; prepare 

email fro RBC; filing NOI.

27-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 3.25      Amend, update and finalize Notice of Intention sign up documents.  

Circulate.  File NOI.  Call to OSB to expedite receipt of certificate.  

Discussions with counsel(s) and management.  Finalize Trustee's 

First Report with updated information.

27-Jan-17 Iannilli, Franca 1.00      Scan the signed docs to the directory-Update and prepare to E-file 

docs-Stop-missing information-Update and e-file docs-Print Pending 

review-Respond to Peter's email and follow up phone call to the OSB-

left message-Scan the Certificate to the directory

28-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 1.00      Teleconference with management, Chaitons LLP and BDO. 

30-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.75      conference call with professional team and management. Various 

communication re court application, court order , dealing with RBC, 

DIP loan and term sheet, BDC, cash requirements; finalize trustees 

report; directors charge; notice to creditors; communication with 

RBC.

30-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 3.00      Receive and review motion material and draft order.  Draft SISP 

outline and appendix for first report.  Begin drafting marketing 

materials - outline, newspaper ad, etc.

30-Jan-17 Migus, Eugene 0.15      Discussion with Peter Naumis regarding marketing and sale process, 

court application; review and edit draft trustee's report.

31-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 0.50      Transf. from Siciliano, Vince 12/05/16 working on Pros16-SicM34 

(2016-Prospective-34) - PV Labs- review financial information

31-Jan-17 Migus, Eugene 0.20      Transf. from Migus, Eugene 11/30/16 working on Pros16-SicM34 

(2016-Prospective-34) - PV LABS INC. - conflict check; related 

communication with Chaitons LLP.

31-Jan-17 Migus, Eugene 2.50      Transf. from Migus, Eugene 12/05/16 working on Pros16-SicM34 

(2016-Prospective-34) - PV LABS INC. - background information from 

Chaitons LLP (George Benchetrit); review financial projection 

prepared by the company; meeting with management and George 

Benchetrit.

31-Jan-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.60      conference call with professional team and management. Various 

communication re court application, court order , dealing with RBC, 

DIP loan and term sheet, BDC, cash requirements; review court 

order; communication with ken Kallish lawyer for RBC; 

communication with Steve Graff lawyer for BDC re admin fee, 

priority on DIP and employees.

31-Jan-17 Naumis, Peter 3.25      Reconciling daily cash updates with forecasted cash flows.  Begin 

drafting marketing materials, newspaper ad, teaser, interested part 

shortlist, etc.  Attend and participate on conference call.

31-Jan-17 Iannilli, Franca 1.50      Finalize the Notices-Printing Labels-prepare for mailings



1-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 2.75      Review factum and material of Chaitons ahead of Feb 2 motion.  

Comments.  Review WIP and accounting to date.  Update to 

website, PV teaser.  Discussions with Corporate Finance group, re: 

CIM, target list, sales process, etc.   Correspondence with Pallett 

Valo re: RBC security, validity and enforceability thereof.  Review 

for RBC security documents.  Forward to Pallett Valo.

1-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 2.00      Conduct contact search for CIM distribution.

1-Feb-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.25      conference call with Aird and Berlis sol for BDC; various 

correspondence with RBC and BDC and DIP lenders lawyers ; review 

revised court order.

1-Feb-17 Leung, Jessica 1.50      Making 88 copies of the NOI, packing them into envelopes and 

stamping the postage to be sent via Canada Post

1-Feb-17 Iannilli, Franca 2.00      Mailings-Labels-Prepare affidavit of mailing

2-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 4.50      Attend court for Company's application for Sale Process Order, 

extension of time to file proposal, etc.  Continue tailoring Teaser 

document.  Discussions with Corporate Finance re: target list of 

people, CIM, teaser, etc.  Conference call with Chaitons and PV Labs 

re: going forward.  Circulate draft form of Confidentiality 

Agreement for comments.

2-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 3.00      Continue conducting contact search for CIM distribution; review 

additional contacts provided by secured; populate list in Excel and 

request for contact information to be provided; correspondence 

with N. Kunysz re monitoring.

3-Feb-17 Finamore, Patrick 3.00      Buyers list

3-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 3.50      Correspondence and discussions with corporate finance re: target 

list, revisions to teaser, suggested format and information for CIM.  

Call to and from management re: list of candidates, comments on 

teaser and newspaper advertisement.   Finalize teaser.  Review for 

contact emails for certain target list parties.  Distribute teaser to 

identified parties.

3-Feb-17 Migus, Eugene 0.15      Review updated draft teaser document.

3-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 2.00      Prepare website layout and contents; forward to IT to finalize and 

set up website.

3-Feb-17 Zahir, Farooq 7.50      Assist with the teaser and compiling buyers' list

4-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter -        Parking court February 2, 2017

4-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter -        Travel to and from court. - February 2, 2017

6-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin -        To and from premise for monitoring.

6-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 4.00      Finalize newspaper ad, discussions with Globe & Mail re: price, etc. 

Finalize teaser.  Circulate teaser to identified parties.  Discussions 

with corporate finance group, Identify additional parties, CIM, etc.  

Continue drafting Confidential Information Memorandum.  

Discussions with counsel and management re: going forward, etc.

6-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 4.20      Review undeliverable emails to potential interested parties; search 

for alternative emails and contacts; search for additional contact 

information for list provided by Secured; review monitoring 

worksheets provided by N. Kunysz; attend premises to meet with PV 

Lab's management for monitoring, obtain contacts of interested 

parties, and collect retainer cheque.

7-Feb-17 Siciliano, Vince 2.70      various discussions re CIM and Teaser 



7-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 3.50      Receipt and review of marked up Confidentiality Agreement ("CA") 

from Wescam.  Discuss with PV Labs and counsel.  Communicate 

amended CA with comments to Wescam for review and execution.  

Creditor enquiries re: NOI, status, etc.  Calls and correspondence 

from interested parties, information and CA requests.  Review 

marked up CA received from LOGOS Technologies.  Discussions with 

LOGOS, workout concerns.    Correspondence and 

instructions/update from Globe & Mail re: insertion date in National 

Edition and pricing. Finalize draft Confidential Information 

Memorandum and circulate from comments. 

7-Feb-17 Dula, Lourdes 0.20      processed dep

7-Feb-17 Finamore, Patrick 3.00      CIM

8-Feb-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.00      review SIM and teaser

8-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 3.00      Identification of additional target parties and circulation of "teaser".  

Correspondence with management re: newly identified candidates, 

further financial information, inventory assessments, etc.  

Discussions with corporate finance group re: process, CIM, target 

lists, etc.  Revisions and update to CIM. 

8-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 3.00      Look up contact information for additional potential buyers from 

secured creditor and from PV Labs; update website; review bank 

statement and prepare comparison to NOI forecast.

8-Feb-17 Zahir, Farooq 1.00      CIM edits

8-Feb-17 Nusrath, Sayyida 2.00      Review and comments on CIM

9-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 1.00      Complete monitoring activities and comparisons; update P. Naumis 

re RBC payout.

9-Feb-17 Finamore, Patrick 3.00      CIM preparation

10-Feb-17 Siciliano, Vince 2.00      prepare for and attend meeting with Mark and Ted to discussing.

10-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 2.25      Correspondence with interested parties and receipt of executed 

confidentiality agreements.  Circulate confidentiality agreement to 

requesting parties. Correspondence with various BDO partners 

enquiring about teaser sent.  Receipt of CIM and comments from 

BDO corporate finance group.  Review information from 

management and comment. 

11-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter -        Hwy 407 Charges for Jan 10, 12 and 15

13-Feb-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.25      finalize Came; various communication re final CIM package, 

inventory value , etc.

13-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 2.75      Comments from Mark C. re: draft CIM circulated.  Receive, review 

and discussions with management and counsel re: Lockheed license 

agreement and status thereof.  Further work and updates on CIM 

with BDO corporate finance group.  Correspondence with interested 

parties and responses from Globe and Mail newspaper 

advertisement.

13-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 0.30      Discussion with P. Naumis re CIM; follow up with PV Labs re 

equipment listing and tangible assets reported in CIM; email from N. 

Kunysz re monitoring.

13-Feb-17 Finamore, Patrick 2.00      CIM edits

14-Feb-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.20      various discussion and communication with Benchetrit, Sachdeva; 

Naumis re LMCO Final License Agreement 

14-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 2.25      Further review of Lockheed Martin license agreement.  Continued 

revisions and updates to CIM.  Finalize CIM.  Disseminate to those 

parties executing and submitting CA. Correspondence with Lockheed 

Martin.  Correspondence with interested parties, answer queries. 

14-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 1.50      Update CIM; discussion with C. Porter re LOI; revise LOI to update 

requirements for LOI; send teasers; finalize CIM with finance team; 

review confidentiality agreements; send CIM to parties with signed 

CA's; correspondence from N. Kunysz re fixed assets.



14-Feb-17 Zahir, Farooq 4.50      Review CIM and make final edits before distribution 

15-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 2.00      Discussions with various interested parties re: process.  Discussions 

with management and counsel to PV Labs.  Discussions with counsel 

for L-3 and LMC re: Confidentiality Agreement, etc.  Receipt of 

executed CA's.  Circulate CIM.

15-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 0.10      Forward Confidentiality Agreement to interested parties.

16-Feb-17 Siciliano, Vince 0.80      dealing with confidentiality agreement, data room requirements 

and perspective purchasers

16-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 3.00      Numerous discussions with interested party in wording of CA, 

requested revisions, etc.  Receipt of CA, circulate CIM.  Discussions 

with group after reviewing CIM, answer queries, process, Canadian 

restructuring, etc. Assemble information requests for Data Room.  

Discussions and update to and with management and counsel.  

Creditor queries.  

16-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 0.50      Phone call from interest party, discussion re process, forward 

Confidentiality Agreement; finalize monitoring cash flow 

comparison.

17-Feb-17 Siciliano, Vince -        email exchange with Roger Wilson BDC;

17-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 3.00      Correspondence with secured creditor BDC.  Correspondence with 

interested parties.  Call with LMC counsel to workout concerns and 

answer questions.  Finalize CA with LMC, circulate CIM.

17-Feb-17 Dula, Lourdes 0.10      bank rec

17-Feb-17 Zahir, Farooq 2.00      Information request list and data room setup

21-Feb-17 Siciliano, Vince 0.50      conference call mark Ted and George re sale process

21-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 2.50      Receipt and review of Letter of Intent.  Discussions with two 

separate groups advising they would not be proceeding in sales 

process, reasoning, etc.  Ongoing discussions with interested 

parties.  Discussion with Business Development Bank.

21-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 0.50      Follow up with N. Kunysz re retainer; discussion with P. Naumis re 

same; generate invoice for Feb. 20 retainer payment.

22-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 2.75      Work with BDO corporate finance re: data room, population and 

access.  Receipt and review of Data Room documents filtering 

through from management. Correspondence from and to Sinclair 

Range, review, call to counsel to discuss.  Receipt and review of 

LOI.  Correspondence with interested parties.

22-Feb-17 Finamore, Patrick 1.50      Data room set up

23-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 0.20      Forward NOI letter to N. Kunysz for records; email creditor 

requested NOI letter.

23-Feb-17 Finamore, Patrick 0.50      Data room set up

23-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 2.50      Ongoing updates to Data Room.  Correspondence with various 

interested parties.  Ongoing discussions with Sinclair Range.  

Creditor query.  Receipt and review of LOI.  Call to interested party 

to discuss intentions, etc.  Receipt and review of incoming data 

room documents from management.  Communications with BDO 

corporate finance re: data room.  Correspondence with counsel re: 

draft Asset Purchase Agreement and Approval and Vesting Order. 

24-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 0.10      Follow up with N. Kunysz re retainer.

24-Feb-17 Finamore, Patrick 0.50      Data room setup, invitations

24-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 2.00      Correspondence with interested invited to Data Room and due 

diligence stage.  Invite parties to Data Room.  Receipt of further 

due diligence information, review and forward to corporation 

finance to populate Data Room.  Queries to Mark Chamberlain.  

Review and comments on draft terms and conditions of offer letter.   

24-Feb-17 Siciliano, Vince 0.75      tcw Steve Graff lawyer for BDC; communication re appraisal on 

inventory

27-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin -        Trip to pick up retainer.

27-Feb-17 Dula, Lourdes 0.20      processed chq



27-Feb-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.00      update on LOI and APA; communication with Graff

27-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 2.50      Review draft Asset Purchase Agreement, provide comments.  

Arrange for appraisal of inventory and tangible assets.  

Correspondence with Mark and Nancy.  Conference call with George 

Benchetrit and Mark Chamberlain re: draft Asset Purchase 

Agreement.  Arrange for additional invitees to Data Room from 

interested party.   Further updates to Data Room inclusions.  Query 

from interested party re: DIP, etc. 

27-Feb-17 Leung, Kevin 0.50      Follow up with N. Kunysz re monitoring documents and retainer; 

attend premises to pick up retainer cheque.

28-Feb-17 Naumis, Peter 2.00      Revisions to Asset Purchase Agreement.  Discussions with counsel re: 

comments.  Correspondence from interested party re: additional 

Data Room access.  Correspondence with corporate finance re: 

access to Data Room, and additional documents to upload.  

Correspondence with interested parties, queries.  Follow up inviting 

access to tour facility and meet with management.  Creditor query 

released equipment, proof of claim, etc.

28-Feb-17 Migus, Eugene 0.05      Approve cheque requisition(s) and/or sign cheque(s).

28-Feb-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.20      review APA; dealing with perspective purchasers

1-Mar-17 Leung, Kevin 0.50      Phone call with interested party; discussion re CIM and due 

diligence; follow up with N. Kunysz re monitoring data.

1-Mar-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.20      various communication re potential purchasers, issues with cash 

flow statements.

1-Mar-17 Naumis, Peter 2.50      Call to and from and discussions with Rivkin Asset Management re: 

SISP process, timing, general information on company, etc.  

Correspondence to and from Sinclair Range re: SISP, etc.  

Conference call with B. Sachdeva and G. Benchetrit re: draft form 

of Asset Purchase Agreement, comments, etc.  Correspondence and 

update with Mark Chamberlain re: Wescam queries, etc.  Follow up 

with Wescam.

1-Mar-17 Dula, Lourdes 0.20      processed dep

2-Mar-17 Naumis, Peter 2.75      Review reworked APA with comments added.  Receive and review 

draft Approval and Vesting Order, provide comments.  Conference 

call with G. Benchetrit, B. Sachdeva and V. Siciliano re: query from 

interested party on Lockheed Martin license agreement.  Further 

review of agreement and ramifications, ownership, etc.  

Communication and update to and from interested party, answer 

queries.  Correspondence with all interested parties re: updates to 

Data Room, draft APA and draft Approval and Vesting Order.  

Creditor correspondence.

2-Mar-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.25      various communication re: LMC license agreement; conference call 

to discuss same with professional group.

2-Mar-17 Finamore, Patrick 1.00      Data room invitations and maintenance

3-Mar-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.75      meeting to discuss cash flow and sales; review PV account; 

communication re L -3(Wescam) request for extension; conference 

call Saturday with professionals to discuss.

3-Mar-17 Leung, Kevin 1.20      Correspondence with PV Labs re payables and sales (existing and 

new); review chequing journal supplied by PV and reconcile to bank 

statement; update monitoring tracking sheet.

3-Mar-17 Naumis, Peter 1.75      Telephone discussions with interested party, requested extension to 

SISP, formal LOI, etc.  Additional correspondence to and from party 

expressing interest in SISP and PV Labs assets.  Discussions with 

Platinum Assets re: inventory appraisal.  Follow up with 

management re: inventory count, timing, etc.  Creditor 

correspondence.  Receipt of proof of claim.

3-Mar-17 Migus, Eugene 0.05      Review and approve monthly bank reconciliation.



4-Mar-17 Naumis, Peter 1.00      Conference call with G. Benchetrit, B. Sachdeva and V. Siciliano re: 

recent interested parties requests, extension, etc. 

6-Mar-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.25      various communication re: request from prospective purchaser for 

10 day extension to submit a binding bid; review terms of SISP 

process.

6-Mar-17 Leung, Kevin 1.50      Vet schedule provided by PV to P. Naumis against monitoring 

schedule; update P. Naumis re comparisons; follow up with PV Labs 

for monitoring documents; vet bank statements and cash flow 

support; conduct monitoring activities using bank statements; 

obtain daily noon rates for USD conversion.

6-Mar-17 Naumis, Peter 1.50      Various correspondence with debtor's counsel re: extension of time 

to file, parameters, etc.  Call and discussion with party requesting 

extension to discuss and request certain information to formalize 

their intent i.e.. nature of transaction, value inputted on 

transaction, timeline for due diligence, etc.  Forward formal 

correspondence to potential bidder.  Receipt and review of updated 

cash flow monitoring, revised cash flows forward looking, etc.     

7-Mar-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.30      update conference call- Graff, Benchetrit; various communication 

re: terms for granting extension; review more detailed LOI from 

Wescam; communication with BDC.

7-Mar-17 Naumis, Peter 2.50      Conference call with G. Benchetrit (debtor counsel), S. Graff (BDC 

counsel) and V. Siciliano.  Discuss extension requested by interested 

party.  Terms of extension, requested information, etc.  

Correspondence with interested party.  Call to other interested 

party to discuss due diligence completed to date, position, and 

potential offer.  Receive and review updated cash flows from 

management going forward.  Correspondence from additional party 

expressing interest in assets and requesting information re: 

timeline, etc.  Creditor queries.  Review Data Room access report.

7-Mar-17 Leung, Kevin 0.30      Review changes to original cash flow; follow up with PV Labs for 

contracts, payments, terms, etc.

8-Mar-17 Siciliano, Vince 2.20      review APA from DIP lender - Heersink; review APA from 

L3Technologies; LOI from Trakka;' BDC inquiry

8-Mar-17 Leung, Kevin 0.10      Follow up with PV re requested documents and retainer.

8-Mar-17 Naumis, Peter 2.00      Dealing with requested extension to submit APA and interested 

parties.  Correspondence to interested party re: Letter of Intent 

details, etc.  Review updated cash flows to consider effects of 

potential APA submission deadline.  Discussions and planning with 

counsel for Proposal Trustee and counsel for Company.  

Correspondence with additional party re: process, etc.  Forward and 

receive Confidentiality Agreement.

9-Mar-17 Leung, Kevin 0.50      Correspondence with N. Kunysz re retainer; prepare invoice for 

March 6 and March 20 retainer; finalize letter to interested party.

9-Mar-17 Siciliano, Vince 1.75      conference call to discuss offers and response to request for 

extension; enquiry from Trakka re time necessary for due diligence; 

response to Wescam re request for extension of time negotiation 

between BDC and Heersink; further communication BDO Chaitons 

and PV re granting extensions to Wescam and Trakka.

9-Mar-17 Naumis, Peter 3.50      Conference call with Chaitons and Pallett Valo, review of Letter of 

Intent submitted and recent additional expression of interest from 

further party.  Discuss extending APA deadline an additional 7 days.  

Review and analysis of cash flows and effect of extension, if any.  

Communication with bidder submitting offer re: offer, blackline, 

etc.  Communication with interested parties re: extension.  Draft 

and forward correspondence to party requesting extension, grant 

extension and advise of concerns.  



10-Mar-17 Naumis, Peter 3.00      Correspondence with interested parties.  Arrange facility tours and 

meeting with management.  Correspondence with parties re: 

agenda, questions, etc. to facilitate meeting.  Call with bidder, 

negotiate offer further, etc.  Update with Company's counsel. 

10-Mar-17 Siciliano, Vince 2.50      Talk with Benchetrit extension of time to submit offer; discussions 

with Naumis; meeting BDC and Adam Peaker  from Heersink 's office 

re joining up BDC to Heersink offer; call to George re update on 

meeting.

10-Mar-17 Iannilli, Franca 0.45      Respond to Melissa- OSB-Update and e-file Court Report regarding 

the extension of date

10-Mar-17 Leung, Kevin 0.10      Follow up with N. Kunyz re meeting to review sale contracts.

14-Mar-17 Naumis, Peter 1.50      Correspondence and update with interested party, meeting with 

management, agenda, etc.  Correspondence with PVLCC re: asset 

list, bidding, SISP, etc.  Correspondence and update from party 

touring facility yesterday.

15-Mar-17 Leung, Kevin 1.00      Monitoring activities; review bank statement; reconcile bank 

transaction to cheque register; review PV Lab's cash flow tracking 

sheet; pull weekly USD exchange rate from Bank of Canada; update 

monitoring cash flow projection vs actual workbook; reconcile total 

cash balance including USD account.

15-Mar-17 Dula, Lourdes 0.20      processed dep

15-Mar-17 Naumis, Peter 2.00      Correspondence with party enquiring on status of SISP, sale, 

timeline, etc.  Call to and update with Company counsel. 

Correspondence with management re: amended forecasts, contracts 

secured post filing, etc. Discussions and update to and from Nancy.

15-Mar-17 Finamore, Patrick 0.50      Data room maintenance 

16-Mar-17 Leung, Kevin 0.10      Follow up with PV re contracts, HST, and source deductions.

17-Mar-17 Dula, Lourdes 0.10      bank rec

249.35   
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CONFIDENTIAL APPENDIX ‘1’ 
 
 
 
District of Ontario 
Division No. 07-Hamilton 
Court File No. 32-2211776 
Estate No.  32-2211776 
 
 
 
 
 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE  

IN BANKRUPTCY 
 
 
 
 
 
 

TO THE SECOND REPORT OF 
BDO CANADA LIMITED IN ITS CAPACITY AS THE PROPOSAL TRUSTEE 

PV LABS INC. AND NOT IN ITS PERSONAL CAPACITY 

 

FILED SUBJECT TO REQUEST FOR SEALING ORDER 



CONFIDENTIAL APPENDIX ‘2’ 
 
 
 
District of Ontario 
Division No. 07-Hamilton 
Court File No. 32-2211776 
Estate No.  32-2211776 
 
 
 
 
 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE  

IN BANKRUPTCY 
 
 
 
 
 
 

TO THE SECOND REPORT OF 
BDO CANADA LIMITED IN ITS CAPACITY AS THE PROPOSAL TRUSTEE 

PV LABS INC. AND NOT IN ITS PERSONAL CAPACITY 

 

FILED SUBJECT TO REQUEST FOR SEALING ORDER 



CONFIDENTIAL APPENDIX ‘3’ 
 
 
 
District of Ontario 
Division No. 07-Hamilton 
Court File No. 32-2211776 
Estate No.  32-2211776 
 
 
 
 
 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE  

IN BANKRUPTCY 
 
 
 
 
 
 

TO THE SECOND REPORT OF 
BDO CANADA LIMITED IN ITS CAPACITY AS THE PROPOSAL TRUSTEE 

PV LABS INC. AND NOT IN ITS PERSONAL CAPACITY 

 

FILED SUBJECT TO REQUEST FOR SEALING ORDER 
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