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Court File No.  CV-19-00630665-00CL 

 
ONTARIO 

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 
(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

 

B E T W E E N : 

THE BANK OF NOVA SCOTIA 

Applicant 

- and - 

6396763 CANADA INC.  
Respondent 

 
APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 243(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND INSOLVENCY 
ACT, R.S.C. 1985, C. B-3, AS AMENDED AND SECTION 101 OF THE COURTS OF JUSTICE 
ACT, R.S.O. 1990, C. C.43, AS AMENDED 
 

 
NOTICE OF MOTION OF THE RECEIVER 

(motion for discharge and ancillary relief) 
(returnable February 24, 2021) 

 BDO CANADA LIMITED (“BDO”), in its capacity as Court-appointed receiver (the 

“Receiver”) of the property, assets and undertaking of the Respondent, will make a motion to a 

Judge of the Commercial List on Wednesday February 24, 2021 at 10:00 a.m., or as soon after that 

time as the motion can be heard, by judicial teleconference via Zoom at Toronto, Ontario.  Please 

refer to the conference details attached as Schedule “A” hereto in order to attend the motion and 

advise if you intend to join the motion by e-mailing Sam Rappos at samr@chaitons.com. 

PROPOSED METHOD OF HEARING: The motion is to be heard orally. 

 

1



- 2 -  
 

Doc#5007691v1 

THE MOTION IS FOR:  

(a) an order: 

(i) approving the activities of BDO in its capacity as proposed receiver as set 

out in its report dated November 7, 2019 (the “Pre-appointment Report”) 

and the Receiver as set out in the first and final report of the Receiver dated 

February 11, 2021 (the "Report");  

(ii) approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its counsel as 

detailed in the Report and the fee affidavits appended thereto;  

(iii) approving the Receiver’s Final Statement of Receipts and Disbursements 

dated February 4, 2021; 

(b) authorizing and approving a final distribution of the remaining proceeds available 

in the estate of the Respondent to Canada Revenue Agency;  

(i) discharging BDO as Receiver of the undertaking, property and assets of the 

Respondent and releasing BDO from any and all liability; and 

(c) such further and other relief as to this Honourable Court may seem just. 

THE GROUNDS FOR THE MOTION ARE: 

1.  6396763 Canada Inc. operating as The Installation Group (the “Debtor”), was engaged in 

the installation of telecommunications systems across Northern Ontario, Northern Quebec, 

Manitoba and Saskatchewan. The Debtor was a vendor of Bell Canada and had a contract to 

provide exclusive installation services in those regions. 
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2. The Debtor initially filed a proposal on December 28, 2018 that contemplated a refinancing 

of the business.  BDO acted as the proposal trustee (the “Proposal Trustee”).  The Debtor’s 

proposal was approved by its creditors on April 24, 2019 and by the Court on May 13, 2019.  

3. Following court approval of the proposal, the Debtor was not able to secure the financing 

required to fund the proposal and therefore there was a default in the terms of the proposal. The 

default was not waived by the creditors and no further action was taken by the Proposal Trustee or 

creditors to annul the proposal. 

4. At the meeting of creditors to consider the default, one of the parties who was approached 

for financing advised the Proposal Trustee that they were interested in purchasing the Debtor’s 

business and assets on a going concern basis.  BDO was subsequently approached by The Bank of 

Nova Scotia, the Debtor’s secured lender, to act as a proposed receiver to seek approval for a “pre-

pack” sale of the business and assets of the Debtor.  

5. On November 12, 2019, The Honourable Justice McEwen appointed BDO as Receiver and 

approved the “pre-pack” sale transaction. 

6. On November 13, 2019, the Receiver closed the sale transaction. 

7. As detailed in the Report, the Receiver has substantially completed the administration of 

the Debtor’s receivership estate, and is seeking its discharge, subject to completing all outstanding 

activities, which includes distributing remaining funds to Canada Revenue Agency, which has a 

deemed trust claim for employee source deductions. 

8. The Report. 
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9. Rules 1.04, 1.05, 2.01, 2.03, and 37 of the Rules of Civil Procedure (Ontario). 

10. The inherent jurisdiction of the Court. 

11. Such other grounds as counsel may advise and this Honourable Court may permit.   

 THE FOLLOWING DOCUMENTARY EVIDENCE will be used at the hearing of the 

motion: 

1. The Report and the appendices annexed thereto; and 

2. such further and other material as counsel may advise and this Honourable Court may 

permit. 

February 12, 2021     CHAITONS LLP 
5000 Yonge Street, 10th Floor 
Toronto, ON  M2N 7E9 
 
Sam Rappos (LSO # 51399S) 
Tel:  (416) 218-1137 
Fax: (416) 218-1837 
E-mail:  samr@chaitons.com 

       Lawyers for BDO Canada Limited, 
       Court-appointed Receiver 
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SCHEDULE “A” 

 

Zoom Meeting  
https://us02web.zoom.us/j/84619134400?pwd=cXh2cTNkMG5qMnpBUFFqWW13R05BUT09  

Meeting ID: 846 1913 4400  
Passcode: 458231  
One tap mobile  
+13126266799,,84619134400#,,,,*458231# US (Chicago)  
+13462487799,,84619134400#,,,,*458231# US (Houston)  

Dial by your location  
        +1 312 626 6799 US (Chicago)  
        +1 346 248 7799 US (Houston)  
        +1 646 558 8656 US (New York)  
        +1 669 900 9128 US (San Jose)  
        +1 253 215 8782 US (Tacoma)  
        +1 301 715 8592 US (Washington D.C)  
Meeting ID: 846 1913 4400  
Passcode: 458231  
Find your local number: https://us02web.zoom.us/u/kbwOXhmzPk  
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ONTARIO
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BETWEEN:
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- and -

6396763 CANADA INC.
Respondents

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 243(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND
INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, C. B-3, AS AMENDED AND SECTION 101 OF THE

COURTS OF JUSTICE ACT, R.S.O. 1990, C. C.43, AS AMENDED

FIRST AND FINAL REPORT TO THE COURT
SUBMITTED BY BDO CANADA LIMITED

IN ITS CAPACITY AS COURT-APPOINTED RECEIVER OF
6396763 CANADA INC.

February 11, 2021

INTRODUCTION

1. By Order of the Honourable Justice McEwen dated November 12, 2019 (the “Receivership

Order”), BDO Canada Limited (“BDO”) was appointed as receiver (in such capacity, the

“Receiver”), without security, of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of 6396763 Canada

Inc. (the “Debtor”). The Receivership Order was obtained on an application brought by The Bank

of Nova Scotia (“BNS”).  A copy of the Receivership Order is attached hereto as Appendix “A”.

2. The Debtor was engaged in the installation of telecommunications systems across Northern

Ontario, Northern Quebec, Manitoba and Saskatchewan.  The Debtor was a vendor of Bell Canada

and had a contract to provide exclusive installation services (the “Bell Service Agreement”) in

the aforementioned regions.
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3. The Debtor initially filed a proposal on December 28, 2018 that contemplated a refinancing of

business.  BDO acted as the Proposal Trustee. The Debtor’s proposal was approved by creditors

on April 24, 2019 and by the Court on May 13, 2019.  Following court approval of the proposal,

the Debtor was not able to secure the financing required to fund the proposal and therefore there

was a default in the terms of the proposal.  The default was not waived by the creditors and no

further action was taken by the Proposal Trustee or creditors to annul the proposal.  At the meeting

of creditors to consider the default, one of the parties who was approached for financing advised

the Proposal Trustee that they were interested in purchasing the Debtor’s business and assets on a

going concern basis.   BDO was subsequently approached by BNS to act as a proposed receiver to

seek approval for a “pre-pack” sale of the business and assets of the Debtor.  BDO spent

considerable time negotiating the terms and conditions of a “pre-pack” sale of the business and

assets prior to its appointment as Receiver.

4. As part of its application, BNS requested that, if BDO was appointed Receiver, it be authorized by

the Court to enter into and carry out the terms of an asset purchase agreement for the sale of

substantially all of the Debtor’s assets (the “Assets”) to 2722703 Ontario Inc. (the “Purchaser”).

In BDO’s report to the Court as proposed receiver dated November 7, 2019 (the “Pre-

Appointment Report”), BDO described the process that resulted in the proposed sale transaction

with the Purchaser.  A copy of the Pre-Appointment Report without appendices is attached hereto

as Appendix “B”.

5. On November 12, 2019, the Honourable Justice McEwen made an order approving the sale of the

Assets and vesting title to the Assets in the Purchaser free and clear of any encumbrances (the

“Approval and Vesting Order”).  A copy of the Approval and Vesting Order is attached hereto

as Appendix “C”.

6. On November 13, 2019, the Receiver closed the transaction with the Purchaser.  The Receiver has

filed with the Court a Receiver’s Certificate in accordance with paragraph 2 of the Approval and

Vesting Order.  A copy of the Receiver’s Certificate is attached hereto as Appendix “D”.

PURPOSE OF THIS REPORT

7. The purpose of this first and final report to the Court of the Receiver dated February 11, 2021 (the

“ Final Report”) is to:
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· Report on the activities of the Receiver since November 12, 2019;

· Report on the closing of the transaction providing for the sale of the Assets;

· Provide information to the Court to support the granting of an Order (the “Distribution

and Discharge Order”):

i. approving the Pre-Appointment Report and the Final Report and the activities of

BDO and the Receiver as set out therein and herein;

ii. approving the Receiver’s Final Statement of Receipts and Disbursements dated

February 4, 2021 (the “Final R&D”);

iii. approving and authorizing a final distribution of the funds remaining in the

Receiver’s possession, as set out in the Final R&D, to Canada Revenue Agency

(“CRA”) following the payment of the Professional Fees (as defined herein) and

the Holdback (as defined herein), on account of the indebtedness owing by the

Debtor to CRA’s in respect of its property claim (the “Final Distribution”);

iv. approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its respective legal

counsel, Lipman, Zener & Waxman LLP (“LZW”) and Chaitons LLP

(“Chaitons”) as reflected herein and in the appended fee affidavits, including the

Remaining Fees (as defined herein) as set out in Final Report, and authorizing the

Receiver to pay all approved and unpaid fees and disbursements;

v. discharging and releasing the Receiver upon the filing by the Receiver of the

Receiver’s discharge certificate, substantially in the form attached as Schedule “A”

to the Distribution and Discharge Order (the “Receiver’s Discharge Certificate”),

certifying that the Remaining Activities (as defined herein) have been completed to

the satisfaction of the Receiver.

DISCLAIMER

8. This Final Report is prepared for the use of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial

List) in the proceedings and for the information and use of stakeholders. In preparing this Final

Report, the Receiver has relied upon certain unaudited, draft and/or internal financial information,

the Debtor’s books and records, discussions with Management, and information obtained from
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other third party sources. The Receiver assumes no responsibility or liability for the loss or damage

occasioned by any party as a result of the circulation, publication, re-production or use of this Final

Report or for any use which any party makes of this Final Report, or any reliance on, or a decision

to be made, based upon it, other than for the express purposes set out in this Final Report.

9. Capitalized terms not defined in this Final Report are as defined in the Receivership Order.

10. Unless otherwise stated, all monetary amounts contained herein are in Canadian dollars.

RECEIVER’S ACTIVITIES

11. Since  its appointment, the Receiver’s activities have included, among other things:

· closing the sale transaction with the Purchaser as described below.

· monitoring receipts and disbursements and liaising with various stakeholders, as

appropriate;

· collecting accounts receivable;

· addressing sale post-closing issues;

· attending to the updating of the books and records of the Debtor in order to prepare and

file HST returns and WSIB returns for 2019;

· corresponding by email and telephone with creditors and a key customer;

· addressing various Ministry of Labour claims;

· liaising with legal counsel on various matters; and

· drafting the Final Report.

BOOKS AND RECORDS

12. The Receiver has obtained certain Books and Records of the Debtor and has prepared company

financial information in order to prepare and file HST returns for the Debtor for October 2019 and

the stub period from November 1 to November 13, 2019.

13. The Receiver does not intend to file outstanding income tax returns for the Debtor for 2018 or

2019 as the Debtor reported losses for these years.  Any tax refund produced would reduce the

current income tax balance owing but would not change the CRA’s deemed trust claim.  As the
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receipts received do not fully satisfy CRA’s deemed trust claim, filing the outstanding income tax

returns would result in more expense being incurred in the estate with no benefit to the Debtor’s

creditors and other stakeholders.

SALE TRANSACTION

14. As outlined in the Pre-Appointment Report, the Debtor undertook a thorough sale and marketing

process canvassing interest through financial institutions, investment groups, private investors and

Bell Canada’s vendor network and investors. The Company’s marketing process exposed the

investment opportunity and the Debtor’s Assets to the market for in excess of 15 months.

15. The Receiver closed the sale transaction for the Assets with the Purchaser on November 13, 2019.

The purchase price received for the Assets was $275,000.  The sale transaction included the capital

assets and the assignment of the Bell Service Agreement but excluded the accounts receivable,

which were collected by the Receiver.  The Debtor’s business and Assets were sold on a going

concern basis thereby preserving the employment of approximately 100 employees.  Additionally,

the sale preserved a tenant for the parent company 6756051 Canada Inc. for which BNS held a

first mortgage over the real property.

16. The sale transaction was approved by BNS and CRA, the key stakeholders with an economic

interest in the Debtor’s Assets as detailed in the Pre-Appointment Report.

STATEMENT OF RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

17. The Receiver has prepared the Final R&D reflecting the activity in the receivership from

November 12, 2019 to February 4, 2021.  The Final R&D reports net receipts over disbursements

at February 4, 2021 of $722,613.88, subject to the provision for unpaid Professional Fees, the

Holdback (defined below) and the proposed final distribution to CRA (discussed below).  The

Final R&D is attached hereto as Appendix “E”.
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PRIORITY CLAIMS/DEEMED TRUSTS

18. The Receiver received a priority secured claim from Service Canada totaling $6,931 pursuant to

the Wage Earner Protection Program Act (“WEPPA”) and the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act in

respect of amounts paid out to the Debtor’s former employees for outstanding wages and vacation

pay (the “WEPPA Claim”).  In a receivership, this claim has priority over the Debtor’s current

assets ahead of all other secured claims and the deemed trust claim of CRA for unremitted payroll

source deductions pursuant to section 81.4(4) of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act.  Accordingly,

this claim has been paid by the Receiver as reflected in the Final R&D.

19. As discussed in the Pre-Appointment Report, CRA conducted audits of the Debtor’s Payroll and

HST accounts.  Claims from CRA have been submitted to the Receiver for outstanding payroll

deductions and HST in the amounts of $1,140,917 and $986,872, respectively (the “CRA

Claims”).  CRA has submitted a property claim totaling $774,405 for the unremitted portion of

the employee payroll deduction withholdings which is a deemed trust claim that has priority over

all other secured claims, except the WEPPA Claim as described above.

PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

20. As indicated in the Pre-Appointment Report, BDO obtained an independent legal opinion from

Chaitons advising that subject to the usual qualifications, BNS holds a validly perfected security

interest in the Debtors’ Assets.  At the commencement of the receivership proceeding, the loan

outstanding to BNS totaled $598,980.87 according to the affidavit of Bronwyn Nelson sworn

November 6, 2019.  BNS’s secured claim is subordinate to the WEPPA Claim and the CRA

Claims.

21. A search of registrations filed against the Debtor pursuant to the Personal Property Security Act

(Ontario) (“PPSA”) indicate that in addition to BNS’s PPSA registration against the Debtor,

Enterprise Fleet Management Inc. has registered against the Debtor under the PPSA with respect

to certain leased vehicles.  The leased vehicles were not subject to the Receiver’ sale transaction

with the Purchaser.

22. The Receiver proposes to distribute to CRA, on account of its deemed trust claim for collected and

unremitted employee source deductions, all funds remaining in the Receiver’s trust account, after
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payment of the Professional Fees and the Holdback (defined below). The Receiver estimates that

the final payment to CRA will total $656,731.07 as reflected in the Final R&D.

23. As the Receiver may collect nominal additional amounts prior to its discharge, the Receiver is

requesting that it be authorized, without further order of the Court, to make subsequent

distributions to CRA up to the amount of the CRA Claims.

PROFESSIONAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS

24. BDO, in its capacity as proposed receiver and Receiver, has provided services and incurred

disbursements during the period of August 13, 2019 to February 5, 2021, which are described in

the Affidavit of Gary Cerrato sworn February 8, 2021 (the “Cerrato Affidavit”), attached herein

as Appendix “F”.

25. The detailed narratives contained in the invoice provides a fair and accurate description of the

services provided and the amounts charged by BDO.  Included with the invoices is a summary of

the time charges of partners and staff, whose services are reflected in the invoices, including the

total fees and hours billed.

26. Additionally, the Receiver has incurred legal fees of its respective legal counsel, LZW and

Chaitons in respect of these proceedings, as more particularly set out in the Affidavits of Jason

Spetter sworn February 4, 2021 (the “Spetter Affidavit”) and Sam Rappos sworn February 11,

2021 (the “Rappos Affidavit”) appended hereto as Appendices “G” and “H”, respectively.

27. The Receiver requests that the Court approve its interim accounts for the period of August 13,

2019 to February 5, 2021 of $51,893.37 plus HST of $6,746.14, for a total of $58,639.51.  The

Receiver request that the Court approve the interim accounts of its legal counsel LZW from August

22, 2019 to November 12, 2019 for fees and disbursements of $39,495.40 plus HST of $5,104.63,

totaling $44,600.03.  Additionally, the Receiver requests that the Court approve the interim

accounts of its legal counsel Chaitons for the period August 14, 2019 to December 31, 2020 for

fees and disbursements of $11,074.67 plus HST of $1,439.71, totaling $12,514.38 (collectively

the “Professional Fees”).

28. The Receiver estimates additional professional fees of $3,000, plus HST, to complete the

administration of the estate, together with estimated legal costs of $3,000, plus HST (collectively,
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the “Remaining Fees”).  The Receiver is therefore proposing to hold back the total amount of

$6,000, plus HST (the “Holdback”) on account of the Remaining Fees.  The Receiver requests

that the Court approve the Holdback, for which the Receiver and the Receiver’s counsel will only

draw upon based on actual time and disbursements incurred.

29. The Receiver respectfully submits that the Professional Fees, as set out in the Cerrato, Spetter and

Rappos Affidavits (collectively, the “Fee Affidavits”), together with Remaining Fees, are

reasonable in the circumstances and have been or will be validly incurred in accordance with the

provisions of the Receivership Order.

RECEIVER’S DISCHARGE

30. All of the Receiver’s duties as set out in the Receivership Order will be completed upon

(collectively, the “Remaining Duties”):  (i) filing the final estate HST return(s) to recover any

unclaimed input tax credits, (ii) payment of the Professional Fees and the Remaining Fees, (iii)

making the Final Distribution, (iv) filing the Receiver’s final report pursuant to s. 246(3) of the

Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act with the Office of the Superintendent of Bankruptcy, and (v)

closing of the Receiver’s trust account.

31. To the best of the Receiver’s knowledge, following the completion of the Remaining Activities,

the Receiver will have completed its administration of the receivership estate in accordance with

the terms of the Receivership Order.

SUMMARY AND RECOMMENDATIONS

32. Based on the foregoing, the Receiver respectfully recommends that the Court:

i. approve the Pre-Appointment Report and the Final Report and the activities and

conduct of BDO outlined therein and herein;

ii. approve the Receiver’s Final R&D;

iii. approve and authorize the Final Distribution to CRA, following the payment of the

Professional Fees and the Holdback;
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iv. approve the Professional Fees, as outlined in the Fee Affidavits and this Final

Report, and the Remaining Fees;

v. discharge the Receiver, subject to the Receiver completing the Remaining

Activities and the filing of the Receiver’s Discharge Certificate;

vi. that upon the filing of the Receiver’s Discharge Certificate, substantially in the form

set out in Schedule “A” of the Distribution and Discharge Order, discharging BDO

as Receiver of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of the Debtor; and

vii. that upon the filing of the Receiver’s Discharge Certificate, releasing BDO from

any and all liability it now has or may have by reason of, or in any way arising out

of, the acts or omissions of BDO while acting in its capacity as Receiver herein,

save and except for any gross negligence or willful misconduct on the Receiver’s

part.

All of which is respectfully submitted this 11th day of February, 2021

BDO CANADA LIMITED
In its capacity as Court Appointed Receiver of
6396763 Canada Inc.
Per:

________________________________
Gary Cerrato, CIRP, LIT
Senior Vice President
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RECEIPTS: 04-Feb-21 Future FINAL
1. Asset Realization:

Cash in bank 213,031.18$
Accounts receivable 1,022,253.39
Sale of assets en bloc 275,000.00
Post-sale closing adjustment (145,664.29) 1,364,620.28$ 1,364,620.28$

2. Operating Receipts 32,565.97 32,565.97
3. Miscellaneous

Other receipts 341.16
Insurance refund 2,831.74
Interest 2,192.95
WCB refund 1,397.57 6,763.42 6,763.42

Total Receipts 1,403,949.67$ -$ 1,403,949.67$

DISBURSEMENTS:
4 Filing fees 70.00 70.00
5 Insurance 3,184.50 3,184.50
6 Bank Charges 343.03 343.03
7 Operational Expenses

Wages 302,449.94
Casual labour 110,228.32
Consulting fee 15,000.00
Vacation Pay 96,863.26
Group insurance 3,024.74
Transport 44,959.85
Equipment lease 41,629.94 614,156.05 614,156.05

8 WEPPA Priority 6,931.10 6,931.10
9 Deemed Trust - CRA payroll deductions 656,731.07 656,731.07

10 Receiver's Fees
Receiver's Fees 54,893.37 54,893.37
HST on Receiver's fees 7,136.14 7,136.14

11 Legal Fees
Lipman, Zener & Waxman LLP 39,495.40 39,495.40
Chaitons LLP 10,664.67 3,410.00 14,074.67
HST on Legal Fees 6,491.04 443.30 6,934.34

Total Disbursements 681,335.79 722,613.88 1,403,949.67
RECEIPTS OVER DISBURSEMENTS 722,613.88$ (722,613.88)$ -$

NOTES:
[1] Lipman, Zener & Waxman LLP acted as counsel to the Bank of Nova Scotia and the proposed Receiver to close the sale transaction.
The sale transaction for the Debtor's business and assets closed the day following the appointment of the receiver and the legal fees
were approved by CRA for payment from the sale proceeds received in the receivership proceeding.
[2] Chaitons LLP acted as independent counsel to the Receiver.

Estate No: 31-458800

IN THE MATTER OF THE RECEIVERSHIP OF
6396763 CANADA INC.

RECEIVER'S STATEMENT OF RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS
for the period November 12, 2019 to February 4, 2021

FINAL
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BETWEEN:

Court File No. CV-19-00630665-00CL

ONTARIO

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

COMMERCIAL LIST

THE BANK OF NOVA SCOTIA

- and -

6396763 CANADA INC.

Applicant

Respondents

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 243(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCYAND
INSOLVENCYACT, R.S.C 1985, c. B-3 AS AMENDED AND SECTION 101 OF THE

COURTS OF JUSTICE ACT, R.S.O 1990. c. C. 43, AS AMENDED

AFFIDAVIT OF GARY CERRATO

I, GARY CERRATO, of the Town of Newmarket, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE OATH
AND SAY that:

1. I am a Senior Vice President of BDO Canada Limited, and as such have personal

knowledge of the matters referred to herein.

2. By Order of the Honourable Justice McEwen, dated November 12, 2029 (the

"Receivership Order"), BDO Canada Limited was Receiver (in such capacity the

"Receiver") of 6396763 Canada Inc.
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2.

Pursuant to the Receivership Order, the Receiver has provided services and incurred

disbursements which are more particularly described in the detailed accounts attached

hereto and marked as Exhibit "A".

The time shown in the detailed accounts attached as Exhibit "A" are a fair and accurate

descriptionofthe servicesprovidedand the amounts chargedby the Receiver,which reflect

the Receiver's time as billed at its standard billing rates.

ITie Receiverrequests that the Courtapproveits feesand disbursements for the periodfrom

August 13,2019 to February 5, 2021 in the amount of $51,893.37 plus HST of $6,746.14

for a total of $58,639.51, for the services set out in Exhibit "A" plus the Receiver's

estimate of additional time to finalize the receivership administration estimated to be

$3,000.00 plus HST.

This affidavit is sworn in support of the Receiver's motion for, among other things,

approval of its fees and disbursements and those of its legal representatives and for no other

or improper purpose.

1 am swearing this Affidavit by way of video conference in the virtual presence of a

commissioner for taking oaths/notary public.

SWORN BEFORE ME at the City of
Barrie, in the Province of Ontario, this
S**" day of February 2021

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, etc

!vn Aral tm. • CetnnMoMr, Me.,
• lev.-xaefflnMlo^lorBOOCtMdtUP
M BOOCiMdalMMMdMrMMMM,

...MoMMtndaatalM.
Gl«in*Jm2T.20a2.

Gary Cerrato, CIRP
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This is Exhibit "A" referred to in the affidavit of

Gary Cerrato

Sworn before me this 8*'' day of February 2021

A COMMISSIONER FOR TAKING AFFIDAVITS

BMi Aim Bom. • OennrtoitaMr. Me.,
f>nwlnniKOntirto;(orBOOCm«lUf>
Md etX>Cmda UmM
MtoclMHaidaMMn.
Ei9*MJum27,2082.
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Tel:  416 865 0210 
Fax:  416 865 0904 
www.bdo.ca 

BDO Canada Limited 
300 Lakeshore Drive 
Barrie ON L4N 0B4 Canada 

 

 

BDO Canada Limited is an affiliate of BDO Canada LLP. BDO Canada LLP, a Canadian limited liability partnership, is a member of BDO International Limited, a UK 
company limited by guarantee, and forms part of the international BDO network of independent member firms. 

 

 

         INVOICE 
 
The Estate of 6396763 Canada Inc. 
Estate # 31-458800 
c/o BDO Canada Limited 
300 Lakeshore Drive 
Barrie, ON 
L4N 0B4 
 
Attention:   
 

 
Date         Invoice No. 
 
February 5, 2021       draft   
 
 
Re: Estate of 6396763 Canada Inc. 
 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES in relation to the receivership of 6396763 Canada Inc. for the period 
ending February 5, 2021.   
 
 
For Professional Services 51,695.00$       

Disbursements

Expenses 198.37         198.37               

51,893.37         

HST  - 13.0% (#R101518124) 6,746.14            

Total Due 58,639.51$       

Summary of Time Charges: Hours Rate Amount

G.Cerrato, Partner 7.50              465.00         3,487.50            
S.Millis, Senior Manager 86.00            355.00         30,530.00         
Administrators 117.85         150.00         17,677.50         

-                      
TOTAL 211.35         51,695.00$       
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2 

Date Professional Description Hrs 

08/13/2019 Matthew Moran Call with FirePower Capital 1 
08/13/2019 Stella Millis Firepower Call to discuss TIG 1 
08/14/2019 Matthew Moran Conference Call 0.75 
08/15/2019 Matthew Moran Gathering info for FirePower Capital 2 
08/21/2019 Matthew Moran Info gathering for FirePower 0.25 
08/22/2019 Matthew Moran Call with Tunde and Uday at FirePower Capital re: 

2018/19 normalized EBITDA numbers 
0.5 

08/23/2019 Matthew Moran Call with Robert re: adverse change report, current 
conditions of company 

0.75 

08/23/2019 Matthew Moran Emails to Wendi re: FirePower capital and information 
requests they have. 

0.25 

08/27/2019 Stella Millis Newmarket to Pearson Airport (Sudbury Meeting) 3 
08/29/2019 Matthew Moran Calls with Uday and going through line items in the 

normalization - explaining differences between 
normalized EBITDA numbers and cash flows; starting to 
send more material and requesting some from Wendi 

1.5 

08/30/2019 Matthew Moran Call with Jeff Martin and Stella; Call with Uday at 
FirePower wanting clarification on several line items of 
the normalization of EBITDA, questions to Wendi to 
confirm which g/l accounts some of the numbers are 
coming from in the normalization 

2.25 

09/03/2019 Stella Millis Meeting with Robert to discuss offer to purchase, call with 
legal counsel, BNS, CRA and Firepower. 

2.5 

09/04/2019 Stella Millis Calls with purchaser and TIG management 1 
09/06/2019 Stella Millis Sales Process, calls and discussion 2 
09/09/2019 Matthew Moran Changes to CRA letter, going through with Stella, 

sending to CRA, calling Mark Marchan to discuss 
1.25 

09/09/2019 Stella Millis Draft/amend Administrative agreement with CRA 1.5 
09/10/2019 Stella Millis Call with Fire Power 1 
09/11/2019 Matthew Moran Discussion with Stella, requesting info from TIG for 

properties and employees to start building file for 
receivership, start pulling info together from what we 
already have 

1.25 

09/20/2019 Matthew Moran Answering Uday's questions re: duties Wendi and Judy 
perform in the accounting department.  Sending Wendi 
an email to clarify a few things; Email to Robert to 
discuss why inventory has historically been so high and 
helping Stella proof her calculations why a receivership is 
a better option than bankruptcy for CRA; sending CRA 
comparison and following up with call to Mark Marchan, 
attending creditors meeting and draft minutes of meeting, 
follow ups with Mark Marchan (CRA) to see if approval 
has been received. 

4.8 
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3 

09/23/2019 Matthew Moran Call with Wendi re: cash flows, questions from FirePower 
Capital; Call with Uday from FirePower Capital as well as 
Ryan Zysman from Future Balance re: processes 
performed by members of TIGs finance department; Call 
with Golda at BDC providing an update on CRA; Call with 
Mark Marchan of CRA getting confirmation of approval; 
organizing reconvening meeting of creditors 

2.25 

09/25/2019 Stella Millis Matters relating to Minutes, Letter of Intent, email 
correspondence with LZW and Fire Power. Engaged in 
various email correspondence. 

2 

10/01/2019 Stella Millis Review of file and notes to date 0.5 
10/02/2019 Stella Millis Call with Fire Power - next steps 1 
10/03/2019 Stella Millis Call with Fire Power sale process, LOI, Due Diligence, 

info o/s. 
2 

10/11/2019 Stella Millis APA/LOI negotiations 2 
10/15/2019 Matthew Moran Drafting Proposed Receivers Report 3 
10/18/2019 Matthew Moran Various calls and emails with purchasers, CRA, creditors 1 
10/18/2019 Matthew Moran Provided an update to Golda at BDC per her request 0.25 
10/21/2019 Matthew Moran Information to FirePower re: APA and support schedules 1 
10/22/2019 Matthew Moran Updated Proposed Receivers report for no receivership 

to be filed for Holdco.  Drafted teh Supplemental report 
3 

10/23/2019 Matthew Moran Calls with purchaser, gathering information for APA 3 
10/23/2019 Stella Millis Call with Fire Power re sale closing and apa schedules 1 
10/24/2019 Stella Millis Conference call with Legal Counsel re: Motion; Call with 

Fred T re: Corp representation matters relating to APA; 
work on draft report 

2.5 

10/29/2019 Matthew Moran Status meeting with FirePower, working on schedules for 
APA, connecting with BDO counsel to review info, 
sending Bell contracts to relevant parties, lease 
agreement, questions and follow up for BDO counsel re: 
post closing adjustments 

5 

10/30/2019 Matthew Moran Reviewing lease agreement, analysing market rent and 
conditions, review APA, calls with lawyers, discussions 
with Proposed Receiver, sending Robert's lawyer 
information, various emails to BDO's counsel 

6 

10/30/2019 Stella Millis Receivership conference call and report 8 
10/31/2019 Matthew Moran Working on supplementary report after conversation with 

Stella, emails to lawyers re: various agreements 
2 

11/01/2019 Matthew Moran APA, Bell Assignment, building lease 0.75 
11/05/2019 Matthew Moran APA adjustments 0.75 
11/05/2019 Stella Millis Work on draft report to Court and Conf supp 8 
11/06/2019 Stella Millis Engaged in various conference call with Purchaser and 

Legal Counsel re o/s issues and APA. Review of lease, 
amendments, draft APA, bell assignment and revisions of 
same 

6 
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4 

11/07/2019 Matthew Moran Proposed receivers report - gathering all appendices, 
compiling, scanning and sending to LZW 

1 

11/07/2019 Stella Millis Engaged in conference call re Statement of Adjustments 
and transition issues. Finalize Motion material and report. 

4 

11/08/2019 Stella Millis Conference calls re Motion 2 
11/11/2019 Matthew Moran Transition adjustments, gathering info to update Ascend 

to send notices out 
4 

11/11/2019 Stella Millis Call with legal counsel, purchaser re Motion and closing 2 
11/12/2019 Matthew Moran Preparing notice, various matters on receivership day 4 
11/12/2019 Stella Millis Motion for Receivership 3 
11/12/2019 Stella Millis Meeting with Principle re closing issues 1.5 
11/13/2019 Matthew Moran Setting up extranet site 0.25 
11/13/2019 Matthew Moran  Various matters concerning sale closing 4.5 
11/13/2019 Stella Millis Engaged in call re closing docs, review and execution of 

same, various calls with purchaser re closing adjustments 
and transition issues 

4 

11/14/2019 Stella Millis Conference call with staff and purchaser re closing 
transition 

1 

11/15/2019 Matthew Moran phone call with Uday re: transition adjustments, getting 
information from Wendi following meeting; call with BDC 

2.5 

11/15/2019 Stella Millis Conference call 2 
11/18/2019 Stella Millis Conference calls 1 
11/18/2019 Stella Millis Transition issues 1.5 
11/21/2019 Matthew Moran Reviewing receivership emails, saving info to the K drive, 0.5 
11/22/2019 Stella Millis Engage in various calls and correspondence re Motion, 

APA and outstanding issues. 
4 

11/25/2019 Bridget Chiasson Setting up client in workday 0.5 
11/25/2019 Matthew Moran Various matters - gas advances, Bell payments, cheque 

req for LZW, scheduling call with CRA 
1.75 

11/25/2019 Shannon 
Jackson 

Nov 15/19 - conference call w/Wendi, review of statement 
of adjustments, general admin 

8 

11/26/2019 Matthew Moran Asking Wendi for backup for amounts paid since 
receivership and reviewing.  Getting BNS to put a stop on 
all future payments until BDO authorizes; touching base 
with Stella to see if she needs help 

1 

11/27/2019 Matthew Moran Call with Robert re: terminated employees; talking to BNS 
re: authorizing payments 

0.5 

11/28/2019 Matthew Moran Call with CRA to provide an update, adding actuals to 
date to distribution listing btw old TIG and new TIG in 
preparation of adjustment 

1.5 

11/28/2019 Stella Millis CRA update 0.5 
11/29/2019 Matthew Moran Drafting WEPP letters, summary of estimated actual 

recoveries for CRA, talking to BNS to allow contractor 
payments to go through, getting loan exception fee 
reversed, emailing with a creditor, discussions with 
Wendi Hollmer 

3.5 

12/04/2019 Stella Millis Call with Rosemary Fisher re BDC claim follow up on o/s 
closing adjustments. 

0.5 
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5 

12/05/2019 Matthew Moran Monitoring the bank 0.5 
12/06/2019 Matthew Moran Drafting WEPP letters, setting up WEPP site, emailing 

letters to employees 
1.25 

12/06/2019 Matthew Moran Bank monitoring, confirming with Bronwyn transfers to be 
made from Caisse to BNS accounts, confirming with 
Wendi the receivership will receive a refund from WCB 
Manitoba 

0.5 

12/09/2019 Matthew Moran Call with Richard Robinson (former employee) re: WEPP 
claim 

0.25 

12/09/2019 Matthew Moran Cash flows, bank monitoring, review of transactions 1 
12/09/2019 Stella Millis Calls and correspondence re statement of adjustments, 

o/s returns etc. 
2 

12/10/2019 Matthew Moran Cash flows, bank monitoring, review of transactions 1 
12/12/2019 Matthew Moran Bank monitoring, getting Caisse money transferred to 

BNS, reviewing statement of adjustments and sending 
copy to Stella 

1.5 

12/13/2019 Matthew Moran Cash flows, bank monitoring, review of transactions 1 
12/16/2019 Matthew Moran Reviewed statement of adjustments ahead of the call; 

Call with Uday, Wendi, new bookkeepers to review final 
adjustments, follow up call with Stella 

1.75 

12/16/2019 Stella Millis Conference call with purchaser, call with Wendi re 
Statement of Adjustments. Revise statement and review 
o/s items for closing 

3.5 

12/17/2019 Matthew Moran WEPP proof of claims 0.25 
12/17/2019 Stella Millis Call and correspondence re final statement of 

adjustments, obtain funds from BNS and Caisse Bank 
accounts. 

1.5 

12/18/2019 Matthew Moran Monitoring bank accounts 0.25 
12/19/2019 Matthew Moran Arranging wire transfer to purchaser 0.5 
12/20/2019 Matthew Moran Arranging wire transfer to purchaser 0.25 
12/30/2019 Stella Millis Finalization of costs, SRD 2 
02/11/2020 Matthew Moran Wendi cheque requisition 0.25 
02/13/2020 Matthew Moran Bookkeeping questions from Wendi 0.25 
03/19/2020 Matthew Moran Email to past employee/creditor re: delay in receiving 

money and closure of courts 
0.5 

03/20/2020 Stella Millis Finalization call with legal counsel 0.5 
03/26/2020 Matthew Moran Call with Wendi re: wrapping up tax filings 0.25 
04/02/2020 Matthew Moran Getting QuickBooks file to complete tax returns.  PDFing 

relevant reports to complete.  Sending HST info to 
controller to efile. Reviewing material we have to see 
which years we have to file, gathering backup already on 
network, reviewing emails from KPMG, reaching out to 
Robert, starting a tax prep file 

2.5 

04/03/2020 Matthew Moran Call with team re: transition of Trustee 0.25 
04/03/2020 Matthew Moran Summary for Trustee on where file stands.  Reaching out 

to Robert for tax returns. Troubles with getting HST 
returns efiled. 

1 

04/06/2020 Matthew Moran TIG HST and T2 tax returns 1.5 
04/07/2020 Matthew Moran HST/T2 returns 0.75 

66



  
 

6 

04/08/2020 Matthew Moran HST and transferring money from 3rd party account 0.5 
04/15/2020 Stella Millis Holdco Proposal filing and drafting - call with Robert/LZW 3 
04/17/2020 Matthew Moran Sending Receivership order and proof of claim to lawyer 

for Canadian Fuelman MasterCard.  Call with lawyer 
0.5 

04/22/2020 Stella Millis File Admin, review outstanding, send email to M Moran 
and D Jones on items to follow up and finalize Proposal 
and Receiversihp 

1.5 

04/27/2020 Matthew Moran SRD, court report, 246, g/l, following up on tax return 
from KPMG or Robert Lefebvre 

8.75 

04/28/2020 Matthew Moran cleaning up WIP, updating court report, reviewing claims, 
reviewing g/l and finishing SRD 

6 

04/29/2020 Matthew Moran SRD, call w Stella 2 
05/06/2020 Matthew Moran SRD 0.5 
05/07/2020 Matthew Moran SRD 0.5 
05/08/2020 Matthew Moran SRD 0.7 
05/11/2020 Matthew Moran SRD 0.5 
05/12/2020 Matthew Moran SRD - updating for WIP, moving WEPP to proper code 0.5 
05/13/2020 Matthew Moran SRD - updating court report 0.5 
10/19/2020 Gary Cerrato review of amendments to court report; review of workday 

account; 
0.8 

10/26/2020 Gary Cerrato review of GL to prepare updated R&D; review of workday 
account to prepare updated invoicing for report; 

1.5 

12/03/2020 
 

01/05/2021 
 
 

01/07/2021 
02/04/2021 

 
 

Matthew Moran 
 
Matthew Moran 
 
 
Gary Cerrato 
Gary Cerrato 

Call with Revenu Quebec; draft letter to close QST 
account and send to representative; 
Final changes to receiver's report and adjusting SRD, 
sending to counsel for final review and to book court 
date; 
Review of updated report; 
Final update to report, R&D; review of invoice; finalize 
exhibits; email to LZW re affidavit required; call with S. 
Rappos re motion; calls with M. Moran re report; 

0.5 
 

1.1 
 
 

0.7 
4.5 

 
 

   
      

211.35  
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Court File No. CV-19-00630665-00CL 

 

ONTARIO 

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 
COMMERCIAL LIST 

 
B E T W E E N: 

THE BANK OF NOVA SCOTIA 
Applicant 

 
 

- and - 
 
 

6396763 CANADA INC. 
Respondent 

 

AFFIDAVIT OF JASON D. SPETTER 

 

I, JASON D. SPETTER, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE OATH AND 

SAY AS FOLLOWS:  

1. I am a lawyer with the law firm of Lipman, Zener & Waxman PC (“LZW”), lawyers for 

the Applicant in this proceeding and as such have knowledge of the matters to which I hereinafter 

depose. 

2. BDO Canada Limited (“BDO”) was appointed receiver of the assets, undertaking and 

properties of the Respondent by Order dated November 12, 2019.  

3. Now produced and shown to me and marked as Exhibit “A” to this my Affidavit is a true 

copy of an account issued by LZW to BDO dated November 15, 2019 in the amount of $44,600.03 

for the period between August, 2019 and November, 2019 broken down as follows:  

• fees in the amount of $38,965.00,  

• disbursements in the amount of $530.40; and, 

•  HST in the amount of $5,104.63. 
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4. I confirm that the account described above accurately reflects the services provided by 

LZW in this matter and the fees and disbursements claimed by it during the period described above.     

5. Additionally, attached hereto and marked as Exhibit “B” to this my Affidavit is a summary 

of additional information with respect to the said account indicating all members of LZW who 

worked on this matter during the period described above, including their year of call to the bar. 

6. This Affidavit is sworn in support of the motion to discharge the Receiver and for no other 

or improper purpose. 

SWORN BEFORE ME by video 

teleconference at the City of Toronto,  

in the Province of Ontario  

on the 4th day of February, 2021. 

 

 

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits 
(or as may be) 

 

 JASON D. SPETTER 
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nyssam
Jason Spetter

lmpaynter
Ian Klaiman



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

This is Exhibit “A” referred to in the 

Affidavit of Jason D. Spetter sworn 

This 4th day of February, 2021 

 

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits (or as may be)* 

*virtually commissioned by Ian Klaiman (LSO #58955G),  
as per LSO Corporate Statement re COVID-19 
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 66930
 Nov 15, 2019

 80953
 Nov 15, 2019 Invoice Date:

 Invoice No.:
 Billing Through:
 Matter:

 I N V O I C E

 BDO Canada Limited

 300 Lakeshore Drive, Suite 202 
 Barrie, Ontario L4N 0B4

 Attention:  Stella Millis

 RE: 

 Professional Fees:

 Date  Description  Hours Provider

 8/22/2019  attending to initial telephone at tendances with FirePower 
 and BDO with FirePower being purchaser of the assets 

 0.50 ALL

 attending to communications with solicitors at Chaitons as 
 solicitors for BDO with respect to proposed alternative 
 paths to follow for sale of assets including vesting order for 
 bankruptcy, vesting order for proposal and court 
 appointed receivership and determining only proper path 
 is court appointed receivership

 0.60 ALL

 8/26/2019  attending to discussing matter with Bank to proceed with 
 Appointment of Receiver and confirming proposed course 
 action and correspondence

 0.80 ALL

 8/28/2019  attending to clarification letters prepared and sent to Bank
 and discussing need to issue letters of demand 

 0.50 ALL

 attending to further discussions with Bank and BDO to 
 discuss manner to protect Bank from exposure to fees and 
 issued detailed letter to BDO

 0.90 ALL

 8/29/2019  attending to reviewing matter in detail with Stella Millis and
 Bank and receiving additional documentation and 
 reviewing same

 1.40 ALL

 8/30/2019  attending to reviewing matter with BDO  0.30 ALL

 9/3/2019  attending to telephone attendance with Bank and 
 participating in meeting of creditors to secure proceeding 
 to receivership and sale

 0.50 ALL

 9/9/2019  attending to ongoing review of matter with Bank with 
 respect to the issuance of demands and proceeding with 
 Application and requesting additional documentation and
 material

 0.40 ALL

 9/16/2019  attending to further telephone attendance with Neel 
 Chopra and Bronwyn Nelson of the Bank to discuss 
 proceeding with Application for Receivership and issuance
 of demands notwithstanding the Installation Group had no
 direct debt to the Bank 

 0.60 ALL

 9/17/2019  correspondence with Stella Millis  0.20 JDS

 9/19/2019  correspondence with Shannon Jackson; reporting to bank  0.40 JDS

 9/20/2019  reviewing estimated realization schedule; correspondence
 with Stella Millis; correspondence and communications 
 with client; participating in meeting of creditors

 2.10 JDS

6396763 CANADA INC. (THE INSTALLATION GROUP)/6756051 CANADA INC.
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 Stella Millis

 66930
 Nov 15, 2019

 80953
 Nov 15, 2019 Invoice Date:

 Invoice No.:
 Billing Through:
 Matter:

 300 Lakeshore Drive, Suite 202
 Barrie, Ontario L4N 0B4

 BDO Canada Limited

   attending to reviewing a submitted realization and 
 discussing same with Bank and with FirePower as potential 
 purchaser

 0.70 ALL

 9/25/2019  attending to receiving and reviewing draft letter of intent 
 from FirePower and minutes of fourth meeting of creditors 
 an providing comments thereon 

 0.80 ALL

   attending to discussing alternative mechanisms to 
 receivership with Bank and BDO

 0.40 ALL

 9/26/2019  attending to reviewing file and commenting on status  0.30 ALL

 9/27/2019  reviewing Letter of Intent from Firepower; correspondence 
 with client; correspondence with Stella Millis

 0.80 JDS

   attending to reviewing amended letter of intent and 
 commenting thereon

 0.40 ALL

 10/8/2019  correspondence with client; correspondence with Stella 
 Millis

 0.50 JDS

   attending to receipt of advise that any potential 
 refinancing has ended and reviewing with BDO and Bank 
 and proceeding with Receivership

 0.50 ALL

 10/10/2019  attending to a detailed telephone conversation with BDO 
 as to manner in which to proceed and receiving and 
 reviewing letter of intent and issues related to software

 0.70 ALL

 10/11/2019  correspondence with Stella Millis  0.30 JDS

   attending to email exchange with representatives of 
 FirePower and issuing comments on LOI

 0.40 ALL

 10/15/2019  attending to issuing correspondence to BDO related to 
 issues surrounding assets to be sold in  receivership and 
 discussing same with BDO

 0.60 ALL

 10/16/2019  correspondence and communications with client  1.60 JDS

 10/17/2019  correspondence with Stella Millis; reporting to client  0.40 JDS

   attending to receiving detailed response from  BDO as the 
 outstanding issues, discussion and resolution of each item

 0.80 ALL

 10/18/2019  correspondence with client  0.30 JDS

   attending to telephone attendance to Bank with respect 
 to issuance of demands and proceeding with Receivership
 and receiving authorization 

 0.60 ALL

 10/20/2019  correspondence with client  0.40 JDS

 10/21/2019  correspondence and communications with Stella Millis; 
 correspondence with client

 1.60 JDS

   attending to further exchange of communications with 
 Bank

 0.40 ALL

 10/23/2019  correspondence with call counsel re scheduling 
 receivership motion; reviewing initial draft of lease; 
 reviewing rate calculation sheet re Bulmer provided by Mr. 
 Lefebvre

 1.40 JDS
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 Stella Millis

 66930
 Nov 15, 2019

 80953
 Nov 15, 2019 Invoice Date:

 Invoice No.:
 Billing Through:
 Matter:

 300 Lakeshore Drive, Suite 202
 Barrie, Ontario L4N 0B4

 BDO Canada Limited

   obtain relevant authorities on quick flip transactions in 
 receivership orders;

 0.50 IJK

 10/24/2019  correspondence with bank; preparing and issuing 
 demands and NITES; correspondence with Stella Millis

 2.40 JDS

 10/25/2019  correspondence with Fred Tayar; correspondence with 
 Service List

 0.50 JDS

 10/29/2019  reviewing draft APS; correspondence with client; 
 correspondence with solicitors for Firepower

 2.50 JDS

 10/30/2019  correspondence and communications with receiver and 
 receiver's counsel; communications with borrower's 
 counsel; correspondence with client; reviewing draft lease 
 agreement

 2.40 JDS

   conference call re receivership; reporting to client  1.20 JDS

   preparing materials in support of receivership motion  2.40 JDS

   correspondence with Stella Millis re file update; 
 correspondence with client; reviewing list of purchased 
 assets; telephone discussion with Fred Tayar; 
 correspondence from Firepower; conference call with 
 counsel re file status

 3.10 JDS

 10/31/2019  correspondence with proposed service list re motion 
 scheduling; correspondence with commercial list

 0.80 JDS

   corresondence with Stella Millis re lease agreement; 
 reporting to client; coordinating new application date with
 court

 0.90 JDS

 11/5/2019  correspondence with proposed receiver and counsel; 
 reporting to client; reviewing proposed receiver's report

 2.40 JDS

   reviewing proposed receiver's draft report and confidential
 supplement; correspondence with Sam Rappos

 1.90 JDS

   review file; draft notice of application  2.00 PS

 11/6/2019  correspondence with client re draft lease; 
 correspondence with Stella Millis; reporting to client; 
 reviewing Firepower's comments re lease

 1.30 JDS

   attending to reviewing and commenting upon draft 
 Application and supporting Affidavit

 1.90 ALL

   attending to reviewing draft report and commenting upon
 same and ongoing discussions with BDO

 1.70 ALL

   review draft report and confidential report; review motion 
 material; review  law on quick flip transactions; begin 
 drafting factum; discussions with S. Millis

 3.60 IJK

   Email from and to J. Spetter; review of instructions from J. 
 Spetter; discussion with J. Spetter regarding matter; review 
 of draft lease; revisions to draft lease; discussion with J. 
 Spetter; email to B. Nelson; emails from and to J. Spetter 
 following comments on the draft Lease from J. Thrower.

 2.60 JCM

   draft Notice of Application and Affidavit  3.50 PS
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 Stella Millis

 66930
 Nov 15, 2019

 80953
 Nov 15, 2019 Invoice Date:

 Invoice No.:
 Billing Through:
 Matter:

 300 Lakeshore Drive, Suite 202
 Barrie, Ontario L4N 0B4

 BDO Canada Limited

   attend at client office to commission affidavit  1.80 PS

 11/7/2019  ongoing work relating to receivership application; 
 correspondence with various parties related to 
 application; correspondence and communications with 
 client

 4.80 JDS

   finalizing materials in support of application; drafting order;
 correspondence with client

 2.40 JDS

   continue drafting factum  2.10 IJK

   Emails from and to J. Spetter; further revisions to draft 
 Lease; emails to and from J. Thrower; further revisions to 
 draft Lease; emails from and to B. Nelson; further revisions 
 to draft lease; finalizing lease; emails related to finalizing 
 lease.

 2.70 JCM

 11/8/2019  ongoing correspondence and communications with 
 counsel re finalizing materials; serving and filing application
 record

 1.40 JDS

   correspondence with client re receivership order  0.20 JDS

   continue drafting and editing factum; prepare brief of 
 authorities; instructions re: service and filing factum on an 
 expidited basis

 4.60 IJK

 11/11/2019  call with proposed receiver  0.30 JDS

   emails with S. Rappos; review draft orders; review all 
 motion material and prepare for motion;

 3.20 IJK

 11/12/2019  attending to all correspondence with trustee and service 
 list re issued and entered Orders, serving Orders and 
 Endorsement on Service List

 0.60 JDS

   attend on motion to appoint receiver and for sale 
 approval and vesting order; attend to having orders issued
 and entered

 3.50 IJK

 $38,965.00 Our Fee:

 $5,065.45 HST on Fees:

 Summary by Provider:

 $18,675.00 450.00 41.50 JDS  Jason D. Spetter

 $8,350.00 500.00 16.70 ALL  Allan L. Lipman

 $7,000.00 400.00 17.50 IJK  Ian J. Klaiman

 $2,385.00 450.00 5.30 JCM  Jeysa Martinez

 $2,555.00 350.00 7.30 PS  Paul Siciliano

 $38,965.00 88.30 Totals:

 Disbursements - Taxable

 50.00 To issue Notice of Application Inv#34141

 42.92 Registered mail

 125.00 Printing/scanning
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 Stella Millis

 66930
 Nov 15, 2019

 80953
 Nov 15, 2019 Invoice Date:

 Invoice No.:
 Billing Through:
 Matter:

 300 Lakeshore Drive, Suite 202
 Barrie, Ontario L4N 0B4

 BDO Canada Limited

 3.48 Postage

 80.00 To file Application Record Inv#34158

 Total Taxable Disbursements  $301.40

 $39.18 HST on Disbursements:

 Disbursements - Non-Taxable

 229.00 Court Fee - Notice of Application

 $229.00 Total Non-Taxable Disbursements

 $44,600.03 Total Fees, Disbursements and HST:

 Payment of this account is due on receipt.

 NOTE:  This account bears interest from one month after delivery in accordance with the rate prescribed by Section 128 of
 the Courts of Justice.

 720773514 HST No.:

 $5,104.63 Total HST:
 Jason D. Spetter

 LIPMAN ZENER & WAXMAN PC

 Amount Due This Invoice:  $44,600.03
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This is Exhibit “B” referred to in the 

Affidavit of Jason D. Spetter sworn 

This 4th day of February, 2021 

 

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits (or as may be)* 

*virtually commissioned by Ian Klaiman (LSO #58955G),  
as per LSO Corporate Statement re COVID-19 
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lmpaynter
Ian Klaiman



SUMMARY OF ADDITIONAL INFORMATION 

REGARDING ACCOUNT OF LIPMAN, ZENER & WAXMAN PC 

DATED NOVEMBER 15, 2019 

 

LAWYER YEAR OF CALL COMMERCIAL RATE 

Jason D. Spetter 2002 $450.00 

Allan L. Lipman 1975 $500.00 

Ian J. Klaiman 2010 $400.00 

Jeysa Martinez 2007 $450.00 

Paul Siciliano 2018 $350.00 
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THE BANK OF NOVA SCOTIA      -and-    6396763 CANADA INC.  
 
 Applicant            Respondent 

              
Court File No. CV-19-00630665-00CL 

 
ONTARIO 

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 
COMMERCIAL LIST  

 
Proceeding commenced at 

 
TORONTO 

 
 

AFFIDAVIT OF JASON D. SPETTER 
  

 
LIPMAN, ZENER & WAXMAN PC 

Barristers and Solicitors 
100 Sheppard Avenue East, Suite 850 

Toronto, Ontario  M2N 6N5 
 

JASON D. SPETTER (LSO No. 46105S) 
IAN KLAIMAN (LSO No. 58955G) 

 
Tel:  (416) 789-0652 
Fax: (416) 789-9015 

Emails: jspetter@lzwlaw.com ;  
     iklaiman@lzwlaw.com  

 
Lawyers for the Applicant 
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APPENDIX H
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