






















































APPENDIX A 



Court File No, CV-13-10365-OOCL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

THE HONOURABLE MR. 	 ) 	FRIDAY, THE 20th DAY 

JUSTICE D. BROWN 	 ) 	OF DECEMBER, 2013 

BETWEEN: 

THE TORONTO -DOMINION BANK 

Applicant 

 -and - 

Respondent 

APPLICATION UNDER SUBSECTION 243(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCYAND 
INSOLVENCYACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED 

RECEIVERSHIP ORDER 

THIS APPLICATION, made by The Toronto-Dominion Bank ("TD"), for an Order, 

inter alia, pursuant to subsection 243(1) of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, R.S.C. 1985, c. 

B-3, as amended (the "BIA"), appointing BDO Canada Limited ("BDO") as receiver (in such 

capacity, the "Receiver"), without security, to exercise the powers and duties as specifically set 

out in this Order with respect to the assets, undertakings and properties of Fairview Nursing 

Home Limited (the "Debtor") acquired for, or used in relation to a business carried on by the 

Debtor, was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario; 



-2- 

ON READING the affidavit of Kenneth J. Malcolm sworn December 10, 2013 (the 

"Malcolm Affidavit"), the affidavit of Craig Mills sworn on December 19, 2013, the consent of 

the Ministry of Health and Long Term Care ("MOH"), the Toronto Central Local Health 

Integration Network ("TC LHIN") (MOH and TC LHIN, collectively referred to as "Ontario"), 

Responsive Health Management Inc.( "Responsive"), the Debtor and its shareholders, and the 

consent of BDO to act as the Receiver, and on hearing the submissions of counsel for TD, 

Responsive, Ontario, the proposed Receiver and the Debtor, no one appearing for any other 

person on the service list, although duly served as appears from the affidavit of service of 

Christine Doyle sworn December 12, 2013, filed; 

SERVICE 

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the time for service and filing of the notice of application 

and the application record is hereby abridged and validated so that this application is properly 

returnable today and hereby dispenses with further service thereof. 

APPOINTMENT 

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that pursuant to subsection 243(1) of the BIA, BDO is hereby 

appointed Receiver, without security, to exercise the powers and duties as specifically set out in 

this Order with respect to the assets, undertakings and properties of the Debtor acquired for, or 

used in relation to the business carried on by the Debtor, (collectively, the "Property"). For the 

purposes of this Order, Property shall include the Ontario Receipts with respect to the operation 

of the Home (as each term is defined in this Order), subject to the limitations set out in paragraph 

2A (b) of this Order. 

2A. THIS COURT ORDERS that, notwithstanding anything to the contrary in this Order, 

but subject to further Order of this Court, the Debtor shall remain in the possession and control 

of the Property (including the long term care home located at 14 Cross Street, Toronto, Ontario 

operated by the Debtor ( the "Home") subject to the Long-Term Care Homes Act, S.O. 2007, c.8 

(the "LTCHA" ) and Ontario shall continue to pay the Debtor and the Debtor shall be entitled to 

continue to receive such payments pursuant to the existing agreements with respect to the Home 
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between Ontario and the Debtor including the SAA, as defined below, (the "Ontario 

Agreements "), provided that nothing in this Order shall affect, restrict or impair: 

(a) the obligation of the Debtor to use or apply any monies received by 

the Debtor from Ontario for the operation of the Home in accordance with the 

terms of the Ontario Agreements ( "Ontario Receipts "); 

(b) TC LHIN's rights or entitlements to review and reconcile any 

payments made by TC LHIN to the Debtor as provided in accordance with any 

service accountability agreement between the TC LHIN and the Debtor ("SAA"), or 

MOH's rights or entitlements under any other agreement with the Debtor or Receiver, 

the LTCHA, the regulations thereunder and any other applicable law and written 

policy, subject to the terms of any further agreements between Ontario and the 

Debtor (the "Further Ontario Agreements "); 

(c) the obligation of the Debtor to continue to retain the services of a 

manager to manage the Home in accordance with section 110 of the LTCHA (the 

"Manager"); 

(d) the obligation of the Debtor and the Manager (collectively, the 

"Operator") to comply with the Ontario Agreements, any Further Ontario 

Agreements, the SAA, the LTCHA and the regulations thereunder as they apply 

to the operation of the Facility; and 

(e) any of Ontario's rights or remedies against the Operator in relation 

to any non-compliance by the Operator with the Ontario Agreements, any Further 

Ontario Agreements, the LTCHA and the regulations thereunder with respect to 

the operation of the Facility. 



RECEIVER'S POWERS 

3. 	THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is hereby expressly empowered and 

authorized to do any of the following in respect of the Property where the Receiver considers it 

necessary or desirable: 

(a) 	to engage consultants, appraisers, agents, experts, auditors, accountants, 

managers (except for a Manager as defined in this Order), real estate agents, 

counsel and such other persons from time to time and on whatever basis, 

including on a temporary basis, to assist with the exercise of the Receiver's 

powers and duties, including, without limitation, those conferred by this Order; 

(b) 	to assume the responsibilities of the Sales Process Court-Appointed 

Officer as described in the Second Forbearance Agreement defined in the 

Malcolm Affidavit including; 

(i) monitoring receipts and disbursements of the Debtor; and, 

(ii) making advances to the Debtor to fund its operations and to permit 

the contemplated repayments to TD; 

(c) 	to participate and facilitate discussions between Responsive Health 

Management Inc., the Ontario Ministry of Health and Long-Term Care and the 

Debtor with respect to ensuring adequate funding of the Debtor's business during 

the sales process; 

(d) 	to market the Property, including advertising and soliciting offers in 

respect of the Property or any part or parts thereof and negotiating such terms and 

conditions of sale as the Receiver in its discretion may deem appropriate; 

(e) 	to sell, convey, transfer, lease or assign the Property or any part or parts 

thereof (excluding any license provided by MOH for the Home's operation, unless 

authorized by MOH) out of the ordinary course of business with the approval of 

this Court and in each such case notice under subsection 63(4) of the Ontario 
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Personal Property Security Act or section 31 of the Ontario Mortgages Act, as the 

case may be, shall not be required, and in each case the Ontario Bulk Sales Act 

shall not apply; 

(f) to apply for any vesting order or other orders necessary to convey the 

Property or any part or parts thereof to a purchaser or purchasers thereof, free and 

clear of any liens or encumbrances affecting such Property; 

(g) to report to, meet with and discuss with such affected Persons (as defined 

below) as the Receiver deems appropriate on all matters relating to the Property 

and the receivership, and to share information, subject to such terms as to 

confidentiality as the Receiver deems advisable; 

(h) to register a copy of this Order and any other Orders in respect of the 

Property against title to any of the Property; 

(i) to enter into agreements with any trustee in bankruptcy appointed in 

respect of the Debtor, including, without limiting the generality of the foregoing, 

the ability to enter into occupation agreements for any property owned or leased 

by the Debtor; and, 

(j) to take any steps reasonably incidental to the exercise of these powers or 

the performance of any statutory obligations, 

and in each case where the Receiver takes any such actions or steps, it shall be exclusively 

authorized and empowered to do so, to the exclusion of all other Persons (as defined below), 

including the Debtor, and without interference from any other Person. 

DUTY TO PROVIDE ACCESS AND CO-OPERATION TO THE RECEIVER 

4. 	THIS COURT ORDERS that: (i) the Debtor; (ii) all of its current and former directors, 

officers, employees, agents, accountants, legal counsel and shareholders, and all other persons 

acting on its instructions or behalf; and (iii) all other individuals, firms, corporations, 

governmental bodies or agencies, or other entities having notice of this Order (all of the 

foregoing, collectively, being "Persons" and each being a "Person") shall forthwith advise the 



Receiver of the existence of any Property in such Person's possession or control, shall grant 

immediate and continued access to the Property to the Receiver, and shall, subject to section 110 

of the LTCHA, deliver all such Property to the Receiver upon the Receiver's request each as 

required in the discharge of the duties of the Receiver. 

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that all Persons shall forthwith advise the Receiver of the 

existence of any books, documents, securities, contracts, orders, corporate and accounting 

records, and any other papers, records and information of any kind related to the business or 

affairs of the Debtor, and any computer programs, computer tapes, computer disks, or other data 

storage media containing any such information (the foregoing, collectively, the "Records") in 

that Person's possession or control, and shall provide to the Receiver or permit the Receiver to 

make, retain and take away copies thereof and grant to the Receiver unfettered access to and use 

of accounting, computer, software and physical facilities relating thereto, each as required in the 

discharge of the duties of the Receiver, provided however that nothing in this paragraph 5 or in 

paragraph 6 of this Order shall require the delivery of Records, or the granting of access to 

Records, which may not be disclosed or provided to the Receiver due to the privilege attaching 

to solicitor-client communication or due to statutory provisions prohibiting such disclosure. 

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that if any Records are stored or otherwise contained on a 

computer or other electronic system of information storage, whether by independent service 

provider or otherwise, all Persons in possession or control of such Records shall forthwith give 

unfettered access to the Receiver for the purpose of allowing the Receiver to recover and fully 

copy all of the information contained therein whether by way of printing the information onto 

paper or making copies of computer disks or such other manner of retrieving and copying the 

information as the Receiver in its discretion deems expedient, and shall not alter, erase or destroy 

any Records without the prior written consent of the Receiver. Further, for the purposes of this 

paragraph, all Persons shall provide the Receiver with all such assistance in gaining immediate 

access to the information in the Records as the Receiver may in its discretion require including 

providing the Receiver with instructions on the use of any computer or other system and 

providing the Receiver with any and all access codes, account names and account numbers that 

may be required to gain access to the information. 
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NO PROCEEDINGS AGAINST THE RECEIVER 

7. THIS COURT ORDERS that no proceeding or enforcement process in any court or 

tribunal (each, a "Proceeding"), shall be commenced or continued against the Receiver except 

with the written consent of the Receiver or with leave of this Court. 

NO PROCEEDINGS AGAINST THE DEBTOR OR THE PROPERTY 

8. THIS COURT ORDERS that no Proceeding against or in respect of the Debtor, or the 

Property shall be commenced or continued except with the written consent of the Receiver or 

with leave of this Court and any and all Proceedings currently under way against or in respect of 

the Debtor, or the Property are hereby stayed and suspended pending further Order of this Court. 

NO EXERCISE OF RIGHTS OR REMEDIES 

9. THIS COURT ORDERS that all rights and remedies against the Debtor, the Receiver ;  

or affecting the Property, are hereby stayed and suspended except with the written consent of the 

Receiver or leave of this Court, provided however that this stay and suspension does not apply in 

respect of any "eligible financial contract" as defined in the BIA, and further provided that 

nothing in this paragraph shall: (i) empower the Receiver or the Debtor to carry on any business 

which the Debtor is not lawfully entitled to carry on; (ii) exempt the Receiver or the Debtor from 

compliance with statutory or regulatory provisions relating to health, safety or the environment; 

(iii) prevent the filing of any registration to preserve or perfect a security interest; or (iv) prevent 

the registration of a claim for lien. 

NO INTERFERENCE WITH THE RECEIVER 

10. THIS COURT ORDERS that no Person shall discontinue, fail to honour, alter, interfere 

with, repudiate, terminate or cease to perform any right, renewal right, contract, agreement, 

licence or permit in favour of or held by the Debtor, without written consent of the Receiver or 

leave of this Court. 

CONTINUATION OF SERVICES 

11. THIS COURT ORDERS that all Persons having oral or written agreements with the 



Debtor or statutory or regulatory mandates for the supply of goods and/or services, including 

without limitation, all computer software, communication and other data services, centralized 

banking services, payroll services, insurance, transportation services, utility or other services to 

the Debtor are hereby restrained until further Order of this Court from discontinuing, altering, 

interfering with or terminating the supply of such goods or services as may be required by the 

Debtor, and that the Debtor shall be entitled to the continued use of the Debtor's current 

telephone numbers, facsimile numbers, internet addresses and domain names, provided in each 

case that the normal prices or charges for all such goods or services received after the date of this 

Order are paid by the Debtor in accordance with normal payment practices of the Debtor or such 

other practices as may be agreed upon by the supplier or service provider and the Debtor, or as 

may be ordered by this Court. 

	

12. 	THIS COURT ORDERS that paragraphs eight to eleven herein shall not apply: 

(a) to Responsive in respect of its rights and remedies under the letter 

agreement dated December 18, 2013 ( "the Responsive Agreement") between the 

Debtor and Responsive provided that Responsive has provided at least sixty days 

written notice to the Receiver and TD prior to terminating its management of the 

Home; or 

(b) to Ontario in respect of the Operator's non-compliance with the SAA, the 

LTCHA or the regulations thereunder as regards to the Operator of the Home. 

RECEIVER TO HOLD FUNDS 

	

13. 	THIS COURT ORDERS that all funds, monies, cheques, instruments, and other forms 

of payments received or collected by the Receiver from and after the making of this Order, other 

than Ontario Receipts, from any source whatsoever, including, without limitation, the sale of all 

or any of the Property shall be deposited into one or more new accounts to be opened by the 

Receiver (the "Post Receivership Accounts ") and the monies standing to the credit of such Post 

Receivership Accounts from time to time, net of any disbursements provided for herein, shall be 

held by the Receiver to be paid in accordance with the terms of this Order or any further Order of 

this Court. 



S 

EMPLOYEES 

14. THIS COURT ORDERS that all employees of the Debtor shall remain the employees 

of the Debtor. The Receiver shall not be liable for any employee-related liabilities, including any 

successor employer liabilities as provided for in subsection 14.06(1.2) of the BIA, other than 

such amounts as the Receiver may specifically agree in writing to pay, or in respect of its 

obligations under subsections 81.4(5) and 81.6(3) of the BIA or under the Wage Earner 

Protection Program Act. 

PIPEDA 

15. THIS COURT ORDERS that, pursuant to clause 7(3)(c) of the Canada Personal 

Information Protection and Electronic Documents Act and any other applicable privacy 

legislation, the Receiver shall disclose personal information of identifiable individuals to 

prospective purchasers or bidders for the Property and to their advisors, but only to the extent 

desirable or required to negotiate and attempt to complete one or more sales of the Property 

(each, a "Sale"). Each prospective purchaser or bidder to whom such personal information is 

disclosed shall maintain and protect the privacy of such information and limit the use of such 

information to its evaluation of the Sale, and if it does not complete a Sale, shall return all such 

information to the Receiver, or in the alternative destroy all such information. The purchaser of 

any Property shall be entitled to continue to use the personal information provided to it, and 

related to the Property purchased, in a manner which is in all material respects identical to the 

prior use of such information by the Debtor, and shall return all other personal information to the 

Receiver, or ensure that all other personal information is destroyed. 

LIMITATION ON ENVIRONMENTAL LIABILITIES 

16. THIS COURT ORDERS that nothing herein contained shall require the Receiver to 

occupy or to take control, care, charge, possession or management (separately and/or 

collectively, "Possession") of any of the Property that might be environmentally contaminated, 

might be a pollutant or a contaminant, or might cause or contribute to a spill, discharge, release 

or deposit of a substance contrary to any federal, provincial or other law respecting the 

protection, conservation, enhancement, remediation or rehabilitation of the environment or 
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relating to the disposal of waste or other contamination including, without limitation, the 

Canadian Environmental Protection Act, the Ontario Environmental Protection Act, the Ontario 

Water Resources Act, or the Ontario Occupational Health and Safety Act and regulations 

thereunder (the "Environmental Legislation "), provided however that nothing herein shall 

exempt the Receiver from any duty to report or make disclosure imposed by applicable 

Environmental Legislation. The Receiver shall not, as a result of this Order or anything done in 

pursuance of the Receiver's duties and powers under this Order, be deemed to be in Possession 

of any of the Property within the meaning of any Environmental Legislation, unless it is actually 

in possession. 

LIMITATION ON THE RECEIVER'S LIABILITY 

17. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver shall incur no liability or obligation as a 

result of its appointment or the carrying out the provisions of this Order, save and except for any 

gross negligence or wilful misconduct on its part. Nothing in this Order shall derogate from the 

protections afforded the Receiver by section 14.06 of the BIA or by any other applicable 

legislation. 

RECEIVER'S ACCOUNTS 

18. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver and counsel to the Receiver shall be paid 

their reasonable fees and disbursements, in each case at their standard rates and charges subject 

to taxation by the Court, and that the Receiver and counsel to the Receiver shall be entitled to 

and are hereby granted a charge (the "Receiver's Charge ") on the Property, as security for such 

fees and disbursements, both before and after the making of this Order in respect of these 

proceedings, and that the Receiver's Charge shall form a first charge on the Property in priority 

to all security interests, trusts, liens, charges and encumbrances, statutory or otherwise, in favour 

of any Person, but subject to subsections 14.06(7), 81.4(4), and 81.6(2) of the BIA. 

19. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver and its legal counsel shall pass its accounts 

from time to time, and for this purpose the accounts of the Receiver and its legal counsel are 

hereby referred to a judge of the Commercial List of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice. 

20. 	THIS COURT ORDERS that prior to the passing of its accounts, the Receiver shall be 
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at liberty from time to time to apply reasonable amounts, out of the monies in its hands, against 

its fees and disbursements, including legal fees and disbursements, incurred at the normal rates 

and charges of the Receiver or its counsel, and such amounts shall constitute advances against its 

remuneration and disbursements when and as approved by this Court. 

FUNDING OF THE RECEIVERSHIP 

21. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be at liberty and it is hereby empowered to 

borrow by way of a revolving credit or otherwise, such monies from time to time as it may 

consider necessary or desirable, provided that the outstanding principal amount does not exceed 

$750,000 (or such greater amount as this Court may by further Order authorize) at any time, at 

such rate or rates of interest as it deems advisable for such period or periods of time as it may 

arrange, for the purpose of funding the exercise of the powers and duties conferred upon the 

Receiver by this Order, making advances to the Debtor to fund its operations and to make 

repayments to TD, each as contemplated in the Second Forbearance Agreement defined in the 

Malcolm Affidavit. The whole of the Property shall be and is hereby charged by way of a fixed 

and specific charge (the "Receiver's Borrowings Charge ") as security for the payment of the 

monies borrowed, together with interest and charges thereon, in priority to all security interests, 

trusts, liens, charges and encumbrances, statutory or otherwise, in favour of any Person, but 

subordinate in priority to the Receiver's Charge and all security granted by the Debtor in favour 

of TD. 

22. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is at liberty and authorized to issue 

certificates substantially in the form annexed as Schedule "A" hereto (the "Receiver's 

Certificates ") for any amount borrowed by it pursuant to this Order. 

23. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that the Debtor is authorized to grant the 

Responsive Security (the "Responsive Security") on the Effective Date (as each such term is 

defined in the Responsive Agreement) to and in favour of Responsive and that nothing in this 

Order shall prevent or limit the granting or registration of the Responsive Security. 

24. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES THAT the Responsive Security shall rank 

subordinate to the Receiver's Charge, all security granted by the Debtor in favour of TD and the 
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Receiver's Borrowing Charge. 

25. THIS COURT ORDERS that neither the Responsive Security, the Receiver's 

Borrowings Charge nor any other security granted by the Receiver in connection with its 

borrowings under this Order shall be enforced without leave of this Court and that any such 

enforcement shall be subject to section 107 of the LTCHA. 

26. THIS COURT ORDERS that the monies from time to time borrowed by the Receiver 

pursuant to this Order or any further order of this Court and any and all Receiver's Certificates 

evidencing the same or any part thereof shall rank on a pari passu basis, unless otherwise agreed 

to by the holders of any prior issued Receiver's Certificates. 

GENERAL 

27. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver may from time to time apply to this Court 

for advice and directions in the discharge of its powers and duties hereunder or the expansion of 

same.. 

28. THIS COURT ORDERS that nothing in this Order shall prevent the Receiver from 

acting as a trustee in bankruptcy of the Debtor. 

29. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal, 

regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada or in the United States to give 

effect to this Order and to assist the Receiver and its agents in carrying out the terms of this 

Order. All courts, tribunals, regulatory and administrative bodies are hereby respectfully 

requested to make such orders and to provide such assistance to the Receiver, as an officer of this 

Court, as may be necessary or desirable to give effect to this Order or to assist the Receiver and 

its agents in carrying out the terms of this Order. 

30. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver be at liberty and is hereby authorized and 

empowered to apply to any court, tribunal, regulatory or administrative body, wherever located, 

for the recognition of this Order and for assistance in carrying out the terms of this Order, and 

that the Receiver is authorized and empowered to act as a representative in respect of the within 

proceedings for the purpose of having these proceedings recognized in a jurisdiction outside 



- 13 - 

Canada. 

31. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Applicant shall have its costs of this application, up to 

and including entry and service of this Order, provided for by the terms of the Applicant's 

security or, if not so provided by the Applicant's security, then on a substantial indemnity basis 

to be paid by the Receiver from the Debtor's estate with such priority and at such time as this 

Court may determine. 

32. THIS COURT ORDERS that the E-Service Protocol of the Commercial List (the 

"Protocol") is approved and adopted by reference herein and, in this proceeding, the service of 

documents made in accordance with the Protocol (which can be found on the Commercial List 

website at http://www.ontariocourts.ca/scj/practice/practice-directions/toronto/#Commercial_List  

shall be valid and effective service. Subject to Rule 17.05[7] this Order shall constitute an order 

for substituted service pursuant to Rule 16.04 of the Rules of Civil Procedure. Subject to Rule 

3.01(d) of the Rules of Civil Procedure and paragraph 21 of the Protocol, service of documents 

in accordance with the Protocol will be effective on transmission. This Court further orders that 

a Case Website shall be established in accordance with the Protocol with the following URL: 

http ://extranets .bdo . ca/fairview/. 

33. THIS COURT ORDERS that any interested party may apply to this Court to vary or 

amend this Order on not less than seven (7) days' notice to the Receiver and to any other party 

likely to be affected by the order sought or upon such other notice, if any, as this Court may 

order. 

e r 
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SCHEDULE "A" 

RECEIVER CERTIFICATE 

CERTIFICATE NO. 

AMOUNT $ 

1. THIS IS TO CERTIFY that BDO Canada Limited, the receiver (in such capacity, the 

"Receiver") of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of Fairview Nursing Home Limited 

(the "Debtor") acquired for, or used in relation to a business carried on by the Debtor, including 

all proceeds thereof (collectively, the "Property") appointed by Order of the Ontario Superior 

Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the "Court") dated the 20th day of December, 2013 (the 

"Order") made in an action having Court file number CV-13-10365-OOCL ,has received as such 

Receiver from the holder of this certificate (the "Lender") the principal sum of $  

being part of the total principal sum of $ 	which the Receiver is authorized to 

borrow under and pursuant to the Order. 

2. The principal sum evidenced by this certificate is payable on demand by the Lender with 

interest thereon calculated and compounded [daily] [monthly not in advance on the 	day 

of each month] after the date hereof at a notional rate per annum equal to the rate of 	per 

cent above the prime commercial lending rate of The Toronto Dominion Bank 	from 

time to time. 

3. Such principal sum with interest thereon is, by the terms of the Order, together with the 

principal sums and interest thereon of all other certificates issued by the Receiver pursuant to the 

Order or to any further order of the Court, a charge upon the whole of the Property (as defined in 

the Order), in priority to the security interests of any other person, but subject to the priority of 

the charges set out in the Order and in the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, and the right of the 

Receiver to indemnify itself out of such Property in respect of its remuneration and expenses. 

4. All sums payable in respect of principal and interest under this certificate are payable at 

the main office of the Lender at Toronto, Ontario. 

5. Until all liability in respect of this certificate has been terminated, no certificates creating 
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charges ranking or purporting to rank in priority to this certificate shall be issued by the Receiver 

to any person other than the holder of this certificate without the prior written consent of the 

holder of this certificate. 

6. The charge securing this certificate shall operate so as to permit the Receiver to deal with 

the Property (as defined in the Order) as authorized by the Order and as authorized by any 

further or other order of the Court. 

7. The Receiver does not undertake, and it is not under any personal liability, to pay any 

sum in respect of which it may issue certificates under the terms of the Order. 

DATED the 	day of 	 , 2014. 

BDO CANADA LIMITED, solely in its capacity 
as Receiver of the Property (as defined in the 
Order), and not in its personal capacity 

Per: 
Name: 
Title: 

15180971.8 
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Ministry of Health 
and Long-Term Care 

AssIstant Oeputy Minister 
Health System Aecountability 
and Performance Division 

5th Floor, Hepburn Block 
Queen's Park 
Toronto ON M7A 1R3 

Telephone: (416) 212·1134 
Facsimile: (416) 212-1859 

Ms. Lisa Chambers 
Secretary-Treasurer 

Ministere de la Sante 
et des Soins de longue duree 

Sous-mlnistre adjoint 
DivisIon de 101 responsabllisation et de 103 
performance du syst~me de sant~ 

EdHice Hepbum, 5·~tage 
Queen's Piltk 
Toronto ON M7A 1R3 

nl~phone: (416) 212·1134 
T~h~copieur : {41S} 212-1859 

Fairview Nursing Home Limited 
14 Cross Street 
Toronto ON M6J 1S8 

Dear Ms. Chambers: 

!'~ 

t?Ontario 

HL TC2980lT -2014-160 

I am responding to your letter on behalf of Fairview Nursing Home Limited (Fairview) dated January 13, 
2014, addressed to Nancy Lytle and Michael Orr at the Ministry of Health and Long-Term Care (the 
ministry). 

Pursuant to Fairview's request, and with the concurrence of the Toronto Central Local Health 
Integration Network (TC LHIN), the ministry agrees to the deferral of the collection of all Reconciliation 
Amounts payable by Fairview in respect of Fairview Nursing Home (the "Home") from January 30, 2014 
until the earlier of the date of the transfer of the licence of the Home and June 15, 2015, subject to the 
terms and conditions set out below. The purpose of this deferral agreement is to enable Fairview to 
continue operating the Home as steps are taken by the court- appointed Receiver, BDO Canada 
Limited, to sell and transfer the "Property" of Fairview in respect of the Home, (as defined in the 
Receivership Order dated December 20, 2013, including the licence of the Home) with all applicable 
approvals, to an eligible person, to be completed by June 15, 2015. 

For the purpose of this deferral agreement, "Reconciliation Amounts" include all amounts repayable by 
Fairview (as of January 30, 2014 or at any time thereafter in respect of the period prior to the date of 
the transfer of Fairview's licence) pursuant to Ontario Regulation 79/10, s. 243, under the Long-Term 
Care Homes Act, 2007, (L TCHA), pursuant to Ontario Regulation 264/07, s. 3, under the Local Health 
System Integration Act, 2006 or pursuant to any applicable agreement between Fairview and the 
ministry or the TC LHIN. 

The terms and conditions of the deferral agreement set out in this letter are as follows: 

1. Unless the ministry agrees otherwise in writing, the deferral agreement shall cease to be effective 
immediately upon any of the following taking place: 
a) the termination of the "Forebearance Period" under the "Second Forbearance Agreement", 

dated December 5, 2013, included with your letter of January 13, 2014, 
b) Fairview ceases to operate the Home as a long-term care home, or 
c) Responsive Health Management Inc. ceases to manage the Home on behalf of Fairview . 

.. .12 
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Ms. Usa Chambers 

2. Upon the deferral ceasing to be effective under paragmph 1, all Reconciliation Amounts then 
repayable by Fairview shall become payable by Fairview as If there had been no deferral. 

3. It shall be a condition of any transfer of the licence of the Home that any Reconciliation 
Amount not paid by Fairview before the date of the tmnsfer of the licence shall be paid out of 
the proceeds of the sale of the Property, and/or that the approved tmnsferee of the licence agrees 
in a manner and form satisfactory to the Director under Part VII of the L TCHA to repay all or the 
remainder of the Reconciliation Amounts. 

4. Fairview shall continue to comply with all applicable financial reporting requirements. 

This agreement to the deferral of the Reconciliation Amounts is not effective unless it is endorsed 
below on behalf of both the TC LHIN and Fairview. 

Sincerely, 

Kathryn Mc och 

(
1/' Interim Assistant Deputy Minister 

c. BOO Canada Limited 

The Toronto Central Local Health Integmtion Network (TC LHIN) concurs In the agreement to the 
deferral of the Reconciliation Amounts subject to the terms and conditions above. 

Signed: __________ _ 

Name: __________________________ _ 

TC LHIN Chief Executive Officer 

Fairview Nursing Home Limited agrees to the terms and conditions set out above 

Signed: Q C'illo -
Name: It£,~ Q 0-<.-1 .. Q' 5' 

Title: ~ ¥ •. t .... . Sf" e.Jc..zf 
(I have authority to bind Fairview Nursing Home Limited) 
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Ms. Lisa Chambers 

2. Upon the deferral ceasing to be effective under paragraph 1, all Reconciliation Amounts then 
repayable by Fairview shall become payable by Fairview as if there had been no deferral. 

3. It shall be a condition of any transfer of the licence of the Home that any Reconciliation 
Amount not paid by Fairview before the date of the transfer of the licence shall be paid out of 
the proceeds of the sale of the Property, and/or that the approved transferee of the licence agrees 
in a manner and form satisfactory to the Director under Part VII of the L TCHA to repay all or the 
remainder of the Reconciliation Amounts. 

4. Fairview shall continue to comply with all applicable financial reporting requirements. 

This agreement to the deferral of the Reconciliation Amounts is not effective unless it is endorsed 
below on behalf of both the TC LHIN and Fairview. 

Sincerely, 

Kathryn McCUlloch 
Interim Assistant Deputy Minister 

c. BOO Canada Limited 

The Toronto Central Local Health Integration Network (TC LHIN) concurs in the agreement to the 
deferral of the Reconciliation Amounts subject to the terms and conditions above. 

Signed: _"1---"-(4J--'l\----_T-__ _ 
Name: __ ~-"-'d,c.:...rJ'_'__'_, '-'-tc----"5:.:...~"--'eL"-'-'I_'_'\,q---'-"I.5::.· 
TC LHIN Chief Executive Officer 

Fairview Nursing Home Limited agrees to the terms and conditions set out above 

Signed: ____________ _ 

Name: __________ _ 

Title: __________ _ 

(I have authority to bind Fairview Nursing Home Limited) 
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Court File No. CV-11-9321-00CL
Estate # 31-457615

RECEIPTS:
Actual Projected Variance

MOHLTC funding 2,581,405        2,554,363        27,042            
Resident co-payments & misc. 993,597           780,000           213,597           
TOTAL RECEIPTS 3,575,002$      3,334,363$      240,639$         

DISBURSEMENTS:
Actual Projected Variance

Employee source deductions 544,530           529,000           15,530            
Property taxes 87,480            94,000            (6,520)             
Accounts payable 1,198,100        1,184,300        13,800            
Forbearance fee & bank charges 2,999              50,000            (47,001)           
Payroll 1,493,382        1,500,000        (6,618)             
Responsive management fee 109,384           180,000           (70,616)           
Sales costs & capital expenditures 19,725            20,000            (275)                
Loan & interest payments 62,025            62,000            25                   
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 3,517,625$      3,619,300$      (101,675)$        

CUMULATIVE CASH-FLOW:
Actual Projected Variance

Total receipts 3,575,002        3,334,363        240,639           
Total disbursements 3,517,625        3,619,300        (101,675)          
NET CASH-FLOW 57,377$           (284,937)$        342,314$         

of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario

Summary of the Actual Cash-flow as Compared to the Projected Cash-flow Statement
For the Period of December 22, 2013 to June 21, 2014

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

(COMMERCIAL LIST)

IN THE MATTER OF THE RECEIVERSHIP OF
FAIRVIEW NURSING HOME LIMITED
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RUN DATE; 2014/09/12 
ID ; 20140912092520.53 

PROVINCE OF ONTARIO 
MINISTRY OF GOVER1\JMENT SERVICES 

PERSONAL PROPERTY SECURITY REGISTRATION SYSTE1'1 
ENQUIRY RESPONSE 

CERTIFICf..TE 

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT A SEARCH HAS BEEN 1'1ADE IN THE Rr;CORDS OF ~HE CEN~RAL OFFICE 
OF THE PERSONAL ?ROPERTY SECURITY REGISTRATION SYSTEM IN RESPECT OF THE FOLLOWING: 

TYPE OF SEARCH : BUSINESS DEBTOR 

SEARCH CONDUCTED ON FAIRVIEW NURSING HOME LIMITED 

FILS CURR.ENCY 11GEP 2014 
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RUN NlJl'1BE? 255 
RUN DATE: 2014/09/12 
1D : 20140912092520.53 

TY?E OF SEARCH 
SEARCH CONDUCTED ON 
FILE CURRENCY 

BUSINESS DEBTOR 

PROVINCE OF ONTARIO 
MINISTRY OF GOVERNlI1EtTT SERVICES 

PERSONAL PROPERTY SECURITY REGISTRATION SYSTEM 
ENQUIRY RESPONSE 

CERTIPICA':'S 

FAIRVIEW NURSING HOME LIHITED 
11SEP 2014 

INFORHATION RELATING TO THE REGISTRATIONS LISTED BELOW IS ATTACHED HERETO. 

FILE NUMBER REGISTRATION NUMBER REGISTRATION NUMBER RBGISTRATION NUMBER REGISTRATION NUl\l[BER 

694028268 20140226 1650 1590 7492 
680825736 20120820 1946 1531 9860 
673725609 20111018 1639 1902 5961 
663051798 20100719 1517 1793 7932 
663053022 20100719 1537 1793 7936 
662748912 20100707 1554 2639 0140 
850832199 19990507 1819 1531 5365 20040429 1457 1530 8870 20090325 1456 1530 2827 
9070617A5 70617A 

10 REGISTRATION(S) ARE REPORTED IN THIS ENQUIRY RESPONSE. 
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PARCEL REGISTER (ABBREVIATED) FOR PROPERTY IDENTIFIER   

LAND   PAGE 1 OF 2

REGISTRY   PREPARED FOR MichaelLay

OFFICE #66 21296−0399 (LT)  ON 2014/09/12 AT 09:14:44

  * CERTIFIED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE LAND TITLES ACT * SUBJECT TO RESERVATIONS IN CROWN GRANT * 

 

 

PROPERTY DESCRIPTION: LT 7−8 PL 366 CITY WEST; PT LT 9 PL 366 CITY WEST; PT LANE PL 366 CITY WEST CLOSED BY CT526323, PT 3, 4, 6, 63R2391; PT LT 17−18 PL 1051 TORONTO PT 1,
 63R2391; S/T CT500560E, CT526917E; CITY OF TORONTO

PROPERTY REMARKS:  

ESTATE/QUALIFIER: RECENTLY: PIN CREATION DATE:
FEE SIMPLE
LT CONVERSION QUALIFIED

FIRST CONVERSION FROM BOOK 2003/03/24

OWNERS’ NAMES CAPACITY SHARE
FAIRVIEW NURSING HOME LIMITED BENO  

  
REG. NUM.

  
DATE

  
INSTRUMENT TYPE

  
AMOUNT

  
PARTIES FROM

  
PARTIES TO

 CERT/
CHKD

**  PRINTOUT INCLUDES ALL DOCUMENT TYPES AND DELETED INSTRUMENTS SINCE:  2003/03/21  **        
        

**SUBJECT,  ON FIRST REGISTRATION UNDER THE LAND TITLES  ACT,  TO:           
        

**          SUBSECTION 44(1)  OF THE LAND TITLES  ACT,  EXCEPT PARAGRAPH 11,  PARAGRAPH 14,  PROVINCIAL SUCCESSION DUTIES  *        
        

**          AND ESCHEATS OR FORFEITURE TO THE CROWN.          
        

**          THE RIGHTS OF ANY PERSON WHO WOULD, BUT FOR THE LAND TITLES  ACT,  BE ENTITLED TO THE LAND OR ANY PART OF        
        

**          IT  THROUGH LENGTH OF ADVERSE POSSESSION, PRESCRIPTION, MISDESCRIPTION OR BOUNDARIES SETTLED BY          
        

**          CONVENTION.          
        

**          ANY LEASE TO WHICH THE SUBSECTION 70(2)  OF THE REGISTRY ACT APPLIES.          
        

**DATE  OF CONVERSION TO LAND TITLES:  2003/03/24  **        
        

63R2363 1981/06/19 PLAN REFERENCE   C

        
63R2391 1981/07/30 PLAN REFERENCE   C

        
CT500560 1981/09/29 TRANSFER $1  FAIRVIEW NURSING HOME LIMITED C

        
CT500560E 1981/09/29 TRANSFER EASEMENT  THE CORPORATION OF THE CITY OF TORONTO C

        
CT526917 1982/04/07 TRANSFER $1  FAIRVIEW NURSING HOME LIMITED C

        
CT526917E 1982/04/07 TRANSFER EASEMENT  THE CORPORATION OF THE CITY OF TORONTO C

        
CT554379 1982/10/13 AGREEMENT  THE CORP. OF THE CITY OF TORONTO C
        REMARKS: DEVELOPMENT       

        
CT602855 1983/06/29 AGREEMENT  THE CORP. OF THE CITY OF TORONTO C
        REMARKS: AMENDING, CT554379        

                 NOTE: ADJOINING PROPERTIES SHOULD BE INVESTIGATED TO ASCERTAIN DESCRIPTIVE INCONSISTENCIES, IF ANY, WITH DESCRIPTION REPRESENTED FOR THIS PROPERTY.
                 NOTE: ENSURE THAT YOUR PRINTOUT STATES THE TOTAL NUMBER OF PAGES AND THAT YOU HAVE PICKED THEM ALL UP.
                 



  

 

 

PARCEL REGISTER (ABBREVIATED) FOR PROPERTY IDENTIFIER   

LAND   PAGE 2 OF 2

REGISTRY   PREPARED FOR MichaelLay

OFFICE #66 21296−0399 (LT)  ON 2014/09/12 AT 09:14:44

  * CERTIFIED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE LAND TITLES ACT * SUBJECT TO RESERVATIONS IN CROWN GRANT * 

  
REG. NUM.

  
DATE

  
INSTRUMENT TYPE

  
AMOUNT

  
PARTIES FROM

  
PARTIES TO

 CERT/
CHKD

        
CT802464 1986/07/21 NOTICE   C
        REMARKS: RIGHT OF FIRST REFUSAL        

        
CT837982 1986/12/19 ASSIGNMENT GENERAL   C
        REMARKS: RIGHT OF FIRST REFUSAL        

        
CT994474 1988/12/01 CHARGE *** COMPLETELY DELETED ***   
    THE TORONTO DOMINION BANK  

        
AT2450748 2010/07/19 CHARGE $1,500,000 FAIRVIEW NURSING HOME LIMITED THE TORONTO−DOMINION BANK C

        
AT2450749 2010/07/19 NO ASSGN RENT GEN FAIRVIEW NURSING HOME LIMITED THE TORONTO−DOMINION BANK C
        REMARKS: AT2450748        

        
AT3120276 2012/09/05 DISCH OF CHARGE *** COMPLETELY DELETED ***   
   THE TORONTO DOMINION BANK   
        REMARKS: CT994474.        

        
AT3487149 2013/12/24 APL COURT ORDER ONTARIO SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE (COMMERCIAL LIST) BDO CANADA LIMITED C

        
AT3527775 2014/02/26 CHARGE $800,000 FAIRVIEW NURSING HOME LIMITED RESPONSIVE HEALTH MANAGEMENT INC. C

                 NOTE: ADJOINING PROPERTIES SHOULD BE INVESTIGATED TO ASCERTAIN DESCRIPTIVE INCONSISTENCIES, IF ANY, WITH DESCRIPTION REPRESENTED FOR THIS PROPERTY.
                 NOTE: ENSURE THAT YOUR PRINTOUT STATES THE TOTAL NUMBER OF PAGES AND THAT YOU HAVE PICKED THEM ALL UP.
                 



APPENDIX F 



RECEIPTS

1. Received from:

a) Advances under Receiver's Certificates Note B
499,160.25$       

b) Fairview Nursing Home Limited 30,098.18           529,258.43$       

2. Bank interest earned 23.34                 

3. Realization of assets: Deposit on en bloc  sale Note C
150,000.00         

Total Receipts 679,281.77         

DISBURSEMENTS

4. Consulting fees - Environmental consultant 32,525.00           

5. Professional fees and disbursements

a) Receiver 66,545.41           

b) Legal counsel to the Receiver 48,600.10           115,145.51         

6. Miscellaneous:

a) HST paid on disbursements 19,180.92           

7. Distribution to the Toronto-Dominion Bank Note D
358,000.00         

Total Disbursements 524,851.43         

NET RECEIPTS OVER DISBURSEMENTS 154,430.34$       

(COMMERCIAL LIST)

IN THE MATTER OF THE RECEIVERSHIP OF

FAIRVIEW NURSING HOME LIMITED

of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario

Court File No. CV-11-9321-00CL

Estate # 31-457615

ONTARIO

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

RECEIVER'S INTERIM STATEMENT OF RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS

AS AT SEPTEMBER 12, 2014

Page 1 of  2 



(COMMERCIAL LIST)

IN THE MATTER OF THE RECEIVERSHIP OF

FAIRVIEW NURSING HOME LIMITED

of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario

ONTARIO

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

(A)

(B)

(C)

(D)

The Receiver's counsel, Gowling Lafleur Henderson LLP, is currently holding in trust $150,000,
representing the deposits paid by Schlegel Villages Inc. in connection with its Agreement of
Purchase and Sale, dated July 22, 2014, as amended.

Pursuant to the Second Forbearance Agreement, a $358,000 distribution was made to The
Toronto-Dominion Bank.

Defined terms used in this interim statement of receipts and disbursements, and not otherwise
defined have the meaning ascribed to them in the First Report of BDO Canada Limited, in its
Capacity as Court-appointed Receiver of Fairview Nursing Home Limited, dated September 15,
2014.

Pursuant to Paragraph 21 of the Receivership Order, the Receiver is empowered to borrow, by
way of revolving credit or otherwise, such monies for the purpose of funding the exercise of its
powers under the Receivership Order, making advances to Fairview to fund its operations, and to
make payments to the Bank, as contemplated in the Second Forbearance Agreement, provided
the outstanding principal amount does not exceed $750,000. The Receiver received principal
sums of $358,000 and $141,160.25 from the Herbert Estate and then issued to the Herbert Estate
Receiver's Certificate No. 001 and 002, respectively. Of those amounts, $358,000 was distributed
to the Toronto-Dominion Bank, $100,000 was used for payment of the Receiver's fees and
disbursements (including its legal fees), and $41,160.25 was used in relation to the expenditures
incurred by the Receiver in connection with the environmental site assessments and other work
performed by Pinchin.

Notes:

Page 2 of  2 
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 Tel:  905 508 0080 
Fax:  905 508 0012 
 
www.bdo.ca 

BDO Canada Limited 
45 Vogell Road  
Suite 300 
Richmond Hill, ON L4B 3P6  Canada 

 

BDO Canada Limited is an affiliate of BDO Canada LLP. BDO Canada LLP, a Canadian limited liability partnership, is a member of BDO International 
Limited, a UK company limited by guarantee, and forms part of the international BDO network of independent member firms. 

INVOICE 
 
 
Fairview Nursing Home Limited 
14 Cross Street 
Toronto, ON 
M6J 1S8 
 
Attention: Lisa Chambers 

Vice President, Treasurer-Secretary 
 
 

Invoice Date Invoice No. 

28 May 2014 87818723 
 
 
Re: Fairview Nursing Home Limited (“Fairview”) - Receivership 
 
TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered in acting as Court-appointed receiver of Fairview Nursing 
Home Limited, for the period from 4 December 2013 to 31 March 2014, as per detailed time records 
attached: 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  

OUR FEES IN ALL 63,888.50$   

DISBURSEMENTS:

Administrative Disbursement Charge (4%) 2,555.54       

Travel 101.37          

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS 66,545.41     

HARMONIZED SALES TAX (13.00%) - R101518124 8,650.90       

BALANCE DUE 75,196.31$   

Professional Hours

Average 

Hourly Rate Amount

Matthew E. Lem, Partner 36.00  $     510.00 18,360.00$   

Robyn White, Senior Manager 7.60  $     410.00 3,116.00       

Darren Griffiths, Manager 129.30  $     325.00 42,022.50     

Nicole Sagolili, Manager 1.20  $     325.00           390.00 

Total 174.10 63,888.50$   

SUMMARY OF TIME CHARGES BY PROFESSIONAL:



 
  Invoice Number: 87818723 

 
2 

DETAILED SUMMARY OF TIME: 
 

Date Professional Description of Work Hours 

4-Dec-13 Lem, M. Attend to correspondence received on file; call to C. Prophet 
at Gowlings. 

0.10 

5-Dec-13 Lem, M. Review and provide comments on draft Order. 0.30 

5-Dec-13 White, R. Review draft Order; email M. Lem re: K. Malcolm Affidavit. 0.20 

9-Dec-13 Lem, M. Discussion with C. Prophet re: engagement. 0.10 

10-Dec-13 Lem, M. Call with C. Prophet and F; Lamie of Gowlings re: 
engagement. 

0.30 

11-Dec-13 Lem, M. Call with CBRE re: submitting a proposal to sell business; 
discussion with J. Dietrich re: sale process; discussion with S. 
Mitra re: draft Order; discussion with F. Lamie re: same. 

0.60 

12-Dec-13 Lem, M. Attend to call from J. Marin. 0.30 

12-Dec-13 Sagolili, N. Discussions with M. Lem re: sale process; call with S. Jensen 
(Jensen Realty) re: proposal to sell. 

0.20 

13-Dec-13 Lem, M. Attend to various correspondence re: application for the 
appointment of a receiver. 

0.20 

16-Dec-13 White, R. Review and amend list of requested documents; review 
emails. 

1.10 

16-Dec-13 Lem, M. Review correspondence received; preparation of list of 
information required; discussion with R. White re: same; 
email to counsel for Estate, Fairview and TD Bank. 

1.10 

17-Dec-13 Lem, M. Discussion with C. Prophet re: proposed changes to Order; 
attend to various correspondence received; discussion with 
D. Griffiths re: engagement; update discussion with F. Lamie 
re: conference call with counsels, including MOH, TD, the 
Fairview and the Estate. 

0.80 

17-Dec-13 Griffiths, D. Discussion with M. Lem re: file and next steps; review of 
Application Record and related correspondence; overview of 
cash flow reporting materials; attend to arrangements for a 
meeting with Responsive re: monitoring; contact realtor (J. 
Jensen) to discuss pending listing proposal and associated 
information requirements. 

2.00 



 
  Invoice Number: 87818723 
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Date Professional Description of Work Hours 

18-Dec-13 Griffiths, D. Communications with R. White in connection with scheduling 
of meeting and financial reporting materials; receive update 
from counsel in connection with adjournment of court 
hearing; review of proposed amendments to Receivership 
Order and e-mail exchanges pertaining to Responsive 
termination issue; review CBRE listing proposal; call with J. 
Jensen to determine availability for site tour; review 
application of E-Service Protocol compliance requirements 
for this proceeding. 

1.00 

18-Dec-13 Lem, M. Review revised Order; discussion with C. Prophet and F. 
Lamie re: same; discussion with D. Griffiths re: Jensen; 
correspondence with J. Marin; review correspondence from 
CBRE; call to Fairview re: coordination of site visit; 
coordination of Case Website as per E-Service Protocol. 

1.10 

19-Dec-13 Lem, M. Review correspondence received re: Order and appraisal. 0.30 

19-Dec-13 Griffiths, D. Communications with R. White in connection with Fairview 
monthly reporting and overview of historical financial 
information supplied; review proposed revisions to 
Receivership Order; coordinate site attendance with J. 
Jensen and supply October LTCH payment calculation. 

1.00 

20-Dec-13 Griffiths, D. Receipt and review of Receivership Order and coordinate 
upload to BDO extranet site; address E-Service Protocol 
compliance with S. Mitra; coordinate obtaining current 
financial information including creditors listing and mailing 
addresses; attend Fairview with M. Lem and tour facility; 
subsequent meeting to discuss next steps. 

3.00 

20-Dec-13 White, R. Emails to and from D. Griffiths re: accounts payable list; 
email F. Lin. 

0.20 

20-Dec-13 Lem, M. Attend Fairview; meet with P. Gauci, together with D. 
Griffiths to tour facility; discussion with E. Cuttini; attend to 
call from S. Mitra. 

2.00 

23-Dec-13 Lem, M. Review file issues with D. Griffiths re: case website, sale 
process and monitoring; correspondence with J. Marin and F. 
Lamie re: S. 245 Notice and other. 

0.20 

23-Dec-13 White, R. Review and respond to emails form D. Griffiths re: Receiver's 
report and creditors list. 

0.10 



 
  Invoice Number: 87818723 
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Date Professional Description of Work Hours 

23-Dec-13 Griffiths, D. Meetings with M. Lem to discuss file status and next steps; 
draft e-mail to Fairview’s counsel re: following up on listing 
information requirements, disbursement stay provisions, and 
logistics of creditor/employee/resident notification; review 
of financial information supplied by Fairview’s bookkeeper; 
coordinate creditor mailing; follow up with J. Jensen in 
connection with rescheduling of site visit and supply 
December LTC payment calculation; attend to Case website 
content issues as per Order and E-Service Protocol; related 
communications with counsel (F. Lamie) to obtain requisite 
documents and address E-Service list keeper; coordinate 
registration of receivership appointment Order on title to the 
real property. 

8.00 

24-Dec-13 Griffiths, D. Attend to Case website; communications with counsel (F. 
Lamie) and M. Lem re: same. 

3.50 

24-Dec-13 Lem, M. Finalize and forward update to counsels for stakeholders; 
discussions with D. Griffiths re: Case website. 

0.50 

30-Dec-13 Lem, M. Review and adjust s. 245 notice; attend to correspondence 
with J. Marin re: same. 

0.50 

30-Dec-13 Griffiths, D. Draft Notice and Statement of Receiver; related meetings 
with M. Lem to discuss content and comments supplied by 
Fairview’s counsel; compile Service List addresses and 
coordinate mailing; fax to OSB; coordinate update to Case 
website. 

3.50 

2-Jan-14 Lem, M. Follow-up with J. Marin re: outstanding information; 
discussion with D. Griffiths re: OR issue on Receiver's Notice. 

0.20 

2-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Review file materials supplied by M. Lem; call with OSB to 
discuss s.245 vs. s.246 reporting requirements; call with R. 
White to discuss file status and next steps. 

1.00 

2-Jan-14 White, R. Review appointing Order and supporting documents; review 
December Render Report; review emails; review Notice of 
Receiver; telephone discussion with D. Griffiths re: Render 
Report and cash-flow. 

0.70 

3-Jan-14 White, R. Discuss administration with M. Lem; review Responsive 
Agreement with Fairview; telephone call with D. Griffiths. 

0.50 

3-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Coordinate upload of Notice of Receiver to Case website; call 
with R. White to discuss December Render Report; 
communications with J. Jensen in connection with Fairview 
site attendance and underlying land value; coordinate 
meeting with J. Jensen and M. Lem at BDO Hamilton office. 

1.20 

3-Jan-14 Lem, M. Review web page posting for case website; discussions with 
D. Griffiths re: same. 

0.50 
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Date Professional Description of Work Hours 

6-Jan-14 White, R. Telephone call with B. Saleh (Responsive) re: information 
required by Receiver for sales process and for monitoring 
cash flows. 

0.50 

6-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Confirm meeting arrangements with J. Jensen and receive 
update on site attendance; overview of current financial 
information received via Responsive’s counsel. 

0.40 

6-Jan-14 Lem, M. Discussion with J. Dietrich; attend to various correspondence 
from J. Marin re: MOH call; discussion with J. Marin re: 
same; review information received from J. Marin and other. 

0.60 

7-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Review Phase I ESA report and Baseline Property Assessment 
report completed by Pinchin Environmental; contact Pinchin 
and AMEC to request Phase II ESA proposals; related call with 
Pinchin to discuss and obtain consent to release Phase I ESA 
report; supply Phase I ESA to J. Jensen and call to discuss; 
update M. Lem and address further inquiries with Pinchin 
(Phase II ESA turnaround time); review Fairview 
compliance/clinical highlight report; call with R. White to 
discuss status of information to be supplied by Responsive. 

1.50 

7-Jan-14 White, R. Telephone calls and emails with B. Saleh re: back up for 
liability to Ministry of Health; review spreadsheets related to 
same and discuss with B. Saleh; telephone calls with M. Lem 
re: status of information requested for sale process. 

1.20 

7-Jan-14 Lem, M. Review of Phase I ESA information received from J. Dietrich; 
call with C. Prophet re: issues and MOH call; call with J. 
Marin and other stakeholders; conference call with MOH. 

0.80 

8-Jan-14 Lem, M. Review documents and proposal from Pinchin; attend to 
various correspondence re: information requested and 
potential sale. 

0.40 

8-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Further communications with Pinchin in connection with 
Phase II ESA quote, turnaround time, and GPR survey; receipt 
and review of finalized Pinchin reports including Asbestos 
Assessment; communications with AMEC to obtain second 
Phase II ESA quote; receipt and review of Pinchin cost 
estimate; related updates to M. Lem; review requested 
information received from Fairview and Responsive. 

3.00 

9-Jan-14 Lem, M. Review of Phase II ESA proposals; discussions with D. Griffiths 
re: same and sale process issues; call to J. Marin; review 
draft letter to MOH; provide comments and discussion with 
C. Prophet re: same; draft email to stakeholders re: Phase I 
ESA and Phase II ESA proposals. 

1.30 
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Date Professional Description of Work Hours 

9-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Review AMEC Phase II ESA proposal and compare to Pinchin 
proposal; various communications with AMEC and Pinchin in 
connection with scope of work and cost estimates outlined in 
proposals; related communications with M. Lem and 
summarize AMEC vs. Pinchin proposals and associated cost 
estimates; further review of information supplied by 
Responsive and compare to Jensen list of information 
requirements; coordinate provision of information to 
Jensens; call with J. Jensen to discuss information received 
from Responsive to date and next steps; review draft letter 
to MOH regarding clawback deferral. 

5.50 

10-Jan-14 Lem, M. Discussion with J. Marin; finalize and send email re: Phase I 
and II ESA; discussion with S. Mitra re: same. 

0.50 

10-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Coordinate provision of information to Jensens; 
communications with J. Jensen/S. Jensen re: same; receive 
further information from Responsive and further coordinate 
providing same to Jensens; review updated schedule of 
information requirements; review correspondence pertaining 
to Phase II ESA. 

2.30 

13-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Follow up with Responsive regarding survey; meet with  
Jensens to discuss marketing strategy and related issues; 
address subsequent inquiries and supply site particulars 
obtained from appraisals; call with OSB to discuss s.246 
reporting requirement; communications with Pinchin in 
connection with Phase II ESA and timing of EM/GPR survey; 
supply Pinchin with requested site particulars and address 
snow removal issue; coordinate execution of amended 
Pinchin contract and issue; notify AMEC regarding proposal; 
related updates to M. Lem. 

4.00 

13-Jan-14 Lem, M. Attend meeting with Jensens re: proposal to sell; discussion 
with J. Dietrich re: Phase II ESA commencement and sale; 
attend to correspondence; discussions with D. Griffiths and 
execution of agreement re: Phase II ESA. 

1.80 

14-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Call with B. Saleh (Responsive) to discuss status of 
information requirements including 2014 budget and survey 
requested by J. Jensen; coordinate Jensen site tour with P. 
Gauci (Responsive) and receive update in connection with 
employee/resident sale notification; further communications 
with Pamela in connection with Phase II ESA and site 
accessibility for GPR survey; related communications with 
Pinchin to coordinate advance attendance by surveyor to 
assess GPR survey area; overview of additional materials 
supplied by Responsive and coordinate providing same to 
Jensens; related notification to J. Jensen; update M. Lem on 
various matters. 

2.00 

14-Jan-14 White, R. Review and respond to correspondence received. 0.20 
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Date Professional Description of Work Hours 

15-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Receive update from Pinchin in connection with site 
accessibility for GPR survey; call with J. Jensen to discuss 
listing proposal concerns; address Jensen request for 
authorization to communicate with E. Cuttini (Responsive) 
and TD confirmation regarding survey and CMHC insurance 
with M. Lem; further communications with Jensen. 

0.50 

16-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Confirm with Responsive attendance by S. Jensen; 
subsequent call with S. Jensen to discuss site attendance and 
status of listing proposal; related update to M. Lem and 
receive update in connection with survey and CMHC; receive 
update from R. White in connection with timing of financial 
information to be supplied by Responsive. 

0.50 

17-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Receipt and review of January 2014 Render Report and call 
with R. White to discuss; receive update in connection with 
financial information to be supplied by Responsive; follow up 
with Pinchin on status of GPR survey and receive update; call 
with J. Jensen to discuss status of listing proposal; related 
updates to M. Lem. 

0.70 

17-Jan-14 White, R. Telephone call with D. Griffiths re: Render Report and 
monitoring cash-flow. 

0.20 

17-Jan-14 Lem, M. Review correspondence from Pinchin re: GPR survey results; 
update to key stakeholders on Pinchin's initial findings. 

0.20 

20-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Review listing proposal/agreement supplied by J. Jensen and 
report to M. Lem; related communications with J. Jensen to 
clarify proposal terms; draft e-mail to stakeholder's counsel 
summarizing Jensen/CBRE listing proposals; related review 
of CBRE listing proposal; receive update from Pinchin in 
connection with GPR survey; supply January 2014 LTC 
payment calculation to Jensen; communications with R. 
White in connection with monitoring information 
requirements. 

4.50 

20-Jan-14 Lem, M. Discussion with D. Griffiths re: status of GPR results review, 
monitoring and proposal from Jensens; discussion with R. 
White re: potential purchasers and monitoring; attend to 
correspondence from E. Cuttini; discussion with J. Jensen re: 
same; call to M. Burnett of CBRE; review and adjust update 
to counsel to stakeholders. 

1.50 

21-Jan-14 Lem, M. Update of status of GPR survey; advise counsel for 
stakeholders; call to CBRE; email to counsel for stakeholders 
on listing proposals. 

0.30 
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Date Professional Description of Work Hours 

21-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Receive update from Pinchin in connection with GPR survey 
preliminary results; related update to M. Lem and J. Jensen; 
call with J. Jensen to discuss status of pending listing; 
receipt and overview of financial information supplied by 
Responsive (December bank statements, cheque stubs, and 
January 2014 Render Report); review M. Lem's update to 
Stakeholder's counsel in connection with Jensen/CBRE listing 
proposals. 

1.00 

22-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Discuss Jensen/cooperating broker commission structure 
with M. Lem; detailed review of file materials in connection 
with cash flow monitoring. 

6.00 

22-Jan-14 White, R. Detailed email to L. Cormack of Leisure World re: possible 
interest in assets. 

0.20 

23-Jan-14 White, R. Correspondence with L. Cormack of Leisure World re: 
possible interest in property. 

0.20 

23-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Address listing concern raised by stakeholder's counsel with 
J. Jensen; related call to discuss. 

0.40 

24-Jan-14 Lem, M. Attend to calls from potential purchasers/agents; discussion 
with J. Jensen re: sale process. 

0.50 

24-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Coordinate issue of OSB acknowledgement letter to R. White; 
update M. Lem on Jensen communications. 

0.40 

27-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Meet with M. Lem to discuss status of Jensen listing and MOH 
clawback deferral; follow up with Gowlings re: content of 
Jensen listing agreement and request draft APS; review of 
comments supplied; follow up with Pinchin on timing of 
Phase II ESA; respond to calls received from prospective 
purchasers; call with Roynat to discuss BDO role and receipt 
of supplied lease agreement; call with S. Jensen to discuss 
marketing next steps. 

1.40 

27-Jan-14 Lem, M. Various correspondence with J. Dietrich re: listing 
arrangements with Jensens; attend to various 
correspondence re: comments on draft listing proposal from 
Jensens. 

0.50 

27-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Address counsel comments on listing agreement with S. 
Jensen and supply marked up version; communications with 
S. Jensen in connection with sunset date vs. traditional 
marketing and listing terms; review of December financials 
supplied by Responsive. 

2.00 
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28-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Attend to provision of current financial information to 
Jensens re: data room; ongoing communications with S. 
Jensen and M. Lem in connection with listing agreement 
amendments and co-operating broker commission structure; 
review marketing materials supplied by Jensens and address 
proposed confidentiality agreement with counsel; follow up 
with Responsive (B. Saleh and E. Cuttini) re: normalized 
operating budget; further communications with S. Jensen in 
connection with marketing approach, sale timeline, and key 
milestone dates. 

4.30 

28-Jan-14 Lem, M. Attend to correspondence from J. Dietrich re: Jensens and 
listing; discussion with J. Dietrich re: same; update on sale 
process and contact potential purchasers; review 
correspondence from Jensens. 

0.90 

29-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Further communications with Responsive in connection with 
normalized budget; ongoing communications with S. Jensen 
in connection with listing agreement and offering procedure; 
communications with counsel in connection with listing 
agreement amendments and review comments supplied in 
connection with confidentiality agreement; related 
communications with S. Jensen; compile list of prospective 
purchasers and supply to S. Jensen; call with prospective 
purchaser; attend to issue re: listing price. 

2.20 

29-Jan-14 Lem, M. Discussion with C. Prophet re: MOH follow-up; 
correspondence from L. Chambers re: previous interested 
parties; review Gowlings comments on NDA; 

0.40 

30-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Draft receiver certificate; review correspondence pertaining 
to MOH clawback deferral; ongoing communications with S. 
Jensen in connection with marketing launch and content of 
CA/NDA; related communications with counsel to address 
proposed agent inquiries covering materials and mandate 
page; Review finalized CA/NDA to verify amendments; 
Review past information received by the Chambers re: 
prospective purchasers; communications with Responsive in 
connection with normalized budget; call with counsel (Frank 
Lamie) to discuss status and content of APS; calls (several) 
with S. Jensen to discuss various matters including online 
data room, listing agreement, and list price disclosure; 
update M. Lem and coordinate interim distribution to TD 
Bank. 

4.30 

30-Jan-14 White, R. Telephone call with D. Griffiths re: package for sale of 
assets. 

0.20 
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30-Jan-14 Lem, M. Attend to correspondence from J. Marin re: deferral 
agreement from MOH; review same; attend to various 
correspondence re: wire transfer for funds being distributed 
to TD Bank and issuance of Receiver's Certificate; review and 
adjust Receiver's Certificate; discussions with TD Bank re: 
same; review correspondence from L. Chambers re: previous 
letter of interest. 

1.80 

31-Jan-14 Griffiths, D. Amend Jensen listing agreement and address with M. Lem; 
review counsel comments on Jensens’ sale process website 
and address same with S. Jensen; discuss various matters 
with M. Lem including amended listing agreement, 
Receiver’s Certificate, and interim distribution to TD Bank; 
review content of online data room and address related 
concerns with S. Jensen (i.e. disclosure of list price); update 
Jensens on status of MOH clawback deferral; review 
proposed Loopnet and Globe & Mail advertisements; call with 
S. Jensen to discuss various matters and provide instructions 
to initiate contact with prospective purchasers. 

2.70 

31-Jan-14 Lem, M. Attend to distribution to TD Bank; correspondence with J. 
Dietrich and other key stakeholders re: confirmation of 
receipt of funds, issuance of Receiver’s Certificate and 
distribution to TD Bank. 

0.50 

3-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Follow up with Pinchin on status of Phase II ESA, further 
communications regarding drilling issue, and update M. Lem; 
meet with M. Lem to discuss Jensen listing agreement and 
address PIPEDA concern with counsel; amend marketing 
authority commentary and address with S. Jensen; revisit list 
price disclosure; review projections set out in Forbearance 
Agreement and other materials supplied by Responsive; call 
with F. Lin to discuss operation of bank accounts and request 
statements; discuss monitoring requirements with M. Lem. 

3.50 

4-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Review of financial information supplied by Responsive 
including budget to actual cash-flow analysis and banking 
materials supplied by F. Lin; e-mail to E. Cuttini (Responsive) 
addressing budget to actual variance and request additional 
information required in connection with monitoring; call with 
E. Cuttini to discuss; communications with M. Lem in 
connection with amendments to listing agreement, list price 
disclosure, and cash flow monitoring; related update to R. 
White; review amended listing agreement commentary 
supplied by counsel and address with S. Jensen; further 
amend listing agreement to incorporate same and supply to 
Jensens; review title search supplied by counsel and request 
property tax certificate. 

5.50 

4-Feb-14 Lem, M. Attend to correspondence received. 0.20 

5-Feb-14 Lem, M. Review correspondence from Pinchin; update to counsels for 
key stakeholders. 

0.20 
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5-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Receive updates from Pinchin in connection with Phase II ESA 
drilling and update M. Lem; communications with S. Jensen 
in connection with data room content. 

0.20 

6-Feb-14 Lem, M. Discussion with prospective purchaser; discussion with J. 
Dietrich re: ESA and accelerated timing; discussion with D. 
Griffiths re: same; review correspondence from Pinchin re: 
same; correspondence with J. Dietrich re: same. 

0.50 

6-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Address inquiries with Pinchin in connection with supplied 
drilling update and cost/timing of expedited lab results; 
coordinate execution of amended Listing Agreement and 
supply to Jensen; communications with S. Jensen in 
connection with list price disclosure, access to online data 
room, and advertising; related call to discuss. 

1.50 

7-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Receive instructions in connection with expedited lab results 
and notify Pinchin; supply requested building particulars to 
S. Jensen; address requested release of appraisals and supply 
to S. Jensen; review and approve Loopnet online listing; call 
with S. Jensen to discuss various matters including contact 
with identified potential purchaser; follow up with E. Cuttini 
(Responsive) re: requested financial information and review 
of materials supplied (A/R, A/P, and priority payables) along 
with explanation of forecast variance. 

1.50 

10-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Draft response to prospective purchaser; follow up with 
counsel on draft APS; receive update regarding property 
taxes; communications with J. Jensen in connection with 
listing agreement concerns; call with M. Lem to discuss file 
status. 

1.30 

11-Feb-14 Lem, M. Review and adjust correspondence with broker for potential 
bidders; update discussion with D. Griffiths re: sale process, 
monitoring and other. 

0.50 

11-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Further communications with J. Jensen in connection with 
content of listing agreement and review proposed 
amendments; related communications with counsel (F. 
Lamie) also addressing content of CA/NDA; supply counsel 
amendments to J. Jensen and call to discuss; follow up with 
Responsive re: budget to actual comparative analysis and 
bank reconciliations; communications with Fairview 
bookkeeper (F. Lin) requesting bank statements and current 
balance sheet; correspondence with potential purchaser; call 
with F. Lamie re: form of APS. 

4.00 

12-Feb-14 Lem, M. Discussion with Gowlings re: Jensens’ listing agreement. 0.20 

12-Feb-14 Lem, M. Review listing agreement; discussion with C. Prophet and F. 
Lamie re: adjustments to listing agreement and issues raised 
by Jensens. 

0.30 
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12-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Review further amended Listing Agreement supplied by 
counsel (C. Prophet) and supply to J. Jensen; review Jensen's 
responding revisions and move to finalize same; related 
communications re: amendments to CA/NDA and move to 
finalize same; communications with S. Jensen regarding 
interest of GEM Health Care and how to deal with 
prospective purchaser inquiries; address MOH funding inquiry 
with J. Jensen; draft memo to Stakeholder's in connection 
with monitoring and information requested from Responsive. 

4.00 

13-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Compile e-mail addresses and draft E-Service list; receipt 
and overview of January 2014 bank statements and cancelled 
cheques supplied by F. Lin; receipt and review of property 
tax certificate and supply to J. Jensen; receipt and review of 
executed listing agreement and final form of CA/NDA 
supplied by J. Jensen; receipt and review of Jensens’ Agency 
Relationship Brochure. 

1.00 

14-Feb-14 Lem, M. Attend to issues concerning e-service address list to be 
posted to Case website. 

0.20 

14-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Amend E-Service List and coordinate upload to Case website; 
follow up with B. Saleh at Responsive information requested; 
coordinate execution of finalized listing agreement and 
forward same to J. Jensen; follow up on status of APS; 
approve revised Globe & Mail advertisements and call with S. 
Jensen to discuss marketing activities (brochure vs. online 
data room) and requirement for weekly reporting; contact L. 
Chambers regarding site tours; address Jensens’ request to 
communicate with Responsive; contact Pinchin in connection 
with Phase II ESA; attend to file status update. 

3.50 

18-Feb-14 Lem, M. Attend to call from A. Chambers; call to J. Jensen; review 
correspondence from J. Jensen. 

0.20 

19-Feb-14 Lem, M. Update discussion with J. Jensen re: sale process; discussion 
with P. Gauci re: coordination of tours; update discussion 
with A. Chambers and email correspondence with L. 
Chambers re: point of contact for tours. 

0.90 

21-Feb-14 Lem, M. Discussion with Pinchin re: environmental report; update 
discussion with J. Jensen re: sale process. 

0.20 

24-Feb-14 Lem, M. Review Pinchin Phase II ESA; discussion with J. Dietrich re: 
same; discussion with D. Griffiths re: same and sale process 
progress; forward Phase II ESA to stakeholders; review 
correspondence from J. Jensen. 

1.00 
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24-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Review correspondence including Jensens marketing report 
and Phase II ESA; call with J. Jensen to discuss status of 
marketing efforts; communications with Pinchin in 
connection with delineation cost estimate and reliance 
letter; further communications with Pinchin re: report 
findings; follow up with counsel (F. Lamie) re: status of APS 
and update J. Jensen; follow up on status of execution of 
CA/NDA by prospective purchaser. 

1.50 

25-Feb-14 Lem, M. Review draft APS; review same with D. Griffiths; forward 
marketing report to stakeholders. 

2.00 

25-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Further communications with Pinchin in connection with 
Phase II ESA findings; receipt and review of draft APS 
supplied by counsel (F. Lamie); related meeting with M. Lem 
to discuss content; call with F. Lamie to discuss 
amendments. 

1.50 

26-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Communications with J. Jensen to address report disclosure 
to prospective purchasers; follow up with Pinchin in 
connection with Supplemental Phase II ESA proposal; receipt 
and review of February 2014 Render Report and banking 
materials supplied by Fairview accountant (F. Lin); receipt 
and review of amended APS supplied by counsel (F. Lamie) 
and confirm conference call. 

1.50 

27-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Review Pinchin proposal (Supplemental Phase II ESA) and 
address related inquiries; draft e-mail to key stakeholders 
re: approval to proceed with Pinchin proposal; ongoing 
communications with J. Jensen in connection with 
prospective purchaser inquiries, tours, and other issues; 
supply Jensen with copies of Pinchin reports; email L. 
Chambers re: communication protocol; conference call with 
M. Lem and counsel (F. Lamie and C. Prophet) re: content of 
APS; supply counsel (F. Lamie) with employee listings, union 
collective agreements, and lease particulars in connection 
with APS. 

4.00 

27-Feb-14 Lem, M. Call with Gowlings re: draft form of APS. 0.30 

28-Feb-14 Lem, M. Review correspondence from J. Jensen; call with C. Prophet 
and F. Lamie, together with D. Griffiths, then also later with 
J. Jensen re: sale process; correspondence with stakeholders 
re: funding for Supplementary Phase II ESA. 

0.80 

28-Feb-14 Griffiths, D. Supply marked up version of draft APS to counsel (F. Lamie) 
requesting further revisions; call with J. Jensen to discuss 
ESA reports; related conference call with counsel and M. 
Lem; subsequent conference call with Jensens re: ESA report 
disclosure to potential purchasers; review prospective 
purchaser e-mail exchanges with Jensen; address 
Supplemental Phase II ESA stakeholder approval. 

1.00 
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3-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Review Jensen communications with prospective purchasers; 
review additional information supplied by Responsive; call 
with J. Jensen ESA report disclosure; receive update from 
Pinchin on utility locates and drilling schedule; address 
Supplemental Phase II ESA timeline and benefit of expedited 
lab results with Pinchin; follow up with B. Saleh re: January 
financials and roll forward of budget to actual comparison. 

2.00 

4-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Review Supplemental Phase II ESA timeline supplied by 
Pinchin; review Jensen marketing activity report; address 
purchaser deposit logistics; call with Jensens to discuss 
Phase II Supplemental Report timing and benefit of rushed 
lab results; follow up with counsel regarding APS 
amendments; review APS amendments and conference call 
to discuss. 

2.00 

4-Mar-14 Lem, M. Attend to correspondence on Supplementary Phase II ESA; 
follow-up with A. Rabinowitz re: funding; call with C. 
Prophet, together with D. Griffiths re: draft APS. 

0.60 

5-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Receipt and review of January financial information received 
from Responsive (B. Saleh); review same with B. Saleh; 
review further revisions to draft APS supplied by counsel (C. 
Prophet) and call to discuss further proposed amendments; 
incorporate APS amendments and issue to Jensen along with 
preamble commentary; call with S. Jensen re: same; review 
union Collective Agreements and coordinate Responsive 
follow up; coordinate counsel (F. Lamie) access to online 
data room; call with Pinchin to discuss pending Authorization 
to Proceed and Supplemental Phase II ESA timeline; related 
updates to M. Lem. 

4.50 

5-Mar-14 Lem, M. Attend to matters related to draft APS to be provided to 
prospective purchasers; provide update and copy of same 
draft APS to key stakeholders. 

0.50 

6-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Further communications with S. Jensen in connection with 
union Collective Agreements and to coordinate preparation 
of equipment/chattels listing; ongoing communications with 
S. Jensen to address prospective purchaser inquiries. 

0.40 

7-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Review updated marketing report supplied by Jensens; 
correspondence with S. Jensen to address prospective 
purchaser inquiries; call with S. Jensen to discuss status of 
marketing activities and address notification of APS 
existence; receive approval to proceed with Supplemental 
Phase II ESA and coordinate with Pinchin; address related 
matters pertaining to decommission cost estimates and 
supply requested contact information for Fairview on site 
representative. 

1.20 
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7-Mar-14 Lem, M. Attend to call from prospective purchaser; attend to sale 
process update; attend to email from Pinchin re: update on 
ESA sampling performed; provide update to key 
stakeholders. 

0.50 

10-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Communications with S. Jensen to address prospective 
purchaser inquiries; communications with Responsive (B. 
Saleh) in connection with inventory/accounts receivable 
valuations and follow up on roll forward of budget to actual 
comparison; address proposed NDA revisions by a potential 
purchaser with counsel (F. Lamie) and call to discuss. 

1.00 

10-Mar-14 Lem, M. Attend to and review correspondence from Jensens. 0.10 

11-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Communications with Responsive (B. Saleh) in connection 
with budget to actual roll forward comparative analysis; 
follow up with S. Jensen re: union collective agreements and 
equipment/chattels listing; related updates to M. Lem and 
call to discuss. 

0.30 

13-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Call with J. Jensen to discuss status of marketing efforts and 
update M. Lem. 

0.30 

14-Mar-14 Lem, M. Attend to review and circulate the marketing reports on sale 
process to counsel for key stakeholders; follow-up with 
counsel for the estate trustee re: supplementary Phase II 
ESA; discussion with D. Griffiths re: Jensens and sale process 
and Pinchin. 

0.50 

14-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Follow up with J. Jensen regarding outstanding information 
requested from Responsive and review details supplied; call 
with S. Jensen re sale process and marketing report updates; 
receive update on Supplemental Phase II ESA. 

1.00 

17-Mar-14 Lem, M. Review Jensens' marketing report; prepare and send update 
to counsel for key stakeholders; discussion with K. Malcolm 
of TD Bank. 

0.30 

17-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Review Jensens marketing activity report; follow up with 
Jensens re: outstanding information requested from 
Responsive; receipt and overview of bank statements 
supplied by Fairview accountant (F. Lin). 

0.40 

18-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Communications with P. Gauci to obtain current employee 
listing (identifying unionized vs. non-unionized employees); 
receive update from J. Jensen in connection with 
information requested from Responsive and discuss with M. 
Lem. 

0.20 

19-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Call with J. Jensen re sale process; update discussion with M. 
Lem; review list of employees supplied by P. Gauci and 
request current union Collective Agreements; follow up with 
B. Saleh (Responsive) re: budget to actual forecast analysis. 

1.20 
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19-Mar-14 Lem, M. Attend to several calls from prospective purchaser; update 
discussion from D. Griffiths and comments from Jensens re: 
sale process and Responsive information requested. 

0.50 

20-Mar-14 White, R. Review correspondence form MOH re: 2011 and 2012 ARR; 
file review re: same; telephone discussion with M. Lem and 
detailed voicemail left for E. Cuttini. 

0.70 

20-Mar-14 Lem, M. Review MOHLTC audit/reconciliation for 2011 and 2012; 
discussion with R. White re: same; discussions with 
prospective purchasers; update discussion with J. Jensen. 

1.00 

20-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Review MOHLTC reconciliation reports and address pending 
response deadline with M. Lem; receipt and overview of 
budget to actual comparative analysis supplied by B. Saleh; 
further communications with B. Saleh in connection with 
WSIB issue; review of February Render Report to verify no 
further clawback; review and approve amended CA/NDA 
received from prospective purchaser. 

1.00 

21-Mar-14 White, R. Conference call with E. Cuttini and B. Saleh to discuss 2011 
and 2012 ARR and proposed response to MOH re: 
disallowances, detailed email to M. Lem re: same. 

0.90 

21-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Further communications with Fairview (F. Lin) in connection 
with WSIB issue; review WSIB statement addressed to BDO 
and call with WSIB (multiple individuals) to advise of limited 
receivership mandate; revise draft service employee 
Collective Agreement received from Responsive and supply 
to J. Jensen; call with Jensens re: same; receive update 
regarding Supplemental Phase II ESA; review updated 
marketing report supplied by Jensens. 

1.20 

21-Mar-14 Lem, M. Attend to call from A. Chambers; attend to call from 
prospective purchaser and coordinate meeting; various 
correspondence and call with Pinchin re: lab results 
received. 

0.70 

24-Mar-14 Lem, M. Meeting with J. Jensen, then later with prospective 
purchasers at Markham office. 

1.20 

25-Mar-14 Lem, M. Update discussion with D. Griffiths re: sale process and 
monitoring; review WSIB issue with N. Sagolili and 
monitoring; attend to call from C. Prophet. 

0.30 

26-Mar-14 Lem, M. Attend to correspondence from J. Jensen. 0.10 

27-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Communications with B. Saleh (Responsive) in connection 
with monitoring inquiries; communications with J. Jensen in 
connection with prospective purchaser inquiries. 

0.30 

28-Mar-14 Lem, M. Discussion with D. Griffiths re: sale process matters and draft 
ESA report; review draft report from Pinchin. 

0.80 
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28-Mar-14 White, R. Review and respond to email from D. Griffiths re: questions 
from prospective purchaser; review Responsive reply to MOH 
and voicemail message for B. Saleh re: same. 

0.50 

31-Mar-14 Griffiths, D. Review Pinchin environmental reports; communications with 
J. Jensen same; communications with Pinchin to discuss 
report content and recommendations; draft reporting e-mail 
to key stakeholders and discuss with M. Lem; receipt of 
Fairview payroll information and forward to Jensens re 
potential purchaser information requests; review Jensens’ 
weekly marketing report; follow up with B. Saleh on WSIB 
issue. 

3.00 

31-Mar-14 Lem, M. Review draft update to key stakeholders re: ESA reports; 
forward same to Gowlings re: same and information to be 
released to prospective purchasers. 

0.30 

31-Mar-14 Sagolili, N. Attend to review of file. 1.00 

And all other matters in connection with the administration of this receivership proceeding. 



 Tel:  905 508 0080 
Fax:  905 508 0012 
 
www.bdo.ca 

BDO Canada Limited 
45 Vogell Road  
Suite 300 
Richmond Hill, ON L4B 3P6  Canada 

 

BDO Canada Limited is an affiliate of BDO Canada LLP. BDO Canada LLP, a Canadian limited liability partnership, is a member of BDO International 
Limited, a UK company limited by guarantee, and forms part of the international BDO network of independent member firms. 

INVOICE 
 
 
Fairview Nursing Home Limited 
14 Cross Street 
Toronto, ON 
M6J 1S8 
 
Attention: Lisa Chambers 

Vice President, Treasurer-Secretary 
 
 

Invoice Date Invoice No. 

11 September 2014 87905362 
 
 
Re: Fairview Nursing Home Limited (“Fairview”) - Receivership 
 
TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES rendered in acting as Court-appointed receiver of Fairview Nursing 
Home Limited, for the period from 1 April 2014 to 31 August 2014, as per detailed time records 
attached: 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  

OUR FEES IN ALL 77,547.30$      

DISBURSEMENTS:

Administrative Disbursement Charge (4%) 3,101.89         
Filing Fees (Non-Taxable) 70.00             
Postage & Courier 8.44               
Travel 571.06            

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS 81,298.69       

HARMONIZED SALES TAX (13.00%) - R101518124 10,559.73       

BALANCE DUE 91,858.42$      

Professional Hours
Average 

Hourly Rate Amount
Matthew E. Lem, Partner      125.50  $       510.00 64,005.00$      

Darren Griffiths, Manager       15.10  $       325.00 4,907.50         
Nicole Sagolili, Manager       25.50  $       325.00          8,287.50 
Administration & Accounting         4.90  $         70.88             347.30 
Total 171.00    77,547.30$      

SUMMARY OF TIME CHARGES BY PROFESSIONAL:
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DETAILED SUMMARY OF TIME: 
 

Date Professional Description of Work Hours 

1-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with Gowlings re: release of ESA to 
prospective purchasers; discussion with D. Griffiths 
re: same and correspondence on ESA to 
stakeholders; review and adjust communication to 
stakeholders re: ESA; update to stakeholders on 
marketing activities by Jensens. 

1.10 

1-Apr-14 Sagolili, Nicole Discussion of file and monitoring with D. Griffiths. 0.50 

2-Apr-14 Griffiths, Darren Receipt and review of revised environmental 
disclaimer commentary supplied by counsel (F. 
Lamie) and address with J. Jensen; supply Jensen 
with copies of existing environmental reports; 
related call with M. Lem to discuss. 

0.50 

3-Apr-14 Griffiths, Darren Communications with Pinchin in connection with 
invoicing; call with J. Jensen to discuss notification 
commentary in connection with environmental 
reports and associated disclaimer; address Jensen's 
revised commentary with Gowlings. 

0.40 

3-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to correspondence from Jensens re: ESA. 0.20 

4-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to issue relating to ESA posting. 0.10 

4-Apr-14 Griffiths, Darren Receipt of amended commentary supplied by 
Gowlings and address with J. Jensen (environmental 
report disclosure and offer deadline); related call 
with J. and S. Jensen and discuss disclaimer process 
associated with online marketing room; review 
content of online marketing room; related call with 
M. Lem; authorize Jensen to proceed with 
notification to registered buyers; review WSIB 
reconciliation supplied by B. Saleh; coordinate 
amendment to Pinchin draft remediation cost 
estimate letter and seek clarity on Supplemental 
Phase II lab detection results. 

1.30 

7-Apr-14 Griffiths, Darren Communications with Pinchin in connection with 
draft remediation cost estimate letter and supply 
revised draft to J. Jensen; review budget to actual 
comparative analysis and supporting materials 
supplied by B. Saleh (Responsive); related review of 
bank statements to verify account activity; draft 
monitoring report to stakeholders; related 
discussion with M. Lem and incorporate requested 
revisions; follow up with B. Saleh on status of 
February 2014 financials and address cash flow 
monitoring inquiries. 

7.50 
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7-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to update discussions with A. Chambers and 
L. Chambers; update discussion with A. Greenwood 
of TD; review draft financial monitoring update. 

0.70 

8-Apr-14 Sagolili, Nicole Review of and update to monitoring report; review 
of information from and e-mail to B. Saleh 
(Responsive); attend to letter to WSIB. 

0.80 

8-Apr-14 Griffiths, Darren Draft response to Chartwell inquiries; 
communications with N. Sagolili in connection with 
WSIB issue; receipt of February 2014 financials 
supplied by B. Saleh (Responsive) and discuss with 
N. Sagolili. 

1.00 

9-Apr-14 Griffiths, Darren Call with John Jensen to discuss offer status and 
update Matthew Lem;  issue response to Chartwell 
inquiries; follow up with Pinchin in connection with 
invoice. 

0.40 

9-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Review WSIB letter; update on sale process and 
potential purchaser issues. 

0.30 

9-Apr-14 Sagolili, Nicole Attend to correspondence to WSIB. 0.40 

10-Apr-14 Sagolili, Nicole Review of forbearance agreement; attend to 
monitoring. 

0.70 

10-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Review forbearance agreement re: deficit funding 
issue and potential impact of funds on 
distributions/payments to TD; correspondence with 
Jensens re: marketing report and status of sale 
process and offers. 

1.00 

11-Apr-14 Sagolili, Nicole Review of amounts owing to Responsive, and e-mail 
to B. Saleh (Responsive) re: same; attend to 
projected distribution analysis. 

0.40 

11-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Review list of claims and analysis of possible 
distributions based on priority and potential 
proceeds of realization; call to potential purchaser 
re: status of offer; update discussions with Jensen 
re: potential purchaser; review remediation cost 
estimates and potential options in connection with 
structuring a sale. 

1.70 

14-Apr-14 Sagolili, Nicole Correspond with B. Saleh (Responsive) re: WSIB 
account; phone call to WSIB re: correspondence 
sent (transferred to various departments). 

0.40 

14-Apr-14 Sagolili, Nicole Attend to file administration matters. 1.50 

14-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Review LOI from prospective bidder; call with 
Jensens re: same and status of offers. 

0.30 
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15-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to various correspondence with Jensens; call 
with Jensens; correspondence with L. Chambers; 
correspondence with Gowlings. 

0.50 

16-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to call with Gowlings re: sale process update 
and next steps; review draft monitoring report; 
attend to various correspondence from Jensens; call 
to A. Greenwood of TD re: CMHC; attend to call 
from S. Mitra; call from J. Jensen re: update on 
interest. 

1.00 

17-Apr-14 Sagolili, Nicole Attend to various e-mails; update monitoring 
report. 

0.40 

17-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Call with prospective purchaser; separate update 
calls with L. Chamber and A. Chambers; attend to 
correspondence from Jensens; update conference 
call with main stakeholders (Responsive, TD, Estate, 
Chambers); discussion with C. Prohet. 

1.10 

21-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Correspondence with potential purchaser re: 
interest in property and licenses; attend to call 
from prospective purchaser; attend to 
correspondence from J. Jensen. 

0.60 

21-Apr-14 Sagolili, Nicole Receipt and review of e-mails from F. Lin (Fairview) 
and B. Saleh (Responsive); call to WSIB. 

0.20 

22-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to various correspondence and call with J. 
Jensen re: pending offers; correspondence and 
discussion with L. Chambers; attend to call from C. 
Prophet. 

1.00 

23-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Review information received from L. Chambers; 
attend to correspondence received; forward 
documents to J. Jensen. 

0.90 

25-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to various correspondence from Jensens and 
Gowlings; coordination of conference call with 
Pinchin and prospective purchaser; conference call 
with prospective purchaser, their counsel, Jensens, 
and Gowlings; discussion with C. Prophet re: same. 

1.60 

28-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Review marketing report and messages from 
Jensens; call with Gowlings re: same; update 
conference call with main stakeholders; call with 
main stakeholders, excluding Responsive re: review 
in detail interest in the property and business; 
follow-up call with S. Mitra; update discussion with 
J. Jensen and strategies. 

1.80 
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29-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to various correspondences from Jensens; 
review LOI from prospective purchaser; attend to 
license information requested by Gowlings for APS. 

0.50 

30-Apr-14 Lem, Matthew Conference call with Jensens re: update on status of 
interest and offers; attend to various 
correspondence from Jensens; preparation of 
summary of interest/offers and forward same to 
Gowlings. 

1.00 

30-Apr-14 Sagolili, Nicole Phone call to WSIB; e-mail correspondence with B. 
Saleh (Responsive) re: WSIB account. 

0.50 

1-May-14 Lem, Matthew Call with C. Prophet; conference call with certain 
stakeholders; follow-up call with F. Lamie; call with 
J. Jensen re: next steps and strategies. 

1.40 

2-May-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to correspondence with Jensens re: offers; 
discussion with J. Jensen re: same. 

0.50 

5-May-14 Lem, Matthew Review offer/APS received; discussion with 
Gowlings re: same; attend to call from prospective 
purchaser and realtors; correspondence with 
Jensens; discussion with C. Prophet re: asbestos 
review requirements; review asbestos review 
requirements and discussion with Pinchin re same; 
discussion with L. Chambers re: asbestos review and 
other; attend to information requests/queries from 
a prospective purchaser. 

3.50 

6-May-14 Lem, Matthew Review of offers received; update offer/interest 
analysis; various discussions and correspondence 
with Jensens; call with L. Chambers; discussion with 
F. DiMaria at Pinchin re: asbestos review and 
potential purchaser queries. 

1.60 

7-May-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to various correspondence from Jensens re: 
offers and correspondence received from potential 
purchasers; discussion with Jensens re: same; 
update offer analysis; discussion with Gowlings re: 
same and next steps; coordination of meeting with 
MOHLTC. 

1.70 

8-May-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to correspondence from Jensens re: 
potential purchasers and MOHLTC discussions; 
follow-up re: extension to forbearance and listing 
agreement. 

0.50 

9-May-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to correspondence from Jensens re: 
additional offers from prospective purchasers. 

0.20 

9-May-14 Sagolili, Nicole Respond to telephone inquiry re: sale of business. 0.10 
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12-May-14 Sagolili, Nicole Receipt and review of April 2014 financial 
information; review of forecast vs. actual cash-flow 
information for period ending March 21, 2014; begin 
to draft interim monitoring report; e-mail to B. 
Saleh (Responsive) re: cash-flow variances; receipt 
of documentation from F. Lin (Fairview). 

3.00 

12-May-14 Lem, Matthew Attend send out update on offer analysis to key 
stakeholders in anticipation of conference call; 
attend to various correspondence and queries from 
prospective purchasers and Jensens; attend to call 
from Jensens; review Royal Crest proceeding in 
connection with beds in abeyance issue and meeting 
with the MOHLTC; attend to extension of listing 
agreements; discussion with Gowlings re: update 
call with key stakeholders; convene update 
conference call with key stakeholders. 

1.40 

13-May-14 Lem, Matthew Preparation and research in anticipation with 
meeting with MOHLTC; attend meeting at MOHLTC, 
together with Gowlings. 

2.80 

14-May-14 Lem, Matthew Review APS from prospective purchaser; call with 
Jensens and prospective purchaser’s agent to 
coordinate a meeting; discussion with Jensens re: 
next steps and response from other prospective 
purchaser. 

1.20 

15-May-14 Lem, Matthew Preparation for meeting with potential purchaser; 
attend meeting with potential purchaser, its agent 
and counsel, together with Gowlings and Jensens; 
calls to the TC LHIN; update call with the key 
stakeholder; discussion with D. Lobl  re: potential 
financing options; discussion with L. Chambers re: 
same and asbestos review; follow-up call with C. 
Prophet. 

4.20 

16-May-14 Lem, Matthew Discussions with G. Bone of TC LHIN re: arrange a 
meeting; various correspondence with Gowlings; 
preparation of report to key stakeholders re: status 
of sale process and extension request; attend to call 
from A. Chambers; attend to preparation for 
meeting with a prospective purchaser and its 
counsel. 

4.80 

19-May-14 Lem, Matthew Review of offer of prospective purchaser; attend to 
update for key stakeholders. 

2.00 

20-May-14 Lem, Matthew Attend meeting with prospective purchaser and its 
counsel, together with Gowlings and Jensens; 
attend meeting with the TC LHIN, together with 
Gowlings; review CBA vis-a-vis issues for a 
prospective purchaser. 

2.50 
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21-May-14 Lem, Matthew Meeting with prospective purchaser, together with 
J. Jensen. 

2.00 

21-May-14 Sagolili, Nicole E-mail to B. Saleh (Responsive) re: vacation policy. 0.10 

22-May-14 Sagolili, Nicole Update monitoring report; respond to e-mail from 
B. Saleh (Responsive). 

0.40 

22-May-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to various calls with Jensen re: prospective 
purchasers; correspondence with potential 
purchaser re: meeting and business terms of offer; 
call to Pinchin re: cost estimate; discussion with M. 
Allore of MOHLTC re: potential purchaser; 
discussion with G. Bone re: same; attend to 
modelling of distributions based on potential 
purchasers' offers; call to L. Chambers. 

1.40 

23-May-14 Lem, Matthew Update discussions with L. Chambers, D. Lobl and S. 
Mitra re: potential purchasers offer and impact; 
attend to conference call with agent for a potential 
purchaser; together with Jensens; attend 
conference call with potential purchaser, together 
with Jensens; various discussions and 
correspondence with Jensens; attend to 
correspondence from a potential purchaser re: 
additional business terms; discussion with C. 
Prophet re: file issues and prospective purchasers. 

1.90 

23-May-14 Sagolili, Nicole Correspond with B. Saleh (Responsive) and receipt 
of MOHLTC reconciliation. 

0.20 

26-May-14 Lem, Matthew Various discussions with Gowlings re: meeting and 
MOHLTC; attend conference call with prospective 
purchaser and its counsel, together with Gowlings 
and Jensens re: status of offer and clarification of 
issues; various discussions and correspondence with 
Jensens re: prospective purchasers and information 
requests; discussion with M. Allore of MOHLTC re: 
meeting with FMB. 

1.30 

27-May-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with F. Lamie re: discussion with M. Orr; 
discussion with M. Allore at MOHLTC re: outcome of 
meeting; attend to email to prospective purchaser 
re: MOHLTC debt assumption terms. 

1.10 

28-May-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with Gowlings re: update call with 
stakeholders; convene key stakeholders update call; 
discussion with G. Bone of TC LHIN; attend to 
correspondence from prospective purchaser re: MOH 
debt assumption issue; attend strategize on 
repayment issue re: same; discussion with 
prospective purchaser. 

1.50 
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28-May-14 Sagolili, Nicole Attend to further inquiries on monitoring report; 
update monitoring report; e-mail to B. Saleh 
(Responsive). 

0.40 

29-May-14 Sagolili, Nicole Attend to monitoring; e-mail follow-up questions to 
B. Saleh (Responsive). 

0.30 

29-May-14 Lem, Matthew Update discussion with A. Chambers; attend to call 
from L. Chamber; attend to correspondence from E. 
Petes of MOHLTC re: meeting; discussion with E. 
Petes re: same; update discussion with F. Lamie. 

0.70 

2-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to follow-up correspondence with 
prospective purchaser; review policy information 
received from M. Orr of MOHLTC legal; discussion 
with F. Lamie re: same and strategies for upcoming 
meeting/conference call with MOHLTC, FMB and 
legal. 

1.00 

3-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Call with F. Lamie re: upcoming call with MOHLTC; 
conference call with MOHLTC, together with F. 
Lamie; follow-up discussion with Gowlings re: 
meeting; update discussion with J. Jensen; review 
and adjust letter to MOHLTC; review 
correspondence from M. Orr re: MOHLTC 
requirements; discussion with F. Lamie re: same; 
review impact of same on proposed transaction. 

2.30 

4-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Review impact of MOH condition on potential deal; 
update discussion with J. Jensen re: other potential 
purchasers' offers; several discussions with the 
potential purchaser re: MOHLTC proposed 
conditions; various calls to the MOHLTC; call to B. 
Saleh at Responsive re: continuity schedule; prepare 
and send letter to D. Lobl re: funding request. 

1.60 

4-Jun-14 Sagolili, Nicole Update interim monitoring report; follow-up e-mail 
to B. Saleh (Responsive). 

0.30 

5-Jun-14 Sagolili, Nicole Receipt of various documents from B. Saleh 
(Responsive). 

0.10 

5-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Various calls and discussions with the MOHLTC; 
adjust letter to MOHLTC re: debt assumption issue; 
discussion with F. Lamie re: same and discussion 
with MOHLTC; attend to call from J. Jensen. 

1.90 

6-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to letter to MOHLTC; discussions with 
Gowlings re: same; forward letter to MOH; attend 
to call from G. Bone of TC LHIN; attend to various 
correspondence from MOHLTC, S. Mitra and L. 
Chambers. 

1.60 



 
  Invoice Number: 87818723 

 
9 

Date Professional Description of Work Hours 

9-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to follow-up with D. Lobl at Dentons re: 
offer issue; attend discussion with L. Chambers. 

0.60 

10-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with F. Lamie re: offer issue and MOHLTC 
follow-up; call to R. Treu; review offer analysis and 
distribution impact re: MOHLTC requirements; 
attend to follow-up re: request made to MOHLTC. 

0.40 

12-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to correspondence from Jensens; attend to 
correspondence from Gowlings; discussion with R. 
Treu of BNS re: funding and other; email to K. 
Simpson of MOHLTC re: update on assumption 
request; discussion with K. Simpson of MOHLTC re: 
assumption request; update discussions with L. 
Chambers and affected potential purchaser re: 
same; update email to Gowlings re: MOHLTC 
position; attend to revised draft APS. 

1.20 

13-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Call to SEIU; attend to call from L. Chambers; 
attend to correspondence from Jensens re: 
potential purchaser; attend to email to SEIU; 
discussion with M. Dasilva of SEIU; attend to revise 
draft APS; attend to call from A. Chambers. 

3.60 

13-Jun-14 Sagolili, Nicole Receipt of financial information from F. Lin 
(Fairview). 

0.20 

16-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Review letter received from MOHLTC re: assumption 
request; email to MOHLTC re: clarification of issue; 
correspondence with impacted potential purchaser 
re: MOHLTC's decision; discussion with relevant 
potential purchaser re: same; attend to draft APS; 
forward draft APS to Gowlings for review and 
comments. 

3.30 

18-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Attend meeting at SEIU with R. McKenzie and M. 
Dasilva; update discussion with impacted potential 
purchaser; email follow-up with SEIU; 
correspondence with R. Treu re: funding. 

1.90 

19-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with potential purchaser re: meeting 
with SEIU. 

0.10 

20-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Review comments on APS from Gowlings; email to 
Gowlings re: same. 

0.50 

23-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Call to prospective purchaser; discussion with 
Gowlings re: APS; review and adjust revised draft 
APS; forward same to prospective purchaser. 

0.70 

24-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with potential purchaser; email update 
to key stakeholders; call to R. Treu of BNS re: 
funding; update discussion with Jensens. 

0.90 
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25-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to call from P. Gertler re: potential 
purchaser and transaction; call to R. Treu. 

0.30 

26-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to correspondence re: coordination of 
meeting with Schlegel and counsel to review draft 
APS. 

0.10 

27-Jun-14 Lem, Matthew Coordinate call with prospective purchaser and 
respective counsel to review APS; discussion with F. 
Lamie re: draft APS; discussion with Jensens re: 
other potential purchaser; email to N. Lytle of 
MOHLTC re: assumption request clarification. 

0.30 

2-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Call to Schlegel; call to R. Treu at BNS; discussion 
with C. Prophet re: draft APS. 

0.20 

3-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with J. Schlegel re: draft APS; attend 
conference call with Schlegel, its counsel and 
Gowlings; discussion with C. Prophet re: revisions to 
the APS. 

2.20 

3-Jul-14 Sagolili, Nicole E-mail to and voice-mail to B. Saleh (Responsive) re: 
employee information; update to M. Lem. 

0.20 

4-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with Jensen re: information requested 
from Responsive; discussion with L. Chambers. 

0.60 

8-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Preparation and forward schedule to L. Chambers 
re: analysis of Schlegel offer; preparation of 
Receiver's Certificate No. 002 re: funds advance by 
the Estate of Herbert Washington; discussion with J. 
Schlegel re: APS; discussion with C. Prophet re: 
same. 

0.70 

9-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Prepare letter and forward to D. Lobl re: Receiver's 
Certificate No. 002. 

0.20 

10-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Discussions with C. Prophet re: APS; review with L. 
Chambers' impact of Schlegel offer; forward copy of 
revised APS to Schlegel, P. Gertler and L. 
Chambers; discussion with Schlegel re: SEIU 
discussions. 

1.40 

11-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Calls to SEIU; email to SEI; attend to letter to 
Gowlings. 

0.60 

14-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Various discussions with Schlegel re: SEIU and APS; 
discussion with C. Prohet re: same; correspondence 
with P. Gertler re: APS; update call with A. 
Chambers; correspondence with SEIU re: update on 
status of discussions. 

1.00 
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15-Jul-14 Sagolili, Nicole Attend to monitoring or receipts and disbursements; 
phone calls from P. Gertler and C. Prophet. 

2.10 

16-Jul-14 Sagolili, Nicole Look into variances for monitoring, and e-mail to B. 
Saleh (Responsive) re: same; instructions from M. 
Lem re: accrued vacation; attempts to contact B. 
Saleh (Responsive) by phone. 

1.30 

16-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with C. Prophet re: revised APS; review 
revisions to APS; call with J. Schlegel; 
correspondence with Jensens re: Revera; attend to 
correspondence from L. Chambers; investigation in 
tax issues associated with sale; discussions with P. 
Gertler re: APS revisions; discussions with C. 
Prophet re: issues raised by P. Gertler; discussion 
with J. Schlegel re: SEIU; Discussion with R. 
McKenzie of SEIU. 

3.20 

17-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Various discussions with C. Prohet re: APS; 
discussion with P. Gertler re: same. 

0.90 

17-Jul-14 Sagolili, Nicole Call to F. Lin (Fairview); various phone calls with B. 
Saleh (Responsive) re: monitoring and vacation 
accruals; receipt and review of vacation accrual 
information. 

0.80 

18-Jul-14 Sagolili, Nicole Attend to issues concerning APS; phone call with B. 
Saleh (Responsive). 

0.20 

18-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Various discussions with C. Prophet re: finalization 
of APS with Schlegel; discussion with L. Chambers 
re: same; review of APS; discussion with P. Gertler 
re: APS; call to MOH, LHIN and Responsive re: 
MOHLTC receivable due at closing and other. 

2.10 

21-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Discussions with C. Prophet re: APS and revisions 
thereto; review revised APS; calls to FMB re: 
MOHLTC payment due at closing; update discussion 
with S. Mitra; discussion with R. Schlegel re: 
purchase price allocation issue; discussion with MNP 
re: same; review purchase price allocation issue. 

2.10 

22-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Various discussions with C. Prophet re: APS and 
revision thereto; attend to execution of APS; 
discussion and correspondence with L. Chambers re: 
same; preparation of schedule to review purchase 
price allocation; correspondence with MNP re: 
purchase price allocation issue; discussion with R. 
Schlegel re: purchase price allocation schedule; 
forward information concerning vacation accrual 
and sick leave accruals to Schlegel. 

1.60 
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23-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with C. Prophet re: APS; preparation of 
update to key stakeholders; discussion with M. 
Allore of MOHLTC; update email to MOHLTC and TC 
LHIN; review MNP analysis re: purchase price 
allocation. 

2.20 

23-Jul-14 Sagolili, Nicole Follow-up e-mail to B. Saleh (Responsive) re: 
monitoring questions. 

0.10 

24-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Review due diligence listing received from Schlegel; 
forward same to L. Chambers; discussion with J. 
Schlegel re: same; attend to correspondence from 
D. Lobl re: report to court; attend to 
correspondence from Gowlings re: information 
provision under APS; forward information to 
Schlegel. 

0.80 

25-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with L. Chambers re: due diligence 
process and next steps; forward additional 
information to Schlegel re: due diligence; update 
discussion with J. Jensen; respond to 
correspondence from S. Mitra. 

0.40 

28-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with J. Schlegel re: due diligence and 
information provided under APS; email to P. Gertler 
re: APS and information required; discussion with L. 
Chambers re: due diligence; correspondence with J. 
Schlegel re: same; discussion with F. DiMaria at 
Pinchin re: meeting and letter of reliance. 

1.00 

29-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Correspondence with L. Chambers. 0.10 

29-Jul-14 Sagolili, Nicole Receipt of various financial information from B. 
Saleh (Responsive). 

0.10 

30-Jul-14 Lem, Matthew Various discussions with J. Schlegel re: union issue; 
discussions with Gowlings re: same; discussion with 
SEIU; attend to call from P. Gertler; discussion with 
F. DiMaria at Pinchin re: meeting with Schlegel. 

1.40 

1-Aug-14 Sagolili, Nicole Review of responses from B. Saleh (Responsive); 
update interim monitoring report. 

0.60 

1-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with J. Schlegel re: update on union 
issues; discussion with C. Prophet re: same. 

0.50 

4-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to correspondence from Gowlings re: unions 
issue; discussion with A. Craig of Gowlings re: same; 
correspondence with J. Schlegel. 

0.70 

5-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to various correspondence with A. Craig of 
Gowlings re: union issue. 

0.10 
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5-Aug-14 Sagolili, Nicole E-mails from B. Saleh (Responsive); update interim 
monitoring report; e-mail to M. Lem. 

0.40 

6-Aug-14 Sagolili, Nicole Attend to file administration matters. 0.10 

6-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Discussions with A. Craig re: union issue, all with 
SEIU and next steps; follow-up re: authorizations; 
attend to coordination of meeting with counsel and 
Schlegel; discussions with M. Drown and J. Schlegel 
re: same. 

0.80 

7-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Call with Schlegel and counsel re: union issues; 
discussion with A. Craig re: same; discussions with 
L. Chamber re: extension agreement; discussion 
with S. Mitra re: same; email to key stakeholders 
re: extension agreement date revision suggestion. 

0.90 

8-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Attend conference call with Schlegel, Pinchin and 
Conestoga Rover re: due diligence. 

1.20 

12-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Meet with A. Craig before meeting with SEIU; attend 
SEIU's offices and meeting with T. Cadeau and R. 
McKenzie of SEIU, together with A. Craig of 
Gowlings; discussion with J. Schlegel; update 
discussions and correspondence with A. Craig re: 
Schlegel and follow-up call with SEIU. 

2.80 

12-Aug-14 Sagolili, Nicole Receipt of financial information from F. Lin 
(Fairview). 

0.10 

13-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to various correspondence with Schlegel; 
discussion with S. Mitra; attend to correspondence 
and discussions with C. Prophet; discussion with J. 
Schlegel; correspondence with A. Craig; attend to 
correspondence with P. Gertler; call to Pinchin. 

0.80 

14-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to correspondence with C. Prophet re: 
extension; discussion and correspondence with 
Pinchin re: coordination of additional testing; 
discussion and correspondence with J. Schlegel re: 
same; attend to discussions with L. Chambers re: 
same and follow-up re: outstanding information; 
correspondence with P. Gertler. 

0.60 

15-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with F. DiMaria re: additional testing; 
review correspondence from B. Schlegel re: 
generator tank issue; discussion with J. Schlegel; 
discussion with L. Chamber re: cost of testing; 
forward copy of executed APS to S. Mitra; 
correspondence with Pinchin re: B. Schlegel email 
Chambers re: asbestos review; discussion with 
Pinchin re: same. 

0.70 
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18-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to email from Pinchin re: asbestos survey; 
attend to response to Schlegel re: due diligence 
information request; preparation of report to court; 
discussion with L. Chambers re: due diligence 
matters; discussion with Schlegel re: same. 

2.40 

19-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Preparation of part of report to court; discussion 
with J. Schlegel. 

4.50 

20-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to correspondence from Schlegel; 
correspondence with A. Craig re: union issue. 

0.10 

20-Aug-14 Sagolili, Nicole Attend to draft report to court; review of file. 3.50 

21-Aug-14 Sagolili, Nicole Prepare interim R&D; attend to draft report to 
court; review of confidential supplemental report. 

3.00 

22-Aug-14 Sagolili, Nicole Attend to monitoring. 2.00 

22-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to matters concerning Schlegel due 
diligence; correspondence with Schlegel and L. 
Chambers re: same. 

0.30 

25-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to report to court; forward draft audited 
financial statements to Schlegel; follow-up with 
Pinchin re: test results. 

3.80 

26-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with F. DiMaria of Pinchin re: 2nd round 
of tests; attend to correspondence from Pinchin re: 
same; discussion with J. Schlegel re: test results; 
attend to various discussions and correspondence 
with Gowlings re: due diligence matters and 
Schlegel. 

0.70 

27-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with L. Chambers re: due diligence 
issues; review Pinchin's revised testing results; 
conference call with Schlegel, Conestoga Rovers and 
Pinchin; attend to various correspondence re: same; 
discussions with F. Lamie re: waiver of due 
diligence condition; preparation of report to court. 

3.10 

28-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Discussion with Pinchin re: test results; attend to 
various correspondence re: Schlegel due diligence 
condition and test results; correspondence with L. 
Chambers re: oil tank replacement; several calls to 
installer. 

1.00 

28-Aug-14 Sagolili, Nicole Attend to file administration matters. 0.10 
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29-Aug-14 Lem, Matthew Attend to various correspondence re: waiver of 
conditions; several discussions with J. Schlegel re: 
waiving of conditions and specifics related thereto; 
several discussions with F. Lamie re: same; 
discussion with P. Gertler re: revision to language in 
APS; discussion with L. Chambers re: same; 
discussion with A. Fogul of Gertler Kovan re: same. 

1.90 

    

And all other matters in connection with the administration of this receivership proceeding. 
 





APPENDIX H 



Court File No.: CV-1 3-I0365-00CL 

BETWEEN: 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

THE TORONTO-DOMINION BANK 

- and -

FAIRVIEW NURSING HOME LIMITED 

Applicant 

Respondent 

APPLICATION UN DER SUBSECTION 243(1) OF THE BANKRUPTCY AND 
INSOLVENCY ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. B-3, AS AMENDED 

AFFIDA VIT OF CLIFTON PROPHET 
(sworn September 12,2014) 

I, CLIFTON P. PROPHET, of the C ity of Toronto, in the Munic ipality of 

Metropolitan Toronto, MAKE OATH AND SAY: 

1. I am a partn er.at the law lirm o f Gowling Lafleur Henderson LLP ("Gowlings"). 

I am the billing professional for bill ings re lated to Gowlings' retainer with BOO Canada 

Limited ("unO") as receiver and as such have personal knowledge of the matters herein 

deposed. 

2. Pursuant to an Order of the Honourable Mr. Justi ce D. Brown dated December 3D, 

2013 (the "Receivership Order"), BOO was appointed as receiver (in such capacity. the 

"Receiver"), with respect to the assets, undertakings and properties of Fairview Nursing 

Home Limited (the "Debtor"). 



3. Gowlings has provided services and incurred disbursements in relation to general 

matter arising by the Receiver for the period from December 10, 2013 to August 31, 

20 14, totaling $145,549.03, inclusive of HST, as described in the Legal Cost Summary 

and the detailed invoice for Gowlings, all of which are attached hereto as Exhibit "A" 

(the "Gowlings' Dockets"). The Gowlings Dockets have been redacted where they 

reference information subject to privilege. 

4. Based on Illy review of the Gowlings Dockets and my personal knowledge of this 

matter, the Gowlings Dockets represent a fair and accurate description of the services 

provided and the amounts charged by Gowlings . 

5. I swear this affidavit in support of a motion for, among other things, approval of 

the Receivers ' fees and disbursements and those of its counsel and for no other or 

Improper purpose. 

SWORN before me at the City of To ron 10, 

in the Province of Ontario, 
this I th day of September, 2014. 

A CO~~Al1idaV iIS ' elc. 

) 
) 
) 
) 
) 
) 
) , 

CLIFTON P. PROPHET 



THIS IS EXHIBIT" A" TO TI-IE 

AFFIDAVIT OF CLIFTON P. PROPHET. 
SWORN BEFORE ME ON 

THIS 12'" DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 2014 

A Commissioner for in~davits 



Exhibit "A" 

LEGAL COSTS SUMMARY 

LAWYER YEAR OF CALL HOURLY RATE HOURLY RATE 
2013 2014 

Allen V. Craig 1980 N/A $735.00 

Rob Salisbury 1983 N/A $500.00 

Clifton l'rophet 1993 $775.00 $775.00 

Glen F. Jennings 1994 N/A $710.00 

Syll Kusbner 2005 N/A $580.00 

Frank Lamie 2007 $495.00 $555.00 

Jordan M. Smith 2010 N/A $300.00 

Cara B. Sklar 2011 N/A $410.00 

Micbael Lay Law Clerk N/A $305.00 

Lina Santos Law Clerk $290.00 $290.00 



SUMMARY OF ACCOUNTS 

No. Date of Account Fees Disbursements HST Total 

I. Dcccmber3t,2013 $11,671.00 S99.36 SI,522.35 SI3,292.71 

2. February 27,2014 525,264.50 S92.74 $3,288.00 S28,645.24 

3. March 31, 2014 S8,000.00 SO.OO 51,040.00 S9,040.00 

4. April 29, 2014 $3,472.50 SO.OO $451.42 $3,923.92 

5. August 15,2014 580,088.00 5130.73 SI0,428.43 590,647.16 

TOTALS $128,496.00 $322.83 SI6,730.20 $145,549.03 

Average Hourly Rate Tota l Fees before HST: SI28,496.00 
(before HST) ..;- Total Hours : 249 

~ $516.05 

TOTAL AMOUNT SI45,549.03 



BOO Canada Li mited 
ATTN: Matthew Lem 
Partner & Senior Vice President 
25 Main Street West 
Suite 805 
Hamilton ON L8P I H I 

Our Matter: T9967 10 I 189570 
RE: Rccci vership of Fairveiw Nursing: Home Limited 

TO OUR FEE: 

Fees for Professional Services 
HST on Fees 
Total Fees and Taxes 

DISBURSEMENTS: 

Disbursements (Taxable) 
Disbursements (Non-Taxable) 
H ST on Disbursements 
Total Disbursements and Tuxes 

TOTAL INVOI CE BALANC E: 

Total for this Invo ice 
( Total HST : $ 1,522.35] 

Deccmbcr 3!, 201 3 
INVOICE, 17887093 

$11.671.00 
1,517.23 

13, 188.23 

39.36 
60.00 

5.12 
104.48 

13,292.71 

1'lc:lSe remit totlll invoice bulancc due: In Canadian Dollars ~_::.$1:.;3::.,2;;9::2",.7~1,-

GOWLING LAFLE UR HEN DERSON LLP 

I'ER Cliff Prophet 

te rms: due upon ,ecelp' 
Inte,est at the ,ata 01 L3% pe' annum wUt be charged on alt a mounl5 nol paid within One montl! from the dale ofUIl$lnvolce 

Cl10IS and omissions cxcllllled 
GST/ H$T: 11936 4511 RT 

Gowling Lafleur Henderson up. Lawyers· Patent and Trade-matk Agents 
peg., .1 01 5 

1 First cal\adic1l1 Place ·100 KingStreet West· Suite 1600· Toronto· Ontario· M5X 1G5· canada ·r 41&862·7525 · F 41&662-7661· gowtings.oom 



gowlings 

BDO Ca nada Limited 
Our Matter: T996710 

December 3 [, 2013 
INVO ICE: 17887093 

Receivership of F:lirvciw Nursin g Home Limit ed 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

DIlle Hours 

10/121201 3 2.80 

11/ 12/20 13 0.60 

11 /1212013 0.70 

121121201 3 0.30 

13/1212013 0.70 

14/12/2013 0.10 

1611212013 1.50 

17/ 12/2013 3 .80 

Timekeeper 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Cliff Prophet 

Frank IJ. Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank O. Lamie 

Frank I). Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Descri ption 

Attendance to review detai led correspondence from J. Marin; 
attendance 10 meeting with C. Prophet; attendance to conrerence 
ca ll with J. Dietrich, J. Marin, and S. Mitra; attendance to 
correspondence to M. Lem; attendance to conference call w ith 
M. Lcm lind C. Prophet; attendance to correspondence to J. 
Marin rmd 1. Dietrich and S. Mitra; attendance to 
correspondence 10 M. urn; 

Attendance 10 correspondence and enclosures from S. Mitra; 
attendance to correspondence and enclosures to M. Lem; 
a!tendance to correspondence to S. Mitra; attendance to phone 
call with and instructions from M. Lem; al1endance to 
correspondence to S. Mitra, M. Lem, and C. Prophet; 

Ini tial consultation with c lient . 

Attendance to correspondence, enclosure, and instructions to F. 
Sasso; attendance to review correspondence and enclosure from 
S. Mitra: 

Attendance to correspondence and enclosure 10 M. Lem; 
rltlendrlnce to further correspondence wilh M. Lem; rlttendrlnce 
10 phone ca ll 10 S. Mitra; attendance to correspondence from S. 
Milra; atlendance 10 correspondence from J. l1i f' lr ; r' ''' """",h",ee 
In correspondence to J . Dietrich el al. 

; attendance to correspondence with S. Mitra; auendance 
to meeting with C. Prophet 

Attendance 10 correspondence to M. Lem and C. Prophet; 

Atlendance to con ference call with S. Val air from Ministry of 
Attorney Genera l on behalf of MOH; attendance to detailed 
correspondence and enclosure from S. Valair; attendance to 
correspondence with C. Prophet; attendance to review MOH 
commcnls; altendancc to correspondCllce with C. Prophet; 
atlendlmCe to correspondence with S. Valair; attendance to 
review correspondence and enclosurc from M. Lem; attendance 
to re view correspondence and e nclosures rrom J. M .. rin; 
attendAnce to phone call with J. Marin; attendance to 1nP''!ting 
with C. Prophet; attcndance to various correspondcnce , S. 
Mitra, C. Prophet and S. Va lair; attendance 10 review order and 
proposed riders to order; 

Attendance to review material, draft order, and proposed 
revisions; .. " endance to material to C. Prophet; attendrlnce to 

le<ms: due _ ,c«i!lC 
inCe' .... C ec Che ,ale e f 1..3% pt!. annum w~11x cha<ged on 1111 llmounl. not pe id wilhln one month from Iho dale of this Invo ice 

eno'S and omissions e~cll>ded 
~,e201 5 



gowling; 

Date Hours Timekeeper 

17112120 13 1.90 Cliff Prophet 

18112/2013 l.80 Frank D. Lam ie 

I 811 2/20 13 1.80 CliffProphcl 

1911212013 0.90 Frank D. Lam ie 

20/ 12/20 13 0.60 Frank D. Lamie 

Desc ription 

December 3 I, 2013 
INVO ICE: 17887093 

meeting with C. Prophet: attendance all conference call with S. 
Valair, J. Marin, J. Dietrich, and C. Prophet; attendance \0 
correspondence with M. Le m: attendance to corresponde nce 
from C. Prophet; attendance to meeting with C. Prophet; 
attendance 10 meeting with and comments from C. Prophe t; 
attendance \0 conference call with J. Marin, J. Dietr ich, and C. 
Prophet; attendance to correspondence to E. Machado; 
attendance \0 meeting with C. Prophet; attendance to 
correspondence and enclosure from M. Lem; attendance to 
further correspondence and enclosure from M. Lem; atte ndance 
to voice mail from M. Lem; attendance to vo ice mail from J. 
Marin; attendancc to call 10 E. Machado; attendance to 
correspondence to E. Machado; attendance to call with J . Mari n; 
[lttendance to cOlTespondence from S. Mitra; uttenJunce to 
review correspondence and enclosures from S. Mitra; atte ndance 
to review proposed amendments to Order; Attendance to 
conference call wi th E. Machado and S. Valair; attendance to 
conference c[lll with S. Mitra, E. Machado, S. Valair, J . Dietric h, 
:lIld J . Marin; attendance to meeting with C. I>rophet; attendance 
to draft correspondence to Justice Brown; attendance to 
correspondcnce to S. Mitra; attendance to correspondence from 
Justice Brown; attendance to phone call with M. Lem; 
attendance to correspondence, enclosure, and comments from E. 
Machado; attendance to materia l to C. Prophet; 

Review offonn of Order appointing receiver; instructions to F. 
L1mie; calls with S. Mitra and J. Dietrich; call wi th J. Mari n; 
furthcr e-ma ils with counsel to MOH; 

Attendance 10 meeting with C. Prophet; attendance to 
correspondence from S. Mitra; attendance 10 review 
correspondencc and cnclosures from J. Marin; attendance to 
rev iew rurther comments Oil draft Ordcr; attendance to meeting 
with C. Prophet; attendance to review long term care services 
accountability agreement; attendance to correspondence with M. 
Lcm: attendance to correspondence from C. Prophet; attendance 
to conference call with C. Prophet and M. Lem: attendance to 
meeting with C. Prophet; 

Review and comment o n proposed revisions to appointment 
order from MOl-I: review responses from J. Marin; e~mails re 
5<Lllle ; instruct ions to F. Lam ie; scttling ordcr; 

Altend[lnce 10 correspondence and enclosures from S. M itra; 
attendance to numerous and various correspondence, enclosures, 
lUl U comments from S. Mitra, J. Marin, R. Machado; attendance 
to review li nal materia l in preparation for Co urt ; 

Attendance to review orders and blaeklines; attendance to 
correspondence with S. Mitra; atte ndance to preparation for 
Court ; attendance to meet ing with all cOLinsel in Court; 
lIltendance in Court before Justice Brown; attendance to 
correspondence to M. Lem and C. Prophet; attendance to 

te rm" duotlilpon ,eceipt 
Inte,est a t the ,ote 01 LJ" pe. a<lnllm wiLl be charged on a~ lmounl$ not paLtI witllln on" mont h from th" dat e of this In~<>ic:e 

e,rors lin<! oml$slon5 e.clilded 



gowlin~ 

Date 1·lours Timekeeper 

23/1212013 1.40 Frank D. Lamie 

23112120 \3 1.20 Lina Santos 

24/12/2 01 3 O.SO Frank D. Lam ie 

24/1212013 1.00 Lina Santos 

30112/20 13 O. JO Frank D. Lamie 

Ocscription 

December 3 1, 2013 
INVOICE: 17887093 

correspondence and enclosure from S. M ilra; attendance to 
further correspondence from S. Mitra; 

Attendance to correspondence with M. Lem; attendance to voice 
mail rrom D. Griffi ths; attendance to further voice mail from M. 
Lem; attendance to correspondence and enclosures to D. 
Griffiths; attendance to correspondence, enclosure, and 
instructions to M. Lay and L. Santos; allendance to research; 
attendance to further detailed correspondence to M. Lem and D. 
Gri ffi ths; attendance to further correspondence and enclosure to 
L Santos; 

Attendance to correspondence from D. Griffit hs; anendance to 
correspondence to D. Griffiths and F. Sasso and instructions to 
F. Sasso; attendance to review fu rther correspondence from D. 
Griffiths; attendance to correspondence to D. Griffiths; 
attendance to review correspondence and enclosures from L. 
Santos; 

Attendance to correspondence from J. Marin and M. Lem; 

T ola l Fees for Professio nal Services $ 11.67 1.00 

DISBURSEM ENTS 

Non -Taxable Costs 

TeraView (Ontario) Onli ne Searches & Registration - Agency 

Tot:ll Non-T :u:ablc Disbursements 

T axable Cosls 

Scanning Service 

TeraView (Ontario) Onlille Searches & Registration - Taxable 

Conference Call Expenses 

T Ola l T ax:lhlc Disbu rsements 

terms: due ~ P<ln receipt 
interest at the '~te ol1.3% per annum wm be cha,gcd "" •• amounts no! paid wllnin one montn Irom th e date or this Invo ice 

er<OfS and ommlons ","chide<! 

560.00 

$60.00 

525 .00 

51 0.00 

54.36 

$39.36 

pega 4 015 



gowlings 
December 31, 2013 

INVOICE: 17887093 

Remittance Copy 

C lient: 189570 BOO Canada Limited 
T996710 Matter: 

REo 
Amount Due: 

Receivership of Fairveiw Nurs ing Horne Limited 
$ [3,292.71 

I' A VMENT BY C HEQ UE: 

Please return this page with your payment paya ble to Gowlin g Lafleur Henderson LLP 

Remit to : 

I'A YM ENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

I'ay by Swifl MT 103 Direct to: 
SW IFTCO DE: 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANSIT NUMBER: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAME: 

Gowling Lafleur HenderSOIl LLP 
PO Box 466, STN D 
Ollawa, ON Ki P le3 
Canada 

CIBCCATI 

C:madian Imperial Bmlk of Commerce 
119 Sp.1rks Street, Ott:lwa, ON KI P 5BS 

Gowl ing Lafleur Henderson LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600. Onawa ,ON KIP I e) 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): CDN Account: 41 -02916 
USD Account: 02 ·210 15 

International payment s intermed iary banking information: 
USD WELLS FARGO BANK, N.A. PNBPUS3NNYC (ABA 026005092) 

• ir paying by wire or EFT plcase c·maillhc rcminancc dClai ls 10 pJynlenls@gowlings.com 

te,.,.,,,, due upon ,eeeipt 
Inle,est lit the , .. Ie of 1.3% pet .... nurn .. ~I boeharged on .. " amounts not paid within one month from th e dale cllhl$lnvolee 

pagoSof5 



BOO Canada Limited 
A TI'N: Malthew Lem 
Partner & Senior Vice President 
25 Main Street West 
Suite 805 
Ham ilton ON L8P I H I 

O ur Matter: T9967 iO 1 189570 
RE, Receivership of Fairvciw Nursing Home Limitcd 

TOOUR FEE: 

Fees for Professional Services 
Adjusunenl 
To tal Fees for Professional Services 
HST 011 Fees 
Tolal Fees :lnd Taxes 

DISBURSEM ENT S: 

Disburscmcnts (Taxable) 
Disbursements (Non-Taxable) 
HST on Disbursemcnts 
Tota l Disbursements and Taxes 

TOTAL INVOICE BALANC E: 

Total for th is Invoice 
( Total HST: $3,288.00 ] 

February 27, 2014 
INVOICE; 17920766 

535,264.50 
(10,000.00) 
25 ,264,50 

3,284.39 
28,548.89 

27.74 
65.00 

3.61 
96.35 

28,645.24 

Please remit lotal invoice balance due: III Can adiall Dollars __ ;:$2::8:,;,6::;4:;;5".2;:4"-

COWLING LAFLEUR HENDERSON LLP 

I'ER Cli ff Prophcl 

Our services ale provided In accordance with our Standard Retainer Terms (www.gowllngs.com/ RelalnarIermsl .subJecttoanyotherwrltten 
reta iner agreement entered Into between tlwl PIIrUes. 

re,ms: duCl upen receipt 
Interest Pt the , DIG 011.3% pCI Pnnum .... 111 be ella' IIed on PII "mounls nClI paid wllhln CIne month Irom the date 01 thl. invoice 

Erro,s and Oml!LSIOn$ excluded 
GST/ KST: 11936 4511 RT 

Gowling Lafleur Henderson up. Lawyers· Patent and Trade-mark Agents 
page 1. GI 6 

1 First Cmladlan Place ·100 King StICet West·Suite 1600· Toronto· Onwrio· M5X 1G5 . Galklda· T 41&862·7525· F 416862·7661· gowlings.com 



gowlings 

BOO Cll nada Li mit ed 
Our Maller : T9967 10 

February 27, 2014 
INVOICE: 17920766 

Receivershi p of Fa irvciw Nursing Home Limit ed 

PROFESS IONAL SE I~V ICES 

Dale Hours Tim ekeeper Desc ription 

06/0 1/20 14 0. 10 Frank O. Lamie Auenclance to correspondence from C. Prophet and 1. Marin; 
attendance to correspondence from M. Lem; attendance 10 
further correspondence from C. Prophet; 

07/01 /2014 2.40 Cl iff Prophet Call to client re deal ings with Ministry; call with Fairview 
counsel, eSlUlC counsel and bank courlsel; all party call with 
M inislrY re deferml of reconciliation clllims; 

09/0 1/2014 0.70 CHlT Prophet Comment on letter prepared by J. Marin re deferra l of Ministry 
reconciliation claims; 

10/01120 14 0.30 Frank O. Lamie Aucndance to meeti ng wilh C. Prophet; attendance to review 
correspondence and various cnclosures from M. Lcm; 

17/0 1120 14 0.10 Fmnk O. Lam ie AUcnd[l!lcc to correspondence from M. Lcm; 

21/01120[ 4 0.20 Frank D. Lamie Attendance to correspondence and enclosure from M. Lem; 
Ancndanec \0 review correspondence and cnclosures from M. 
Lem; 

23/01 /20 14 0. 20 ClifT Prophet Call fro m M. LClll; 

27/01 120 14 0.90 Frank D. Lmnie Altendanee to voice mail from O. Griffiths; attcndance to 
meeting wilh C. Prophet; attendance to correspondence from O. 
Griffith; ancndance to correspondence to D. Griffith's; 
anend,mce to correspondence from M. Lem; attendance to 
correspondence and enclosure frOIll C. Prophet; attendance to 
further corrcspondence from D. Griffith's; attendance to 
correspondence from C. Prophet ; allendancc \0 agreement of 
purchase and sale; 

27/01120 14 0.50 Cliff Prophet Cal! from M. Lem; review of e-mail and review and comment 
on listing agreement: 

28/01/20 14 0.20 Frank D. Lamie Attendance to correspondence with D. Griffith's; attcndance to 
review correspondence and enclosure from M. Lem; 

29/01120 14 2.90 Fmnk O. Lamie Attendance to comments and confidentiality agreement; 
attendance to correspondence and enclosure to D. Griffiths; 
attendance to review and furt her revise confidentiality 
agrecment; attendance to correspondence and comments From 
M. Lcm; attendanec to correspondence and enclosure to D. 
Griffiths and M. Lem: attendance to agreement of purchase and 
sale; 

29/0[ /2014 0.80 Cliff Prophet Calls with E. Machado of MAG , 

30/01 /20 14 2.80 Frank D. Lamie Attendance to agreement of purchase and sale; attendance to 
dra ft receiver's cert ificate; attendance to corrcspondcnce and 
enclosure to C. Prophet; attendance to correspondence and 

Te,,,,,, d .. e upon ,c-celpt 
Inl"«>51 " I Ute '''Ieol 1..3'JI, per "nnum will be Chlt'ied (Hl 1111 amounls nOI paid with;" one monlh h om t~ doll" 01 lhls Invok:" 

Enon and oml"';om excluded 
pac:e 20f6 



gowlings 

OllIe Hou rs 

30/0112014 1.50 

31 /0 1/2014 0.1 0 

03/02/2014 0.20 

04/02120 14 2.90 

04/02/2014 0.30 

04/02/20 14 0.30 

05/0212014 1.30 

07/02/20 14 2.80 

07/0212014 0.50 

10/02120 14 4.70 

10/02/20 14 0.30 

11 /02 /20 14 5.10 

Timekeeper 

C liO' Prophet 

Frank O. Lamie 

Frank D. Lmnie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Michael Lay 

Cliff Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Fm nk D. Lamie 

Cli fT Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Michael Lay 

Frank D. L'trnic 

Descri ption 

February 27, 201 4 
INVOIC E: 17920766 

enclosure from M. Lcm; attendance to correspondence and 
enclosures from O. Griffiths: :lttcndance to furt her 
correspondence. enclosure, and comments to D. Griffiths; 
attendance 10 call with D. Gri ffi ths; attendance to APS; 
attendance to fu rther correspondence and enclosures from D. 
Griffiths; attcndllllcc to correspondence, enclosure, and 
comments to D. Griffiths; 

Review of receiver's certificate; review of Ministry deferral 
lettcr: advice re delivery of ccrti fi cate; call from counsel to 
Fairview: 

Attendance to review correspondencc and enclosure from M. 
Lcm: 

Attendance to correspondence from D. Griffiths; attendance to 
review list ing agreement; 

Attendance 10 correspondence from D. Griffiths; allendance to 
review COLIrt Order; attendance to draft listing agreement 
provisions; allendance to correspondence to D. Griffiths ; 
auendance to further correspondence from D. Griffiths ; 
attendance to correspondence to O. Griffiths: attendance to 
correspondence and inslmclions \0 M. Lay; attendance to 
correspondence lmd enclosure from M. L'lY; attendance to 
correspondence and fu rther instmctiolls to M. Lay; attendance to 
correspondencc and cnclosures to D. Griffiths; attenda nce to 
correspondence with and further instntctions 10 M. Lay; 

Call with M. LClJ\ rc envi rolllllentallllauers; 

Attendance 10 meeting wi th, update to, and instructions from C. 
Prophet: attendance to correspondence fro m M. Lem; attendance 
10 draft agrecment o f purchase and sale; 

Attendance to correspondence fro m C. Prophet; attendance to 
draft Agreemcnt of Purchase and Sale; attendance to 
correspondence from C. Prophet and M. Lem; 

call with M. Lc m; 

Attendance to correspondence with D. Giffiths; attendance to 
dran and revise agreement of purchase and sale; attendance to 
draft schedules to agreement o f purchase and sale; attendance to 
correspondence from M. Lay; attendance to correspondence 10 
M. Lay; attendance to correspondence to D. Griffiths; 

Attendance to review correspondence and enclosures from D. 
Griffiths; attendance to review confidentiali ty and non-

Tc,mo: due upon receipt 
Imerest at tile ,aloof 1.3% pel a nnum ... ill be eM.ged on aN a mounts not paid within one month from Ille dale of Illis invoice 

peg03016 



gowlings 

O .. tc Hours 

12/02/2014 4.10 

12/02/20 14 1.60 

13/0212014 3.30 

13/02/20 14 0.10 

14/02/2014 3.70 

18/02/20 14 0.10 

18/02/20 14 2.10 

Timekeeper 

fnmk D. Lamie 

ClilT Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Michael Lay 

Frank D. Lam ie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Cli ff Prophet 

Desc ription 

February 27. 20 14 
INVOICE: 17920766 

disclosure agreement; attendance to comments and enclosure to 
D. Griffiths; allendance to correspondence, enclosure, and 
comments to D. Griffiths; attendance to meeting with C. 
Prophet; :lttendance to review and revise Agreement of Purchase 
and Sale; attendance to revicw further correspondence from D. 
Griffiths and M. Lem; altcndance to phone call with D. 
Griffiths; attendance to druft form of approval and vesting order; 
attendance to dr-If! b ill of sale and il ssignmenl ; 

Attendance to meeting with C. Prophet; attendance 10 
conference call with M. Lem and C. Prophet ; attendance to 
meeting with and instructions from C. Prophet; attendance to 
review and revise agreement o f purchase and sale; attenda nce to 
correspondence and enclosure to C. Prophet; attendance to 
correspondence and further enclosure to C. Prophet; attendance 
to review correspondence and enclosure from C. Prophet; 
attendance to correspondence from D. Griffiths; attendance to 
fu rther correspondence and enclosure from C. Prophet ; 
attendance to correspondence and enclosure from D. Griffiths; 
attendance to correspondence from M. Lem; attendance to 
further correspondence and enclosure from D. Griffiths; 
attendance to correspondence and enclosure from J. Jensen; 
attendance to further correspondence with D. Griffi ths; 
allendance to further correspondence and enclosure from D. 
Griffi ths; 

call with M. Lem and e-l11ails re same; 

Attend.mce to correspondence from M. Lay; attendance to 
review tax certificate; attendance to instructio ns \0 F. Sasso; 
attendance to correspondence and enclosure to D. Griffiths aod 
M. Lem; attendance to Agreement o f Purchase and Sale; 
attendance to draft escrow agreement; 

Allend<lnce to correspondence mId enclosures form D. Griffi ths; 
attendance to review and revise escrow ngreement; attendance to 
revise agreement of purchase and sale; attendance to 
correspondence and instruct ion to L. Taylor; attendance to 
meeting with and fu rther instructions to L. Taylor; attendance to 
materia l to C. Prophet; attendance to furt her instructioIlS and 
enclosures to L. Taylor; attenda nce to correspondence with L. 
Taylor: attendance 10 meeting with L. Taylor; attendance to 
correspondence from S. Jensen; attendance to meeting with C. 
Prophet; 

Attendance to correspondence with C. Prophet; 

Review and revise agrement of purchase and sale; instructions to 
F. L'lmie re same; 

rerm!: due upon reeelpt 
Interest .. t the .ate of L3'11. Pe< annllm wilt be c ..... Ced on alt amounts not paid within On e montn ' rom Ine date 01 tnlslnvolce 

pace 4 of 6 



gowlings 

Date Hours 

19/02 /2014 3.30 

19102/20[4 1.90 

24/02120 14 3.40 

25102120 14 3.20 

Timekeeper 

Frank D. Lamie 

ClifT Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. Lam ie 

Dcscripliol1 

February 27, 201 4 
INVO IC E: 17920766 

Attendance to review and revise agreement o f purchase and sale, 
schedules, tInd exhibits; attendance \0 meeting with C. Prophet; 

Instruct ions \0 F. Lam ie . 

Allendancc to correspondence with D. Griffiths; attend<lIlCe to 
meeting with C. Prophet; attendance to correspondence and 
enclosure to D. Griffiths; attendance to review correspondence 
and detailed enclosure from M. Lcm; attendance to meeting with 
and comments from C. Prophet; attendance to minor revisions to 
ugrccment of purchase and sale ,md rehl\ed schedules and 
exhibits; 

Attendance to finul ize agreement of purchase and sale, 
schedules, and ex hibits for data room; attendance to 
correspondence and enclosures 10 D. Griffiths; attendance to 
material and instructions to F. Sasso; attendance to meeting with 
and update to C. Prophet; al\endance 10 correspondence and 
enclosures to C. Prophet; 

Fees for Professional Services 

Adjustment 

535,264.50 

$(10,000.00) 

$25.264.50 Total Fees fo r Professional Services 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Non-T:u:ab le Costs 

0 5102/20 14 

Taxable Costs 

Copying 

Courier 

Agcnt Fees - Non-Taxablc 
VEN DOR: Treasurer. City of Toronto; INVOICEff : T9967 10-
02052014 ; DATE: 02/05/2014 - T9967 10 - Tax Certi ficate: M. 
Lay 

Tot al Non-Taxable Disbursements 

TcraView (Ontario) Online Searches & Registration - Taxablc 

Tot al Taxablc Disburscmcnts 

Tt,ms; due UjKKl 'Keipt 
III' e<est Dt the ,,,'e ol1.3% pc< annum will be c .... rged on an amotJnlS not paid within o""month from the dSte 01 this In~o ico 

E",us IIIId omissions " . eluded 

$65.00 

$0.25 

$7.49 

$20.00 

$27.74 

pags50t6 



gowling; 
February 27, 201 4 

INVO ICE: 17920766 

Remittance Copy 

Client: 189570 BOO Canada Limited 
1'996710 Matter: 

RE, 
A mount Due: 

Receivership ofFairvciw Nitrsing Home Lim ited 
$28,645.24 

PAYMENT BY C HEQUE: 

Please return this page with your payment payable to Cowling Lafleur Henderson LLP 

Remit to: 

PA YMENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

Pay by Swift MT 103 Dirccllo: 
SW1FTCQDE: 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANS IT NUMBER, 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAM E: 

Gowling La fl eur Henderson LLP 
PO Box 466, STN D 
Ottawa,ON KIP l e3 
Canada 

CIBCCATT 

Canadian Imperial Ban k of Commerce 
119 Sparks Street. Ottawa, ON K I P 5B5 

00 10-00006 

Gowling L,fleur Henderson LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600, Ottawa ,ON KI P I C3 

BENEFICIA RY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): CON Account: 41-029 16 
USD Account: 02-210 15 

Inlcrnalionalpaymcnts intermed iary banking information: 
USD WELLS FARGO BANK. N.A. PNBPUS3NNYC (ABA 026005092) 

• ifpayi ng by wi re or EFT please e-Inail the remittance details to paymenls@gowlings.com 

Te,ms: due upon ,eceipt 
Inlerest allh" ,ale 01 L3" per annum will be (""..ge<! on 1)U amou ..... s 001 paid willlin one monlh Irom Iho dale ol lhls In.oIce 

Errors /IIId omissions e.cluded 
page 6 of 6 



BOO Canada Limited 
A TIN: Mauhew Lem 
Partner & Senior Vice President 
25 Main Street West 
Suite 805 
Hamilton ON LSI' I H I 

Our Maller: T9967 10 I 189570 
RE: Receivership of Fa irview Nursing Home Limited 

TOOUR FE E: 

Fces for Professional Services 
Adjustment 
Total Fees for Professiona l Services 
HST on Fees 
Total Fees and Taxes 

TOTAL INVO ICE BALA NCE: 

TOIaI for Ihis Invoice 
[ Total l·tST: $1 ,040.00 1 

March 31 , 2014 
INVO ICE: 17938278 

$12,543.50 
(4 ,543.50) 
8,000.00 
1,040.00 
9,040.00 

9,040.00 

Please remit tota l invoice balance due: In C an ad i an Dolla rs _~~$~9~,0~4~0~.0~0:" 

GOW LI NG LAFUWIl. HE NDERSON LLP 

PElt ClifT Prophet 

Our services are provided In aecorda~ wIth our Standard Retainer Terms rwww.!!owIIO!!s.com/RotalnorTerms).subJect toanyotherwrltten 
retainer agreement entered Into between the parties. 

Te,ms, due uJ>On receipt 
tnt erest at the ,ate of 1.3% per annum witt be "M'lled on 8ti amounts nol paid within one montll hom the dale oIll1tl In_oke 

Erro,s and omlulons e.~tuded 
GST/ H5T: U936 45U RT 

Gow1ing Lafleur Henderson up . Lav.yers· Patent and Trade-ma~ Agents 
page 1of4 

1 First Cm.adian PIoce ·100 KingSlICCt West· Suite 1600· TOIooto· OlltJrio· M5X 1G5· can.1da . T 416-S62·7525· F 41&862·7661· gowtings.com 



gowlings 

BOO Ca nada Limited 
Our Matter: T996710 

March 31, 2014 
INVO ICE: 17938278 

Recei vers hip of Fairview Nursing Home Limited 

PROFESSIONAL SERV ICES 

Date Hours 

20/02120 14 0.60 

24 /02/2014 0.70 

25/02/2014 2.20 

26/02/2014 5.20 

27/02/2014 2.30 

2710212014 ' .50 

28/02/20]4 2.30 

Timekeeper 

Fmnk O. L'un ic 

Cliff Prophet 

Frank D. Lami e 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank O. Lamie 

Cliff Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Oescription 

AUcndallce \0 review correspondence and enclosure from M. 
Lcm; Attendance to review comments; Attendance to 
correspondence and comments to M. Lcm; 

Instructions \0 F. Lamie ' 

AUendance to To.: view correspondence and detailed enclosure 
frOIll M. Lcm; Attendance to C01Tcspondcnce frOIll D. Griffi ths; 
Attendance to review correspondence and enclosure from D. 
Griffiths; Attendance to conference call with and comments 
from D. Griffi ths; Attendance to meeting wi th and update to C. 
Prophet; 

Attendnnce to conference call with and comments from D. 
Griffiths; Attendance 10 review and revise agreement of 
purchase and sale: Attendance to nm and review black line; 
Allendance to instructions to A. Cano; Attendance to 
correspondence and enclosures to M. Lcm, D. Griffiths, and C. 
Prophet ; Attendance to call with M. Lem; Attendance to 
correspondence with D. Griffith s;Meeting with C. Prophet; 

Auendance to correspondence and enclosure to C. Prophet; 
Attendance to meeting with C. Prophet ; Attendance to 
confere nce call with M. Lem and D. Griffiths; Attendance to 
meeting Wi lh C. Prophet; Attendance to meeting with and update 
to C. Prophet ; At1endance to correspondence and enclosures to 
C. Prophet; attendance to voice mail wi th C. Ilrophet; 
Altcndancc to phone call with C. Prophet; Attendance to 
conference call with D. Griffiths; Attendance to comments from 
D. Griffiths; Attendance to correspondence and enclosure from 
D. GrifTiths; Attendance to further correspondence and 
enclosure from D. Griffiths; attendance to review coll ective 
agreements; allendancc to review memorandum of settlement; 
allen dance to review empl oyee list ; mtendance to review leases; 
Attendance to correspondence from D. Griffiths; Attendance to 
correspondence 10 D. Griffiths: 

Review and revise agreement of purchase and sale for bidders; 

Anendance \0 correspondence and enclosure from D. Griffiths; 
Attendance \0 review comments on Agreement of Purchase and 
Sale; Attendance to correspondence to O. Griffiths: Attendance 
10 voiccmai l from D. Griffiths; Attendance to phone call with D. 
Griffiths; Attendance to correspondence and instructions to L 
Taylor; Attendance to review correspondence and enclosures 
from J. Jensen and D. Griffiths; Allendance to meeting wi th C. 

Term., due upon . C'(:e!pl 
tole.esta, I"" rale 01 1.3% per anoum w~1 be charged '"' all amountS I'IOt paid ";thlfl OnD month lrom the dale of IhlslnvDk:e 

paCe 2 014 



gowling; 

Dale Hours 

28/02/2014 0.80 

04/0312014 0.20 

04/03 /20 14 1.50 

05/03/2014 0.50 

05/0312014 0.60 

06/0312014 

07/03 /2014 

10/03 /2014 

10/03 /20 [4 

14/03 /2014 

0.30 

0.10 

lAO 

0.20 

0.10 

Tim ekeeper 

ClifT Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Cliff Prophet 

Frank O. Lamie 

CliffProphcl 

frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. L1mic 

eli rr Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Fees for Professional Services 

Adjustment 

Desc ript ion 

March 3 1, 2014 
INVOICE: 17938278 

Prophet; Attendance to conference call with M. Lem, D. 
Griffiths; Attendance to conference call wilh M. Lem, D. 
Griffiths, c. Prophet, and J. Jensen; Attendance to conference 
call with M. Lem; Attendance to meeting with C. Prophet; 
Attendance to correspondence and enclosure from M. Lcm; 

Cal! with c lient rc form of agreement of purchase and sale; 

Attendance to correspondence and enclosure from C. Prophet; 
attendance to correspondence from M. Lern; 

Review and comment 011 APS fonn; rcview and comment on 
disclosure issues on Phase II environmental audit findings; 

Attendance to correspondence from C. Prophet; attendance to 
correspondence and enclosure from O. Griffiths; attendance to 
correspondence nnd enclosure from M. Lem; allendance to 
review corrcspondence and enclosures from C. Prophet; 
allcndance to meeting with C. Prophct; 

Attendance to correspondence from J. Jensen; attendance to 
review correspondence and enclosurc from O. Griffiths; 
attendance 10 correspondence from C. Prophet; attcndance to 
correspondence and various enclosures from M. Lem; 
attendance to correspondence from J. Jcnsen; 

Attendance to correspondence and enclosure from M. Lem; 

Attendance to review correspondence, enclosure, and comments 
from D. Griffiths; attendance to meeting with and update to C. 
Prophet; attendance to correspondence and comments to O. 
Griffiths and M. Lem; attendance to conference call with O. 
Griffiths; attendance to further correspondencc to D. Griffiths; 

Review of requested NOA changes; 

Attendance to correspondence from M. Lem; 

T olal I~ees for Professional Services 

$12 ,543.50 

$(4,543.50) 

$8,000.00 

Te,ms: due upon ,ecelpt 
Inte .e.t a t thO ,ate of U % po' annum .. ~t becharged on alt amount, not paid within one month hom the dal" at thiS in.oIce 

('fOrI and omissions e.u;luded 
pege3014 



gowlings 

Remittance Copy 

Cl ient : 
Matter: 
RE : 
Amount Due: 

189570 BOO Canada Limited 
T9967 10 
Rece ivership o f Fairview Nursing Home Lim ited 
$9,040.00 

I)A YM ENT BY CHEQUE: 

March 3 1, 20 14 
INVO ICE: 17938278 

Please return this pflgC with yo ur payment payable 10 Gowling Laneur Henderson LLP 

Remit 10: 

PA YMENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

Pay by Swifl MT 103 Oirect to: 
SIV IFTCOOE, 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANSIT NUM BER: 

BEN EFIC IA RY ACCOU NT NAM E: 

Gowl ing LaOcur Henderson LLP 
PO Box 466, ST N 0 
Ottawa, ON KIP I C3 
Canada 

CIBCCATf 

Canadian Imperial Bank o fCo mll1crcc 
119 Sparks Street, Ollawl\, ON KIP 58 5 

00 10-00006 

Gow ling Lafleur Henderson LLP 
160 Elg in Street, Suile 2600, Ottawa ,ON K I P le3 

BENE FIC IARY ACCOUNT NUM BER(S): CON Account: 41 -029 16 
USD Account: 02-2 10 15 

In ternation al payments in termed iary bunking in form atio n: 
US D WELLS FARGO BAN K, N.A. PNB PUS3NN YC (A BA 026005092) 

• i f paying by wire or EFT please c-maillhe remil1ancc delails 10 paYl1lcn1s@goll' li nJ;.~.c olll 

Termr.: due upon receipt 
Interest attll& ' ill& of 1.3% pe< .. nnum will be Charged on iln a ....... nls no, paid wi,lIin onemon,h from 'he dale 011 1115 invoke 

[trOIS 8IId omissions e . <:luded 



BOO Canada Limitcd 
A'ITN: Matthcw LClll 
Partner & Senior Viee President 
25 Main Street Wcst 
Suite 805 
Hamilton ON L8P I H I 

Our Maller: 1'9967 10 / 189570 
RE: Receivership of Fairview Nursing Home Limited 

TOOUR FEE: 

Fees for Profess ional Services 
Adjustmcnt 
Total Fees for Professiona l Services 
HST on Fces 
Tolal Fees and T:lXcs 

TOTAL INVOICE HALANCE: 

Total for this Invoice 
[ Total HST: $451.42 J 

April 29, 20 14 
INVOICE: 17957628 

14,525.00 
(1 ,052.50) 
3,472.50 

45 1.42 
3,923.92 

3,923.92 

Pleasc rcmil tota l invo ice balance due: In Canadian Doll ars _ _ ~S~3~,9~2~3~,9~2,-

GOWLING LAFLEUI~ HENDI-:RSDN LLP 

PER Cliff Propbet 

Our services (Ire proYlded In accordance with our Standard Retainer Terms (DW.gQWlln#s.com/ RelploerJerms), subject to aoy other written 
retaIner agreement entered 1010 between the parties. 

T~rms: due upon rKelp! 
!nlmaSI allhe rala of 1.3% per annum wilt be charged on a ll ameun!s no! ""III wllhln one man.h ',om .fle dala of Ihlllnvolea 

Errors and emlsslens C~cl udcd 
G5T/ H5T: 11936 4511 RT 

Gowling Lafleur Henderson ll.P. Lawyers· Patent ond Trade-mark Agents 
page 1014 

1 First Canndion PIare ·100 King StrccI West . Suite 100)· TOfOnto ·On\.:uio· M5X lG5 ·Cmod..l • T 41&862·7525 . F 41G-862·7661 · gow1ings.com 



gowlings 

BOO Canada Limited 
Our Mall er : T996710 

April 29, 2014 
INVOICE: 17957628 

Receivership or Fa in'iew Nursing Home Limited 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Date Hours Timekeeper 

17/03/2014 0.10 Frank D. Lamie 

2510312014 0. 10 Frank D. Lamie 

27/03/20 14 0.10 Frank D. Lmnic 

28/03/20 14 1.1 0 Frank D. Lamie 

31/03/2014 0.20 Frank D. Lamie 

01/04/2014 0.60 Frank D. Lamie 

01 /0412014 0.30 Cliff Prophet 

02104/2014 1.40 Frank D. Lamie 

03/04/2014 0.10 Frank D. Lamie 

04104120 14 0.10 Frank O. Lamie 

14/0412014 0.10 Frank D. Lamie 

15104/2014 0.10 Frank D. Lamie 

16/04/2014 0.70 Frank D. Lamie 

I)cscri lHioll 

Attendance to review correspondence and enclosure from M. 
Lcm; 

Attendance to meeting with C. Prophet regarding status of 
proceeding; 

Attendance to correspondence from P. Ozyetis; 

Ancndancc to meeting with C. Prophet; attendance to phone call 
with M. Lem; ;lItcndanee to phone call wilh M., Lcm; attendance 
to correspondence from P. Ozyetis; lIttendanee to 
correspondence to P. Ozyetis; attendancc to con ference call with 
C. Prophel; attendance 10 voice mail from C. Prophet; 
attendance to phone call with C. Prophet; 

Attendance to various correspondence from and with M. Lem 
and C. Prophet; attcndance to corrcspondence and enclosures 
from M. Lem; attendance to review various correspondence with 
M. Lem and C. Prophet; 

Attendance to meeting with C. Prophet; attendance on 
conference call with M. Lcm and C. Prophet; attendance to 
meeting wi th C. Prophet; 

Review of phase II assessment report and advice re dealing with 
same; 

Attendance to revicw correspondence and enclosure from D. 
Griffiths; attendance to review further correspondcnce from D. 
Griffiths; attendance to correspondence to D. Griffiths; 
attendance to correspondence and enclosure from M. Lem; 
allendance to correspondence and enclosure from D. Griffiths; 
attendance to further correspondence and enclosure from M. 
Lem; attendance 10 further correspondence from O. Griffiths; 
attendance to correspondence to D. Griffi ths; attendance to 
phone call with P. Ozyetis; 

Attendance to correspondence to C. Ilrophel; 

Attendance to correspondence from D. Grifftihs; attendance to 
correspondence and cOlllments to D. Griffiths; 

Attendance to correspondence from M. Lem; attendance to call 
wi th M. Lcm; 

Attendance 10 correspondence from C. Prophet; 

Attendance to meeting with C. Prophet; further attendance to 
confercnce call with M. Lem and C. Prophet; further attendanec 
10 furt her meet ing wi th C. Prophet; filnhcr attendance to 

Term., due uPOn 'e<:eipt 
I~tc"!$t <II the rate 01 1.3% pel annum wilt be chatgcd on atl amounts nat paid wtthln one montlll,om the date of this !nvolce 

pice 2 III 4 



gowlings 

Dalc Hours 

16/04120 14 0.70 

17/04120 14 0.80 

17/04/2014 0.90 

Timekeeper 

el i 0' Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Cliff Prophet 

Fees for Professional Services 

Adj ustment 

Desc ription 

April 29, 2014 
INVOICE: 17957628 

correspondencc from C. Prophet; further altcndancc to 
correspondence from D. Lobi; 

Allcndancc to meeting with C. Prophet; altcndance to 
conference call; ,llIenoanee to further conference call with S. 
Mitra and C. Prophet; 

Call on salc process with M. Lcm and all stakeholders; 

Tola l Fees for Professional Services 

54,525.00 

5C I,052.50) 

$),472.50 

Term" d~e upon re~clpl 
Interest al th e mte of 1.3" PC' II"" .. ", ... ~I be ch"~" on all """,unls nol paid ";\hln one month from the dalC 01 this Invoice 

PIICe 3014 



gowlings 
April 29, 20 14 

INVOICE: 17957628 

Remittance Copy 

Client: 189570 BOO Canada Limited 
1"996710 Maller: 

RE , 
Amount Due: 

Receivership of Fairview Nursing Home Limited 
$3.923.92 

PA YMENT BY C HEQUE: 

Please ret urn this page wilh your p:I)' II1('1I1 paYllbl(, to Cowling L.afl eur Henderson LL P 

Remit to: 

PA YMENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

P:.y by Swift 1\1T 103 Direct to: 
SWIPrCODE: 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANSIT NUMBER: 

BEN EFIC IARY ACCOUNT NAM E: 

Gowli ng Lafl eur Henderson LLP 
PO Box 466, STN 0 
Ouawa,ON KI P l e3 
Cantloa 

CIBCCATT 

Canadian Imperial Bank of Commcrcc 
119 Sparks Street, Ottawa, ON KIP 585 

00 10-00006 

Gowli ng Lafleur Henderson LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600, Ottllwa .ON KIP le3 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): CDN Account: 41-02916 
USD Account : 02-2101 5 

In terna tional payments intermed ia ry banking in fo rm ation: 
USD WELLS FA RGO BANK, N.A. PNBPUS3NNYC (ABA 026005092) 

• ir paying by wire or EFT please e-mail thercminanccdcUlils top •• ymcll ts@gowlings.com 

r etms.: du .. upon " ,eelpl 
Inte rest ", th .. . ~\e 01 L3% per tlnnum win be cha'Ged on 1I~ amounts nOI paid within on .. month lrom the dat e 01 thts Invoice 

E"0'5 ""eI om,»tons e. clueled 
pate 4 of 4 



gowl i ngs ~",,,.,, "Cn.,,· ,.,"', ,,,"',,",". "01""" "'''''''''' ' 0' "'"" "''' bo"'"" ""'''W .",,"," 

BOO CUllada Limited 
AlTN: Matthew LClll 
Partner & Senior Vice President 
25 Main Street West 
Suite 805 
Hamilton ON L8P I H I 

Our Matter: T9967 10 / 189570 
RE: Receivership of Fa irview Nursing !-I ome Limited 

TOQUR FEE: 

Fees for Professional Services 
Adjustment 
T01al Fees for Professional Services 
HST 011 Fees 
Total Fees and Taxes 

DI SBURSEi\'! ENTS: 

Disbursements (Taxable) 
HST on Disbursements 
Tota lOisbu rs(' mc nts li nd Taxes 

TOTAL INVOICE BALANCE: 

Total for this In voice 
[ T0I311·IST: SI0,428.43] 

August 15, 2014 
INVOICE: 18029490 

590,088 .00 
(10,000.00) 
80,088 .00 
10,411.44 
90,499.44 

130.73 
16.99 

147.72 

90,647.16 

Please remit tota l invoice ba lance due: In Canad ian Dollars _ _ ~5~9~0~,6~4~7~. 1~6,-

COWLING LAFLEUR HENDEHSON LLP 

I'ER CliITProphct 

Our services are provided In accordance with our Standard Retainer Terms (www.gowl/ngs.com/Reta!nerTerrnsi.subjecttoanyotherwritten 
reta iner agreement entered Into between the parties. 

Te<ms: due upon ,ecelp! 
!n!o.u ! at thO .ate or 1.~ pe, .. nnum will be ch" ',ed en ali amounts no! paid within one month frem the date of this Invoice 

Eno,s and oml$Sion . ... eluded 
GST/ HST; 11936 4511 Rf 

Gov.1ing Lafleur Henderson up. LaW}'CtS· Patent and Traderoalk Agents 
page 1. of 12 

1 FitSt Dln.1di<JI1 PIilcc, 100 King SInX:t West· Suite 1600· Toronto · Ont..1tio, M5X 1G5 ,C<lmtd<l . T 41&862-7525 · F 416-862-7661· gowIiDgs.oom 



gowlings 

BDO Canada Limited 
OUf MaHer: T996710 

August 15. 2014 
INVO ICE: 18029490 

Receivership or Fairview Nursing Home Limit ed 

PROFESS IONAL SERVICES 

Date Hours 

22/04/2014 0.30 

22/0412014 0.70 

24/0412014 0.40 

24/0412014 0.50 

25/04120 14 1.90 

25104/20 14 2.70 

2510412014 0.40 

28/0412014 2.70 

28104/2014 1.80 

30/04/2014 0.70 

01 /05/2014 1.10 

Timekeeper 

Frank O. L1mic 

Cliff Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Fmnk D. Lamie 

Cliff Prophet 

Lilla Santos 

Frank D. Lamie 

Cliff Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Description 

Attendance to meeting with C. Prophet; attendance to 
correspondence and enclosure to C. Prophet; attendance 10 

correspondence from M. Lcm; attendance to correspondence 
from C. Prophet; attendance to further correspondence and 
enclosure from C. Prophet; 

Attendance to correspondence from C. Prophct; attendance to 
voice ma il from C. l'rophet; Attendance to review material; 
further attendance to correspondcnce to M. Lem; 

Attendance to meeting with and instnlctions from C. Prophet; 

Attendance to correspondence and enclosures from C. Prophet; 
attcndance to further correspondence from C. Prophet ; 
uttcndance to meeting with C. Prophet; allendanee to fu rther 
meeting with C. Prophet; attendance to correspondence and 
enclosure from M. Lem; attendance to correspondence and 
enclosures to C. Prophet; attendance to phone call with C. 
Prophet; attcndance to correspondcncc and enclosure from C. 
Prophet; Further attendance to correspondence from M. Lem; 

Attendance to correspondencc and enclosure from M. Lem; 
altendance to correspondcnce from M. Lcm; Attendance to 
correspondcncc to M. Lem and C. Prophct; attendancc meeting 
with C. Prophct; attcndance to correspondence from M. Lem; 
attendance 10 correspondence from C. Prophet; attcndance to 
con ference call with various part ies; attendance to conference 
ca ll with creditors; attendance to meet ing with and instructions 
from C. Prophet; Attcnduncc to correspondencc from L. 
Chambers: fu rther attendance to correspondence from C. 
Prophet; 

Ca ll with stakeholdcrs rc status of offers: call with M. Lem in 
advance; review of his offer summary; 

Altcndance to phone call with C. Prophet; attendance to phone 
call to M. Lem; attendance to review summary of o ffers; 

Altcndance to mecting with C. Prophet; attcndance to 
confcrence call with stakeholders; aHendnnce to mceting with C. 

Te,ms: due upon ,,,,, ",pI 
inle ,est alille rale of 1.3% pe' annum w~1 be cha,ged on all amounlsnot paid within one monih I,om the dalC oIlhl5 lnvol~e 

[,rof!; and oml$.Mont excluded 
pace 20112 



gowlingc; 
August 15, 2014 

INVOICE: 18029490 

Datc Hours TiJIIl'kccpcr Descri ption 

Prophet; ll\tcndllllcc \0 further conference call with M. Lcm; 
allcndrmcc to correspondence llnd enclosure to P. Gcrttlcr; 

0 1/05/2014 1.20 Cli ff Prophet Further Fairview update call; 

02/05/2014 0.50 Frank D. Lamie Attendance to correspondence and enclosures from M. Lcm; 
allcndllncc to correspondence from C. Prophet; attendance 
fu rther to correspondence and enclosure from S. M ilra; 

05/05120 14 0.30 Glen F. Jennings 

05/05/2014 0 .90 Frank D. L1mic Attendance to mccting with C. Prophet; ullcndancc to 
conference call with M. Lcm and C. I>rophct; attendance to 
further correspondence from M. Lcm; Attendance further to 
meeting with C. Prophet; allcndancc further 10 correspondence 
to M. Lcm; 

05 /05/20 14 0.40 Frunk D. Lamie Attcndance to correspondence and enclosure from M. Lem; 
attendance to furthe r correspondence and cnclosure from M. 
Lcm; attend3l1Ce to meeting wilh and instructions from C. 
Prophet; 

05/0512014 1.30 Cli ff Prophet Review ofagrcetllcnts of purchase and sale o ffered; call with M. 
Le m re next sleps; call re cnvironmcntal matters; 

05/05/20 14 0.50 Jordan M. Smith 

06/051201 4 1.30 Frank D. Lamie Attendance to correspondence fro m M. Lem and J. Jensen; 
attcndanee to mceting with C. Prophct; attendancc to 
corrcspondcnce to M. Lem; attendance to correspondence to P. 
Gerltler, S. Mitra, D. lobi , and M. Lcm; Attendance to 
correspondencc from S. Mitra; attendance to corrcspondcnce 
from P. Gertler; fu rther attendance to correspondence from D. 
LobI; further attendHncc to correspondence and enclosure from 
M. Lem; 

06/05/2014 0.20 Cli fT Prophet _ _ . . .......... _ .. .. . . . .... _ • ." "" "" J , 

07/0512014 3.90 Frank D. Ulmic Altendance 10 corrcspondenee to P. Gert ler, S. Mitra, D. LobI, 
and L. Chambers; altendanee to review correspondence and 
enclosure from M. Lem; Attcndance to correspondence and 
enclosure from M. Lcm; attendance to fu rther correspondence 
and enclosure from M. Lcm; attendance to further 
correspondence and enclosure from M. Lcm; attendance to 
meeting with M. Lem and C. Prophet; Attendance to meeting 
with C. Prophet; auendnnce 10 correspondence from C. Prophet; 
Atlendance to review file; attendance to correspondence to C. 
Prophet; Allcndance to correspondence fro m M. Chau ; 
attendance to correspondence frOm M. Lcm; 

07/05 /20 14 1.20 Cli ff Prophet ow 

08/05/2014 0.30 Frank I). L1Jllie Attendance 10 call with M. Lern; Attendance to correspondence 

Ter"'~ due upon ret"pt 
Interest at tile ,ate 011.3% pe, " .... ", ..... ~t be charge" on atl llmo .. nls not pa'" wtthln one month I,om tM date 01 Ihls invoice 

EIfOt$ nnd emissions excluded 
pagll 3 01 1.2 



gowlings 

Dale I-lours 

08/05120 14 0.20 

08/05/201 4 0.60 

09105/2014 1. 20 

12/05/2014 1.10 

[2105120 [4 0.70 

13105120 [4 0040 

13105/20 [4 4.30 

13/05120 14 3.30 

14/05120 14 0. 30 

14/05/2014 0.20 

15105120 14 5.10 

15/05120 14 3.60 

Timekeeper 

Frank D. Lamie 

C li ff Prophet 

Cliff Prophet 

Frank D. L'lmic 

ClifT Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Cliff Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. L;unic 

Cl ifTProphcl 

Description 

August 15,2014 
INVO ICE: 18029490 

from M. Lcm; attendance 10 further correspondence from M. 
Lem; 

Altcndancc to correspondence from C. Prophet; attendance to 
further correspondence from M. Lcm; 

Review of Tcndcrcarc ovver; 

Call with M. Orr of MO I-I LTC re transfer approvals; 

Conference call ; call with M. Lcm; call with C. Prophet; 
correspondence 10 parties; attendance to c:11I with D. LobI; 
attendance to further correspondence to the part ies; allendance 
to correspondence frOIll P. Gertler; Attendance to 
correspondence from M. Lem; attendance to call with M. Lem; 
attcndancc to review correspondence :md enclosures from M. 
Lem; attendance to convene confcrence call ; 

Call from M. Lelll and update; 

Attendance to cOITcspondence and enclosure from M. Lem; 
attendance to various correspondence from C. Prophet and M. 
Lem: Attendance to meeting wi th C. Prophet; 

Attendance to correspondence and enclosure from M. Lcm; 
attendance to furthcr correspondence and enclosure from M. 
Lcm; attendance to correspondence from C. Prophet; al1endance 
to further correspondence and enclosure from M. Lem; 
attendance to further correspondence from C. Prophet; 
attendance to further correspondence and enclosure from M. 
Lem: attendance to further correspondCllcc and enclosure from 
M. Lelll; allendance to various correspondence from S. Mitra, D. 
LobI. P. Gertler; attendance to correspondence to stakeholder 
group; al1endance to eorrespondencc from E. Pctes; attendancc 
to correspondence frOIll M. Lem; 

Attendance to correspondence with M. Lcm and C. Prophet; 
attendance 10 further correspondence with M. Lem and C. 
Prophet; 

Attendance to correspondence from M. Lem; attendance to 
correspondence from C. Prophet; 

Attendance 10 phone call with M. Letn; attendance 10 meeting 
with, update to, and instructions from C. Prophet ; attendance to 
correspondence to M. Lem; attendance to further phone call with 
M. Lcm; attcndance to correspondence to C. Prophet and M. 
Lem; attendance to review A PS; attendance meeting with C. 
Prophct; attendance to blackl ine; attendance to meeting with M. 
Lcm and C. Prophel; allendanec to mecting with potential 
purchaser; allendancc \0 mccting with C. Prophet and M. Leil1; 
attendance to con ference call with stakeholders; attendance \0 
phone call with M. Lem; 

Terms: due ~poo receipt 
lotmoS! at the rnte 011.3% per norwm witt be Charged on al t amourll' not paid wltl>in OfIO month I~m tho date of this in.oIce 

EtrolS arid omissions e.ctuded 
page. 01 1.2 



gowlings 

Date "lo urs Timekeeper 

16/05/20 14 2.10 Frank D. Lamie 

16/05120 14 0.60 Cliff Prophet 

1910512014 0.10 Frank D. Lamie 

2010512014 5.30 Frank D. Lmnic 

2010512014 3.20 Cliff Prophet 

21 /05 /2014 0.10 Fmnk D. Lamie 

2210512014 0.10 Fmnk D. Lamie 

22105120 14 0.20 Frank D. Lamie 

23/05/2014 2.20 Frank D. Lamie 

23 /05/2014 0.60 ClifT Prophcl 

24/05/2014 0.10 Frank D. Lamie 

2510512014 0. 10 Frank D. Lamie 

26/0512014 4. 10 Fmnk D. Lamie 

Description 

August 15, 20 14 
INVOICE: 18029490 

Attendance \0 correspondence and enclosure from D. Gray; 
nttcnduncc to correspondence from M. Lern; attendance to 
correspondence to M. Lcm; attendance to correspondence from 
C. Prophet; attendance 10 detailed correspondence from M. Lcm; 
attendance to further correspondence and enclosure from M. 
Lcm; 

Calls with M. Lcm ,HId with counsel 10 GEM re offer 10 
purchase licences; 

Aucndance to correspondcnce from M. Lcm; auendance to 
v.uious correspondencc from M. Lem and C. Prophet; 

AUendmlcc to mecting with C. Prophet; attcndance to 
instnlctions to F. Sasso; mcetings with M. Lcm and C. Prophet; 
meeting with GEM; mceting with LH IN Toronto Central; 
meeting with M. Lcm and C. Prophet; mecting with C. Prophct; 
correspondence to M. Lem; ca ll with M. Lcm; ca ll with P. 
Ozyetis; attendance to meeting with and update to C. Prophet; 
attendance to correspondcnce to M. Lcm and C. Prophet; furthc r 
attcndancc to ca ll with M. Lcm; 

Mectings with sol icitors for GEM; mecting with Toronto Central 
LH IN; 

Attcndance 10 corrcspondcnce from G. Bone: 

Attendance to voice mail from M. Lem; 

Attcndance 10 conferencc call with M. Lem; attendance to 
further phone call with M. Lem; 

Conference call with M. Lem and C. Prophet; attcndance to 
meeting with and instructions from C. Prophet; attendance to 
correspondencc 10 stakeholdcrs; attendance to meeting with and 
instmctiolls to R. Conway; Attendance to correspondcncc 10 M. 
Orr; Attendance to correspondence from D. LobI; attcndance to 
call to D. LobI; allcndancc to further correspondence with D. 
LobI; aucndullce 10 correspondence with M. Lcm; furlher 
attendance to correspondencc with M. Orr; 

Calls re Schlegal offer and structure; 

Attendance to correspondence from N. Singer; 

Attendance 10 correspondence from M. Lcm and R. Schlegal; 

Attendance to detailed correspondence from M. Lcm; attendance 
10 correspondence with M. Orr; attendance to correspondence 
with M. Lem; alle ndancc to correspondence from S. Mitra; 
Attendance to correspondence to GEM healthcarc and its 
counsel; AHendance 10 call wilh M. Lem; attendance to further 
call with M. LCI11; Attendance to call with M. Orr of MOH; 
Attendance to correspondencc to M. Lem and C. Prophet; 
nltcntlanee 10 cal l with M. Lem; Attendance 10 call with M. 
Lcm; attendance to rurther call wilh M .Lem; attendance to 

Te,m., due upon ,eco:ipl 
Inlc'esl ot tile ,ale of 1.3% per ann .. m will be d"'f~d (N\ alt amo .. nts not paid wilhln one monlh h om Ihe dale of Ihls Invoice 

EffOI'$ nnd emiMlons C.1c1uded 
page 5 ot 12 



gowlings 

Date Hours Timekeeper 

27105120 14 0.80 Frank D. Lamie 

27105120 14 0.90 Frank D. Lamie 

27/05120 14 0.40 Cliff Prophet 

28/05 /20 14 1.70 Frank D. Lamie 

28/0512014 0.80 Cli ff Proph el 

29/05/20 14 0. 10 Frank O. Lamie 

29/05 /2014 1.30 Frank D. L.-un ie 

30/05/2014 0. 10 Frank O. Lamie 

02/0612014 1.90 Frank D. Lamie 

Description 

August 15,20 14 
INVO ICE: 18029490 

correspondence to stakeholders ; Attendance to correspo ndence 
from N. Singer; Allcndancc to correspondence from N. Singer; 
attendance 10 voice mail from M. Lcm; attendance to call with 
M. Lcm; attendance \0 correspondence to M. Lcm; attendance to 
correspondence to J. Jensen; attendance to call with C. Prophet; 
Attendance to correspondence and enclosure from J. Jensen; 
atlcndancc to correspondence 10 J . Jensen; attendance to further 
correspondence from J. Jensen; Attendance to correspondence 
from L. Chambers; Attendance to correspondence and enclosure 
from J. Jensen; attendance 10 fu rther correspondence fro m J. 
Jensen; attcndanec 10 correspondence from H . Manis; 

Attendance to meeting with C. Prophet; allendance to 
conference call with M. Orr; atlendancc to correspondence and 
update 10 M. Lem; allendanee to conference call with M. Lem; 

Auendance to update to C. Prophet; allcndance to 
correspondence from P. Geterler; attendance to correspondence 
from S. Mitra; al1cndance to correspondence to all stakeholders; 
attendancc 10 updale 10 C. Prophet; attendance to furt her 
correspondence from P. Gert ler; attendance to correspondence to 
P. Gertler; attendance to voice 11111il fro m M. Lem; 

Ca ll with stakeholders; inslmctions 10 F. Lamie; 

Attendance to conference call with M. Lem and C. Prophet; 
1I11cndance 10 conference call with Stakeholders; attendance to 
ca ll with M. Lem; attendance to correspondence and enclosures 
from J . Jensen; attendance to cal l with M. Orr; attendance 10 
correspondence to M. Lern and C. Prophet; Altendance to 
correspondence from J. Jensen; Attcndance 10 voice mail from 
M. Lcm; attendance 10 voice mal from D. LobI; attendance to 
call wilh M. Lcm; 

Review of corrcspondencc re GAAD Pharmacy offer; call with 
M. Orr of Ministry; 

Attendance to correspondence and enclosure from H. Manis; 

Attendance to voice 1ll.:1i l from M . Lem; attcndance to 
conference call with M. Lcm; attendance to call to D. lobi; 
attendance 10 conference call with D. Lobi; Attendance to 
correspondence fro m J. Jensen; ultCEldance to correspondence 
and enclosure fro m J. Jenseon;Attendance 10 further 
correspondence and enelosurcs frOIll J. Jcnsen; Auendunce to 
correspondencc to N. Singer; Attendance to correspondence and 
enclosure from J. Jensen; Attendance to voice mail from M. 
Lcm; attendance to con fe rence cu ll wilh M. Lcm; 

Attendance to correspondence and update from N. Singer; 

Attendance 10 conference call with M. Lem; attcndance to call to 
M. Orr; attendance to correspondence to M. Orr; Attendance to 
meeling with C. Prophel; Altendance to review correspondence, 
enclosure, and link from M . Orr; attendance to correspondence 
10 M. Orr; Attendance 10 conference call with M. Lem; 

r",m$: d~o upon leecipt 
Inte,n t at tile ,atoof 1.3% pel a nnum .. ~, be cllafged on all amounts not paid within one montll lrom tile date 01 this invoice 

page6ol12 



gowlings 

Date Hou rs 

03/06/2014 3.90 

04 /06/201 4 0.20 

05 /06/2014 0.80 

06/0612014 2.50 

09106/2014 0. 10 

10/06/2014 0.60 

10/06/2014 0.50 

1210612014 0.40 

13/06/2014 0.20 

14/06/2014 0.30 

16/06/20 14 0.80 

17/06/20[4 0.50 

18/0612014 1.1 0 

19/06/20 14 2.50 

Timekeeper 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank O. L<llIlic 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. L'unic 

Frank D. Lamie 

Fmnk D. Lunic 

ClifT Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. Lmnic 

Frank O. Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank I), Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Desc ription 

August IS, 2014 
INVOICE: 18029490 

Attendance to correspondence rrom M. Lcm and J. Schlegal; 

Attendance to conference call with M Lem; attendance 10 draft 
leiter to MOH and Financial Management Branch; Attendance 
10 phone call with M. Lem; Attendance to review material ; 
attendance \0 dmft Ictter to K. S impso n and M. Orr; attendancc 
10 corrcspondcncc and enclosure to M. Lc m; Attendance to 
correspondence from P. Ozyetis; attendance to correspondcnce 
to P. Ozyetis: Attendance 10 delailed correspondence from M. 

Orr; attendance to correspondence to M. Lem; Attendance to 
voice mail from M. Lcm; attendance to phone caU with M. Lern; 
attendance to phone can with M. Lel11; attendance to call to M. 
Orr; lIItendance to further call wilh M . Lcm; 

Attendance to correspondence fro m J. Jensen; 

Attendance 10 mccl ing with C. Prophet; attendance 10 
conference call with M .Lem; Alle ndance to voice mail from M. 
Lem; attendance 10 phonc call wilh M Lem; 

Attendance to conference can with M. Lem; Attendance to 
correspondence and enclosure from M. Lcm; Attendance to 
correspondence and enclosure from M. Lcm; attendance to 
correspondcncc from K. Simpson; 

Attcndance to correspondence from M. Le m; 

Attendance to mccting with ,md updatc to C. Prophet; 
Attendance to call with and instructions from M. Lem; 
attendance 10 call to M. Orr; attendance to eOiTespondence to M. 
Lem; Attendance 10 voice mail from M. Orr; attendance to 
corrcspondence to M. Lcm and C. Prophet; 

Review of dealings with MOH LTC; advice re same; instructions 
to F. Lamie; 

Attendance to correspondence from M. Orr; attendance to 
review material; Attendance to correspondence to M . leI)) and 
C. Prophet; al1endancc 10 correspondence wilh M. Lem; 
altendance to correspondence to M. Orr; 

Attcnd,mce to correspondencc from M. Lcm; attendance to 
correspondence and enclosure from P. Ozyetis; attendance 10 

correspondence to P. Ozyctis; 

Attcndance to review detailed correspondence and enclosure 
from M. Lem; 

Attendance to review correspondenec from M. Lcrn; attendance 
to meeling with C. Prophet; attendance to review 
correspondence and detailed cnclosure from M. Lcm; 

Ancndance to meeting with and instnlctions from C. Prophet; 
Attendancc 10 meeting with M. Lean; 

Attendance to rcvicw Collective Agrcements. Employee 
Contracts and Agreement of Purchase and Sale: 

Attendance to review Agreement of Purchuse and Sale; 

Te,ms: due uPO" ,ec ~lpt 

Inte'e$1 111 th e ,ale of 1..3% per lInn"m will be chargd on all amounts not paid within one month from the date 01 this Invoice 

[ucos ami omis!lloM exeluded 
page 701 12 



gowlings 

Date Hours 

20/06/2014 I .40 

20/06120 14 0.70 

21106120 14 0.10 

23/06/2014 1.70 

23/06/2014 

24/0612014 

24/06120 14 

24/0612014 

24/0612014 

26/06/20 14 

27/06120)4 

27/06/20 14 

02/07/20 14 

03/07/2014 

0.90 

0.10 

0.30 

0.1 0 

0.30 

0.10 

2. 10 

0.10 

1.30 

4.00 

Timekeeper 

Frank D. Lmnic 

Cliff Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Cli rr Prophet 

Syl1 Kushner 

Frank O. Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Carn B. Sklar 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Frank D. Lamie 

Cliff Prophet 

Frank D. L.1Jl1ic 

Descriptiun 

August 15.201 4 
INVOICE: 18029490 

aucndancc \0 comments to C. Prophet; attendance to meeting 
with C. Prophet: attendance to voiccmail from M. Lcm; 
attendance \0 phone call with and further comments from M. 
Lcm; tlttcndancc to further material to C. Prophet; attendance to 
phone call with C. Prophet; attendance to phone call to M. Lcm; 

T9967JO (BOO - Fai rview Nursing Home) Ancndanee to 
mccting with and cOlruncnts rrom C. Prophct; attendance to 
revisc APS; attcndance to correspondence and enclosurc to M. 
Lema and C. Prophet; attcndanee to voiccmai l from M. Lem; 
attendance 10 call to M. Lem: attendanec to meeting with and 
fu rther material to C. Prophet; attendance to corrcspondcnce and 
cnclosure from S. Mitra ; al\endance to correspondence to M. 
Lem; attendance to corrcspondencc and cnclosure from S. Mitra; 

Rcview amendcd Schlcgel AP$ and comment on same; 

T9967 10 (BDO - Fairvicw Nursing Home Limitcd) - Attendance 
to mceting with C. Prophct; 

Attendancc to correspondencc from M. Lem; attendance to 
voicema il rrom M. Lem; attendance to meeting with C. Prophet; 
allendance to instructions to F. Sasso; Attendance to conference 
call with M. Lem and C. Prophet; attendance to review and 
revise APS; attendance to correspondence and enc losures 10 M. 
Lem and C. Prophet: 

Review and comment on Schlegel APA; instructions to F. 
Lamie; 

Correspondence wilh F. Lamie and C. Sklar re: VTS Mortgage; 

Attendance to correspondence and enclosure from M. Lem; 
allendance to correspondence to M. Dorofshyr; attendancc to 
correspondcncc to C. Sklar; allendance to ca ll wilh S. Kusher; 

Allendance to detailed correspondence from M. Lem; 

Engaged in correspondcnce with F. Lamie re precedent VTS 
mortgage; office attendance with S. Kushner re same; 

Attendance to correspondence from M. Lem; attendance to 
further correspondence from M. Lcm and C. Prophet; 

Attcndance 10 phone call with and instructions from M. Lem; 
attendance to review material; altendance to correspondence and 
enclosures to M. Lem; attendance to draft VTB mortgage 
additiona l provisions; attendance to various revisions 10 VTB 
mortgage additional provisions; allendance to correspondence 
and various enclosures to M. Lcm; attendance 10 phone call with 
M. Lcm: 

Attendance to to correspondence from N. Singer; attendance to 
correspondence from J. Jenscn; 

InslrucilOns fo r preparat ion of APS changes fo r Schlegel; 

Attendance to phone call with C. Prophet: attendance to 
conference call with J. Schlegal, R. Schlegal, D. Schmidt, M. 

Terms: due upon 'l!'C~pt 
Inle rest 81 llIe ,,,Ie 01 1.:ni. per annum will bech~,ged on all amounts not paid wilhin one month hom Iho dale of Ihls in,oleo 

E,,., ... and omissions e""lu_ 
page 8of12 



gowlings 

Date Hours 

03f07/2014 1.70 

04/0712014 0. 10 

07/07/2014 2.60 

08107120 14 3.10 

09/07/2014 2.[0 

09/07/20 14 0.60 

10/07/20 14 0.70 

10/0712014 4.40 

11 /07/2014 0.10 

14/0712014 0.90 

1510712014 5.40 

1610712014 3.10 

17/07 /20 14 ).00 

Timekeeper 

ClilTProphcl 

Frank O. Lamie 

Frank O. Lamie 

Frank D. Lam ie 

Frank D. Lamie 

e li IT Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Cliff Prophet 

Frank D. Lamie 

Cl iff Prophet 

Cliff Prophet 

Cliff Prophcl 

Cliff Prophet 

Description 

August 15,2014 
INVO ICE: 18029490 

Lcm and C. Prophet; allcndancc 10 conference call with M. Lelll 
and C. Prophet; attendance to meeting with and instructions 
from C. Prophel; Attendance to correspondence from C. 
Prophet; attendance to fu rther correspondence from M. Lern and 
C. Prophet; attendance to further meeting wi th and instructions 
from C. Prophet: Attenuanee to further meeting with and 
commcnts from C. Prophet: Attendance to further material and 
infomlation from C. Prophet; attendance to review and revise 
aud itional VTB provisions: attendance to instructions to F. 
Sasso; attendance 10 material and instructions to N. Ga luzzo; 
Allenuance to phone call with N. Galluzzo; attendance to 
correspondence to N. Gallu7J.o; attendance to furt her phone call 
and instructions to N. Galluzzo; attendance to correspondence 
from N. Galluzzo; attendance to meeting with and material from 
N. Galluzzo; 

Furthcr review and instnlctions on Schlegel transaction; 

Attendance to meeting with N. Galluzzo; 

Attendance to conference call with C. Prophet; attendance to 
revise agrecmelll ofpurehasc and sale; 

Attendance to review comments Oil agreement o f purchase and 
sale; allendance to review and revise agreement of purchase and 
sale; 

Attendance to review and revise agreement of purchase and sale; 
attendance to correspondence and instructions to F. Sasso; 
attendance 10 correspondcnce with C. Prophct; attcndancc to 
corrcspondence and enclosure from C. Prophet: lltlendance to 
review blackline; allendance to various correspondence and 
enclosures to C. Prophet; allendance to various correspondence 
with C. Prophet; 

Call with M. Lem re Sehclgcl; 

Attendance to material to C. prophet: attendance to meeting with 
and 111aterialto C. prophet; Attcndance to correspondencc and 
enclosures from C. Prophet; attcndance to correspondence and 
enclosure from M. Lem; attendance to further correspondence 
and enclosure from C. Prophet; allendance to correspondence 
from C. Prophet; attendance to correspondcnee and enclosures 
from M. Lcm; 

Review and rcvise AP$ to incorporate set off rights and other 
changcs requestcd by Schlegel; 

AHelldanee to correspondence from S. Mitra; 

Dealings with counsel to Schlegel as purchaser; 

Review mark-up draft of APS from Sch legel purchaser; 

Review, respond and ncgotiate APS teoos with counsel for 
Schlegel purchaser; 

Further negotiations with purchaser and others. inc luding 

Term., due UPorl ,eceipt 
tnt ",est ~It"e .ale of 1-3" Pet ann"m will be cllafged on a ll amounts not paid within one mont" ',om lho dalo 01 1""lnvoke 

pace90112 



gowlin~ 

Date Hours 

18/0712014 3.50 

21/07120 14 3.90 

22/07120 14 1.70 

30107/201 4 1.00 

04/08/20 14 0.60 

05/08 /20 14 0.30 

06/08120 14 0.80 

T imekeeper 

Cli fT Prophet 

Cliff Prophet 

Cl iff Prophet 

Rob Sa li sbury 

Allen V Craig 

Allen V Cra ig 

Allen V Craig 

Desc ription 

Fai rv iew's counsel: 

August 15,20 14 
INVO ICE: 18029490 

Negotiating and working on APS with Schlegel; multiple calls 
and c-mai ls with purchaser counsel; reporting 10 c lient; drafting; 
discussion with P. Gert ler; 

Further negotiations with purchaser and counsel; discussion with 
P. Gert ler on a range of isslIes, including dealing with MOH cut­
ofTpcriodclaims; repon ing to M. u:m; draft ing APS revisions; 

Fina lizing APS; fi.lrlher negotiations with counsel 10 purchaser; 

"" . 

Fees for Professional Services 

Adjustment 

S90,088.00 

$( 1 0,000.00) 

$80,088.00 T ota l Fees for Professional Services 

DISBURSEM ENT S 

T axable Costs 

Scanning Service 

TeraV iew (Onlario) Online Searches & Registra tion - Taxable 

Medica l Records and Doctors Reports 

Conference Call Expenses 

15/05/20 14 Taxis & Car Renwl - Local Travel 
VENDOR: Prophct, Cliff INVOICE#: 0595344707142003 DAT E: 
0711 4/2 014 
Prophet, Cli ff, Travel wilh client M. Lc m and F. L'lmic (Gowlings) 
to mceting at Ontario Ministry of Hea lth and Long Tcnn Carc. 
05/ 15/ 14 

Terms: du .. upon .eceipt 
Intc.est 811h ... aICO! 1-3% pc. ann~m w~1 be charged on all amo""ts no l paid within one monlh h om the dal .. 01 \h15 In. olce 

Efl'ors and omls..ioM ".eluded 

$23.25 

$20.00 

S34 .20 

$40.0 1 

$ 13.27 

pate 10 01 12 



gowlings 

Tol'lll Tlu:able Dislmrscmcnts 

Terms: due upcn ,e.:e;pt 

August 15,2014 
INVOICE: 18029490 

$130.73 

Interest at tile ''''e o' 1.3% pc. 8nnum wi. becharged 0" "II amountS nol paid ";\111 .. one monlh hom th e dale 01\h15 in.oleo 

page 11 of 12 



gowlingc; 
August 15,2014 

INVOICE: 18029490 

Remittance Copy 

Client: 189570 BOO Cllllllda Limited 
T996710 Matter: 

RE: 
Amount Due: 

Receivership of Fairview Nursing Home Limited 
$90,647. 16 

Ph YMENT BY cm~QU[: 

Please return this page with your pllymcnt lIaya ble 10 Gowlin g Lafleur Henderson LLP 

Remit 10: 

PA YM ENT BY WIR E TRANSFER: 

Pay by Swift MT 103 I)ircct to: 
SlVlFrCODE: 

BENEFICIAR Y BANK: 

TRANSIT NUMBER: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAME: 

Gowling Lafleur Henderson LLP 
PO Box 466, STN D 
Ottawa, ON KI P 1 C3 
Canada 

CIBCCATT 

Canadian J mperial Bank of Commerce 
119 Sparks Street, Ottawa, ON Kl P 585 

0010-00006 

Gowling Lafleur Henderson LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600, Ottawa ,ON KI P le3 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): CDN Account: 41-029 16 
USD Account: 02-2[015 

International payments intermediary banking inrormation: 
USD WELLS FARGO BANK. N.A. PNBPUS3NNYC (ABA 026005092) 

• if paying by wiro: or EFT pleflse e-mail theremiltance details[opflymcn[s@gowlings.com 

Te<m$: due upon receipt 
Inl ... , .... 1 allh ... ,al ... o' 1.3" p ... , annum wnl be cha rged on 1111 amcunlS nol pllid wlth[n one month rrom th ... date or this Invoke 

papUolU 
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