CERTIFIEDE . tohea tom_.

by the Court Clerk as a true copy of
the document digitally filed on Dec
11,2025

COURT FILE NUMBER 2501-18254

COURT COURT OF KING’S BENCH OF /2

IN THE MATTER OF THE INTY}
OF REGENT AIRCRAFT SER

JUDICIAL CENTRE CALGARY
PLAINTIFF ATB FINANCIAL
DEFENDANT REGENT AIRCRAFT SERVICES INC., 1840648

ALBERTA LTD., 2490506 ALBERTA LTD. and
STEVEN JAMES FRANCES GRATTO also known as
STEVEN GRATTO

DOCUMENT INTERIM RECEIVERSHIP EXTENSION ORDER
ADDRESS FOR SERVICE AND CONTACT Dentons Canada LLP

INFORMATION OF PARTY FILING THIS Bankers Court

DOCUMENT 15th Floor, 850 — 2nd Street S.W.

Calgary, Alberta T2P OR8
Attention: John Regush
Ph. (403) 268-7086

File No.:141950-310

DATE ON WHICH ORDER WAS PRONOUNCED: December 10, 2025
LOCATION WHERE ORDER WAS PRONOUNCED: Calgary, Alberta

NAME OF JUSTICE WHO MADE THIS ORDER: The Honourable Justice Simard

UPON the application of ATB Financial (the “Lender”) in respect of Regent Aircraft Services Inc.
(the “Debtor”); AND UPON having read the Application, the Affidavits of Bhaskar Kakkar sworn
November 12, 2025 and December 4, 2025, and First Report of BDO Canada Limited as interim receiver
(“Interim Receiver”) of the Debtor (the “Interim Receiver’s First Report”); AND UPON having read the
Order of the Honourable Justice Bourque pronounced November 14, 2025 in this Action and filed on
November 21, 2025 (the “Interim Receivership Order”); AND UPON reading or hearing reference to the
Affidavit of Service of Terry Trojanoski, sworn and filed December 9, 2025; AND UPON hearing counsel for
the Lender, the Interim Receiver, and counsel for any other interested parties present,

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED AND DECLARED THAT:

90871660\V-1


ikowalcze
Text Box



ikowalcze
Text Box
Terry Trojanoski, sworn and filed December 9, 2025;



SERVICE

1. The time for service of the notice of application for this order is hereby abridged and deemed
good and sufficient and this application is properly returnable today.

APPROVAL OF ACTIVITIES

2. The Interim Receiver’s activities and proposed activities as set out in the Interim Receiver’s First
Report are hereby ratified and approved.

AMENDMENTS TO INTERIM RECEIVERSHIP ORDER

3. Paragraph 3(c) of the Interim Receivership Order is amended by deleting “December 15, 2025”
and inserting in its place “February 2, 2026".

4, Paragraph 18 of the Interim Receivership Order is amended by deleting “$100,000” and inserting
in its place “$200,000".

5. Paragraph 21 of the Interim Receivership Order is amended by deleting “$100,000” and inserting
in its place “$250,000".

AUTHORIZATION TO USE RBC FUNDS

6. The Interim Receiver is authorized to use funds of the Debtor held at bank accounts with Royal
Bank of Canada to pay for expenditures necessary or incidental to the Interim Receiver’s exercise
of the powers provided for in the Interim Receivership Order, as amended hereby.

DECLARATION CONCERNING STEVE GRATTO

7. Without limiting the Interim Receivership Order in any way, this Honourable Court declares that
Steven James Frances Gratto also known as Steven Gratto, is a Person for the purposes of
paragraphs 6, 7, and 8 of the Interim Receivership Order, as amended hereby, and must
therefore co-operate and comply with any requests for information, documentation, or co-
operation from the Receiver.

e

Justice of the Court of King’s Bench of Alberta

Consented to this 91" day of December, 2025 by Borden Ladner Gervais, LLP, counsel for Regent
Aircraft Services Inc., 1840648 Alberta Ltd., and 2490506 Alberta Ltd.

Per: W

ké{/in é’érr/Savy Gosse




Consented to this 9t day of December, 2025 by Borden Ladner Gervais, LLP, counsel for Steven James
Frances Gratto for the purposes of this application only.

i

Ke’\\/{r; éM/Savy Gosse





