Cerrato, Gary

From: Cerrato, Gary

Sent: Friday, September 03, 2010 9:54 AM
To: ‘Danny Nunes'

Subject: Andres Email

From: Davidson, Blair

Sent: Wednesday, August 25, 2010 4:11 PM

To: 'jblake@mcleankerr.com’; Cerrato, Gary; 'rja0418@gmail.com’
Subject: Re: Update -- Harmoney

Mr. Andres, thank you for the email last Friday. Can you clarify a few matters ? What are the details of this investment
made by Winsome on behalf of the Harmoney Club investors ? Who is the borrower ? Is it a secured loan , equity or
something else ? What event has occurred that the funds may soon be returning to Winsome Trust ? Do you have any
documentation supporting the investment such as credit files with financial statements, risk analysis etc ?

We are preparing a report to the Supreme Court for a Sept 13 court date (our report has to be file by Sept 6). We would
appreciate obtaining this information so we can report on the recovery of the Winsome investment to the Court and the
investors, thanks Blair Davidson

Sent using BlackBerry

From: Blake, Jim <jblake@mcleankerr.com>
To: Bavidson, Blair; Cerrato, Gary

Sent: Fri Aug 20 12:14:54 2010

Subject: FW: Update -- Harmoney

Herewith report from Robert Andres.
Jim

H.J. Biake, Q.C.

MclLean & Kerr LLP

130 Adelaide Street West, Suite 2800
Toronto, Ontario

MsH 3P5

Tel: 416 369 6629
Fax: 416 366 8571
Email: jblake@mcleankerr.com

This message is privileged, confidential and only intended for the recipient addressed.

From: Robert Andres [mailto:rja0418@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, August 20, 2010 11:02 AM

To: Blake, Jim

Subject: Update

Jim Blake, Attorney -

As a foltow-up to our telecon of yesterday Afternoon, please find out certain information pertinent to Health and
Harmoney, and Funds to/from Winsome investment Trust:



Net amount of Principal: $1,133,235 - identified as follows:

IN ouT

HEALTH & HARMONEY

03/20/08 $269,985.00  Health & Harmoney ~ —--mee NEW
04/02/08 $366,985.00  Health & Harmoney ~ eeeeeenee NEW
04/04/08 $ 27,325.00 Health & Harmoney - NEW
04/18/08 $264,985.00  Health & Harmoney  —emeeeeeen NEW
04/29/08 $ 92,985.00 Health & Harmoney e NEW
05/14/08 $169,985.00  Health & Harmoney ~ seeeemeeen NEW
05/16/08 $ 52,985.00  Health&Harmoney e NEW
og/15/08 - Health & Harmoney $ 112,000.00 Dist

[JPMX #0343086/0068067]

As previously discussed with you, Funds were initially to be repaid from Licensing Rights derived from contracts in the
Pacific Rim area, related to environmental clean-up.

Those contracts had been delayed primarily due to the underlying Companies being taken Public.

Through the efforts of Others (including an Attorney, an Escrow Party, and Loan Arrangements), the Trust’s intention is
to have Loan Funds made available prior to the release of Funds from the Licensing Rights.

The initial payment would be Principal (net} of $1,133,235. The availability for distribution of said Principal will be the
date that Funds are received from the Escrow Party.

The Escrow Party is expected to travel into the USA on or about Thursday, August 26, 2010. His exact travel date is
dependent on his completion of an unrelated Business matter that should be completed on or about said Date.

t will inform you immediately after the specific travel Date/Time is made known to me and/or verified.

As soon after the aforesaid Principal has been made available and paid (but not sooner than 14 days aofter said

Payment), it is the Trust’s intention to make available the payment of Profits (in an amount equal to 100% of Principal)
to Health & Harmoney.

Whenever the aforesaid Licensing Rights are made available, computations would be made as to availability and
payment of additional amounts,

I will update you as promptly as possible after my receipt of pertinent and related information, including travel
Date/Time.

Rohert J. Andres



